
DESCRIPTION UOM

EST. 
ANNUAL 

QUANTITY
COST 

PER UOM TOTAL
COST 

PER UOM TOTAL
COST PER 

UOM TOTAL
COST 

PER UOM TOTAL
LABOR RATES
1.  Industrial Hygienist HOUR 650 55.00$     35,750.00$     50.00$     32,500.00$     50.00$      32,500.00$     55.00$      35,750.00$     
2.  Certified Industrial 
Hygienist HOUR 162 75.00$     12,150.00$     85.00$     13,770.00$     80.00$      12,960.00$     105.00$    17,010.00$     

3.  Technical Coordinator HOUR 88 32.50$     2,860.00$       50.00$     4,400.00$       60.00$      5,280.00$       18.00$      1,584.00$       
4.  Lead Inspector HOUR 2 75.00$     150.00$          55.00$     110.00$          95.00$      190.00$          45.00$      90.00$            
5.  Project Manager HOUR 7 60.00$     420.00$          55.00$     385.00$          100.00$    700.00$          75.00$      525.00$          
6.  Admin-Word 
Processor HOUR 150 23.00$     3,450.00$       30.00$     4,500.00$       35.00$      5,250.00$       15.00$      2,250.00$       
7.  Accredited Asbestos 
Surveyor HOUR 10 75.00$     750.00$          55.00$     550.00$          85.00$      850.00$          42.00$      420.00$          
8.  Licensed Asbestos 
Consultant Review HOUR 15 75.00$     1,125.00$       65.00$     975.00$          95.00$      1,425.00$       105.00$    1,575.00$       
8.A  Field Analysis for 
Technician and XRF 
Device for lead Paint 
Sampling HOUR 2 75.00$     150.00$          60.00$     120.00$          125.00$    250.00$          75.00$      150.00$          

TOTAL 
COST FOR 

LABOR: 56,805.00$     

TOTAL 
COST FOR 

LABOR: 57,310.00$     

TOTAL 
COST FOR 

LABOR: 59,405.00$     

TOTAL 
COST FOR 

LABOR: 59,354.00$     
LAB TESTS
9.  Airborne Sampling for 
Asbestos by PCM 
Samples on site EACH 40 10.00$     400.00$          $0.00 $0.00 10.00$      400.00$          12.00$      480.00$          
10.  Bulk Sampling for 
Asbestos by PLM 
Samples on site EACH 437 3.00$       1,311.00$       15.00$     6,555.00$       8.00$        3,496.00$       10.00$      4,370.00$       
11.  Air-O-Cell Samples EACH 138 27.00$     3,726.00$       40.00$     5,520.00$       45.00$      6,210.00$       40.00$      5,520.00$       
12.  Surface Tape 
Samples EACH 20 21.00$     420.00$          40.00$     800.00$          30.00$      600.00$          36.00$      720.00$          
13.  Indoor Air Quality 
Meter EACH 1 50.00$     50.00$            20.00$     20.00$            50.00$      50.00$            110.00$    110.00$          
14.  Fungus, Air EACH 125 33.00$     4,125.00$       40.00$     5,000.00$       45.00$      5,625.00$       55.00$      6,875.00$       
15.  Fungus, Wipe EACH 38 20.00$     760.00$          40.00$     1,520.00$       40.00$      1,520.00$       36.00$      1,368.00$       
16.  Asbestos, Wipe 
TEM EACH 24 50.00$     1,200.00$       60.00$     1,440.00$       40.00$      960.00$          115.00$    2,760.00$       
17.  Lead Paint Chip Lab 
Sampling EACH 25 6.00$       150.00$          18.00$     450.00$          20.00$      500.00$          12.00$      300.00$          
18.  Swab Sample for 
Fungus & E.coli (w/out 
fecal confirmation) EACH 7 25.00$     175.00$          50.00$     350.00$          35.00$      245.00$          65.00$      455.00$          

TOTAL 
FOR LAB 

TESTS: 12,317.00$     

TOTAL 
FOR LAB 

TESTS: 21,655.00$     

TOTAL 
FOR LAB 

TESTS: 19,606.00$     

TOTAL 
FOR LAB 

TESTS: 22,958.00$     
GRAND 
TOTAL: 69,122.00$     

GRAND 
TOTAL: 78,965.00$     

GRAND 
TOTAL: 79,011.00$     

GRAND 
TOTAL: 82,312.00$     

THE FOLLOWING ITEMS WILL NOT BE USED TO DETERMINE AWARD:
MISC. EQUIPMENT
19.  Infrared Camera PER DAY 7 250.00$   1,750.00$       20.00$     140.00$          250.00$    1,750.00$       $0.00 $0.00
20.  Rental Q Trak PER DAY 3 250.00$   750.00$          20.00$     60.00$            50.00$      150.00$          110.00$    330.00$          
UNSPECIFIED 
SERVICES/MATERIALS 15,000.00$     15,000.00$     15,000.00$     15,000.00$     
Note: SMC Systems - corrected computation error. Pure Air Control corrected computation error.

SMC SYSTEMS d/b/a 
SKYETEC

Date & Time Due:  June 2, 2009 @ 3:00pm

 PINELLAS COUNTY GOVERNMENT, FLORIDA

 Tabulation
BID #: 089-0235-B (MW)
Bid Title :  Testing Services - Indoor Air Quality

AIR QUALITY 
CONSULTING, INC.

GREENFIELD 
ENVIRONMENTAL, INC.

SILVER WOLF 
CONSULTING & 

ENGINEERING, INC.
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DESCRIPTION UOM

EST. 
ANNUAL 

QUANTITY
LABOR RATES
1.  Industrial Hygienist HOUR 650
2.  Certified Industrial 
Hygienist HOUR 162

3.  Technical Coordinator HOUR 88
4.  Lead Inspector HOUR 2
5.  Project Manager HOUR 7
6.  Admin-Word 
Processor HOUR 150
7.  Accredited Asbestos 
Surveyor HOUR 10
8.  Licensed Asbestos 
Consultant Review HOUR 15
8.A  Field Analysis for 
Technician and XRF 
Device for lead Paint 
Sampling HOUR 2

LAB TESTS
9.  Airborne Sampling for 
Asbestos by PCM 
Samples on site EACH 40
10.  Bulk Sampling for 
Asbestos by PLM 
Samples on site EACH 437
11.  Air-O-Cell Samples EACH 138
12.  Surface Tape 
Samples EACH 20
13.  Indoor Air Quality 
Meter EACH 1
14.  Fungus, Air EACH 125
15.  Fungus, Wipe EACH 38
16.  Asbestos, Wipe 
TEM EACH 24
17.  Lead Paint Chip Lab 
Sampling EACH 25
18.  Swab Sample for 
Fungus & E.coli (w/out 
fecal confirmation) EACH 7

THE FOLLOWING ITEMS WILL NOT BE USED TO 
MISC. EQUIPMENT
19.  Infrared Camera PER DAY 7
20.  Rental Q Trak PER DAY 3
UNSPECIFIED 
SERVICES/MATERIALS
Note: SMC Systems - corrected computation err

Date & Time Due:  June 2, 2009 @ 3:00pm

 PINELLAS COUNTY GOVERNMENT, FLO

 Tabulation
BID #: 089-0235-B (MW)
Bid Title :  Testing Services - Indoor Air Q

COST 
PER UOM TOTAL

COST 
PER UOM TOTAL

COST 
PER UOM TOTAL

COST 
PER UOM TOTAL

55.00$    35,750.00$    65.00$    42,250.00$  65.00$    42,250.00$  55.00$    35,750.00$  

100.00$  16,200.00$    100.00$  16,200.00$  110.00$  17,820.00$  195.00$  31,590.00$  

75.00$    6,600.00$      45.00$    3,960.00$    60.00$    5,280.00$    45.00$    3,960.00$    
50.00$    100.00$         75.00$    150.00$       55.00$    110.00$       55.00$    110.00$       
85.00$    595.00$         85.00$    595.00$       90.00$    630.00$       55.00$    385.00$       

35.00$    5,250.00$      20.00$    3,000.00$    45.00$    6,750.00$    40.00$    6,000.00$    

50.00$    500.00$         65.00$    650.00$       65.00$    650.00$       55.00$    550.00$       

100.00$  1,500.00$      120.00$  1,800.00$    100.00$  1,500.00$    125.00$  1,875.00$    

100.00$  200.00$         110.00$  220.00$       65.00$    130.00$       93.00$    186.00$       
TOTAL 

COST FOR 
LABOR: 66,695.00$    

TOTAL 
COST FOR 

LABOR: 68,825.00$  

TOTAL 
COST FOR 

LABOR: 75,120.00$  

TOTAL 
COST FOR 

LABOR: 80,406.00$  

$0.00 $0.00 6.00$      240.00$       8.00$      320.00$       10.00$    400.00$       

12.00$    5,244.00$      15.00$    6,555.00$    12.00$    5,244.00$    10.00$    4,370.00$    
50.00$    6,900.00$      46.00$    6,348.00$    40.00$    5,520.00$    35.00$    4,830.00$    

40.00$    800.00$         46.00$    920.00$       35.00$    700.00$       25.00$    500.00$       

85.00$    85.00$           40.00$    40.00$         $0.00 $0.00 100.00$  100.00$       
45.00$    5,625.00$      46.00$    5,750.00$    45.00$    5,625.00$    35.00$    4,375.00$    
45.00$    1,710.00$      46.00$    1,748.00$    40.00$    1,520.00$    25.00$    950.00$       

150.00$  3,600.00$      25.00$    600.00$       75.00$    1,800.00$    55.00$    1,320.00$    

16.00$    400.00$         11.00$    275.00$       16.00$    400.00$       10.00$    250.00$       

45.00$    315.00$         78.00$    546.00$       75.00$    525.00$       35.00$    245.00$       
TOTAL 

FOR LAB 
TESTS: 24,679.00$    

TOTAL 
FOR LAB 

TESTS: 23,022.00$  

TOTAL 
FOR LAB 

TESTS: 21,654.00$  

TOTAL 
FOR LAB 

TESTS: 17,340.00$  
GRAND 
TOTAL: 91,374.00$    

GRAND 
TOTAL: 91,847.00$  

GRAND 
TOTAL: 96,774.00$  

GRAND 
TOTAL: 97,746.00$  

350.00$  2,450.00$      125.00$  875.00$       NO BID NO BID 50.00$    350.00$       
75.00$    225.00$         110.00$  330.00$       NO BID NO BID 100.00$  300.00$       

15,000.00$    15,000.00$  15,000.00$  15,000.00$  

PROFESSIONAL 
SERVICE INDUSTRIES, 

INC.

OHC 
ENVIRONMENTAL 

ENGINEERING, INC.

BUREAU VERITAS 
NORTH AMERICA, 

INC.

ENVIROW SCIENCE & 
TECH, INC. d/b/a 

ES&T, INC.
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DESCRIPTION UOM

EST. 
ANNUAL 

QUANTITY
LABOR RATES
1.  Industrial Hygienist HOUR 650
2.  Certified Industrial 
Hygienist HOUR 162

3.  Technical Coordinator HOUR 88
4.  Lead Inspector HOUR 2
5.  Project Manager HOUR 7
6.  Admin-Word 
Processor HOUR 150
7.  Accredited Asbestos 
Surveyor HOUR 10
8.  Licensed Asbestos 
Consultant Review HOUR 15
8.A  Field Analysis for 
Technician and XRF 
Device for lead Paint 
Sampling HOUR 2

LAB TESTS
9.  Airborne Sampling for 
Asbestos by PCM 
Samples on site EACH 40
10.  Bulk Sampling for 
Asbestos by PLM 
Samples on site EACH 437
11.  Air-O-Cell Samples EACH 138
12.  Surface Tape 
Samples EACH 20
13.  Indoor Air Quality 
Meter EACH 1
14.  Fungus, Air EACH 125
15.  Fungus, Wipe EACH 38
16.  Asbestos, Wipe 
TEM EACH 24
17.  Lead Paint Chip Lab 
Sampling EACH 25
18.  Swab Sample for 
Fungus & E.coli (w/out 
fecal confirmation) EACH 7

THE FOLLOWING ITEMS WILL NOT BE USED TO 
MISC. EQUIPMENT
19.  Infrared Camera PER DAY 7
20.  Rental Q Trak PER DAY 3
UNSPECIFIED 
SERVICES/MATERIALS
Note: SMC Systems - corrected computation err

Date & Time Due:  June 2, 2009 @ 3:00pm

 PINELLAS COUNTY GOVERNMENT, FLO

 Tabulation
BID #: 089-0235-B (MW)
Bid Title :  Testing Services - Indoor Air Q

COST 
PER UOM TOTAL

COST 
PER UOM TOTAL

COST 
PER UOM TOTAL

COST 
PER UOM TOTAL

53.00$    34,450.00$    65.00$    42,250.00$   65.00$    42,250.00$   90.00$    58,500.00$   

111.00$  17,982.00$    125.00$  20,250.00$   90.00$    14,580.00$   125.00$  20,250.00$   

78.00$    6,864.00$      85.00$    7,480.00$     75.00$    6,600.00$     85.00$    7,480.00$     
53.00$    106.00$         65.00$    130.00$        55.00$    110.00$        85.00$    170.00$        
78.00$    546.00$         75.00$    525.00$        75.00$    525.00$        85.00$    595.00$        

33.00$    4,950.00$      35.00$    5,250.00$     35.00$    5,250.00$     45.00$    6,750.00$     

53.00$    530.00$         65.00$    650.00$        50.00$    500.00$        85.00$    850.00$        

111.00$  1,665.00$      125.00$  1,875.00$     95.00$    1,425.00$     85.00$    1,275.00$     

300.00$  600.00$         75.00$    150.00$        75.00$    150.00$        85.00$    170.00$        
TOTAL 

COST FOR 
LABOR: 67,693.00$    

TOTAL 
COST FOR 

LABOR: 78,560.00$   

TOTAL 
COST FOR 

LABOR: 71,390.00$   

TOTAL 
COST FOR 

LABOR: 96,040.00$   

$0.00 $0.00 5.00$      200.00$        8.00$      320.00$        30.00$    1,200.00$     

15.00$    6,555.00$      10.00$    4,370.00$     14.00$    6,118.00$     15.00$    6,555.00$     
50.00$    6,900.00$      35.00$    4,830.00$     41.00$    5,658.00$     39.00$    5,382.00$     

50.00$    1,000.00$      25.00$    500.00$        32.00$    640.00$        25.00$    500.00$        

100.00$  100.00$         75.00$    75.00$          100.00$  100.00$        25.00$    25.00$          
100.00$  12,500.00$    45.00$    5,625.00$     120.00$  15,000.00$   35.00$    4,375.00$     
50.00$    1,900.00$      95.00$    3,610.00$     37.00$    1,406.00$     35.00$    1,330.00$     

100.00$  2,400.00$      150.00$  3,600.00$     110.00$  2,640.00$     45.00$    1,080.00$     

10.00$    250.00$         10.00$    250.00$        11.00$    275.00$        35.00$    875.00$        

110.00$  770.00$         47.00$    329.00$        66.00$    462.00$        75.00$    525.00$        
TOTAL 

FOR LAB 
TESTS: 32,375.00$    

TOTAL 
FOR LAB 

TESTS: 23,389.00$   

TOTAL 
FOR LAB 

TESTS: 32,619.00$   

TOTAL 
FOR LAB 

TESTS: 21,847.00$   
GRAND 
TOTAL: 100,068.00$  

GRAND 
TOTAL: 101,949.00$ 

GRAND 
TOTAL: 104,009.00$ 

GRAND 
TOTAL: 117,887.00$ 

$0.00 $0.00 250.00$  1,750.00$     100.00$  700.00$        300.00$  2,100.00$     
100.00$  300.00$         45.00$    135.00$        100.00$  300.00$        125.00$  375.00$        

15,000.00$    15,000.00$   15,000.00$   15,000.00$   

EE&G 
ENVIRONMENTAL 

SERVICES, LLC GLE ASSOCIATES, INC.

MACTEC 
ENGINEERING & 

CONSULTING, INC.
PURE AIR CONTROL 

SERVICES, INC.

089-0235-B (MW) 3


