AN \j A
BOARD Of
iOUNTY COMM!SS]ONER&
BOARD OF COUNTY COMMISSIONERS

DATE:  April 7, 2009
AGENDA ITEM NO. 5

Consent Agenda egular Agenda D Public Hearing D

County Administrator’s Signat

Subject:

Award of Bid - Concrete, Ready Mix and Batch Mix (Co-op)
Contract No.: 089-0187-B (SS)

Department: Staff Member Responsible:
Public Works / Purchasing Pete Yauch / Joe Lauro

Recommended Action:

| RECOMMEND THE BOARD OF COUNTY COMMISSIONERS (BOARD) AWARD THE BID FOR CONCRETE
READY MIX AND BATCH MIX, TO DAVIS CONCRETE, INC., DUNEDIN, FLORIDA, ON THE BASIS OF BEING
THE LOWEST RESPONSIVE, RESPONSIBLE BID RECEIVED MEETING SPECIFICATIONS. BIDS ARE ON
FILE IN THE PURCHASING DEPARTMENT.

Summary Explanation/Background:

This is a cooperative bid for concrete, ready mix and batch, administered by Pinellas County including the cities of
Dunedin, Oldsmar, and Tarpon Springs. This bid is for the purchase of various ready mix concrete, delivered to
sites throughout Pinellas County on an as needed basis. The cooperative participants will be responsible for their
funding and issuance of purchase authorizations.

This is a twelve (12) month contract, effective May 15, 2009 through May 14, 2010 with two (2) additional twelve
(12) month term extensions. The term extensions are contingent upon the availability of funds and approval from
the County Administrator.

Contract renewals will allow for price adjustments in an amount not to exceed the average of the Producers Price
Index (PPI); Ready-mix concrete manufacturing and, Product: Ready-mix concrete for the twelve months prior to
renewal, or five percent (5%), whichever is less.

Fiscal Impact/Cost/Revenue Summary:

PINELLAS COUNTY ESTIMATED ANNUAL EXPENDITURE NOT TO EXCEED: $265,195.00
CO-OP ESTIMATED ANNUAL EXPENDITURE NOT TO EXCEED: $204,775.00
TOTAL CONTRACT ESTIMATED ANNUAL EXPENDITURE NOT TO EXCEED: $469,970.00

Exhibits/Attachments Attached:

1. Contract Review
2. Bid Tabulation
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. Pinellas PURCHASING DEPARTMENT NO.: ) Z/2 ]
(ounty CONTRACT REVIEW TRANSMITTAL
PURCHASING
N N A hd e LY
PROJECT: Concrete, Ready Mix J D&/ s ( Co-of)
BID NUMBER: 089-0187-B (SS) REQ. NUMBER:
TYPE: [X] Purchase Contract | [_| Other: [ ] Construction-Less than $100,000 [ ] One Time

In accordance with the policy guide for Contract Administration, the attached documents are submitted for review and comment.

Upon completion of review, complete Contract Review Transmittal and forward to next Review Authority listed. Please indicate
suggested changes by revising, in RED, the appropriate section of the document reflecting the exact wording of the change.

RISK MANAGEMENT: Please enter required liability coverage on pages: 11 and12 PRODUCT ONLY [}

This is an annual requirement contract. Estimated Expenditure: $190 00%‘,’/ 0 G
> Y oo, 60D L‘ ¢ C\/\0 )
] ttac
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Purchasing Dept.

1. Sue Steele
= Using Departments — ——~ | — | |~ | S Ve E—
2 Director: Paul Cozzie - , <§
va” Director: Pete Yauch T

aunda i
JE’L‘TE*%W{) e loq | P LLE Commanta < 800 (64 4iSq D
Using Dept please check attached vendor list. Circrge\;(v ndoys you want bids mailed to. Add additional

vendors with complete informatiom\(Ngme, Address, Phone and Fax)
~ HIGH RISK

Risk Management Director g
3. Attn: Beth Wininger [/7/ 9
(Check applicable box at right) o ‘ gIOSLH'GH

4.
5.
6.
7.
*RETURN ALL DOCUMENTS TO PURCHASING**
Make all inquiries to: | Sue Steele, CPPB, Procurement Analyst [ at Extension 4776

In order to meet the following schedule, please return your requirements to Purchasing by: 1/19/09

TENTATIVE DATES

10/2006 (ag)

Legal Ad-BID/RFP Mail Qut:
BID/RFP Opening:
Board/County Admin/Purchasing Director Approval:




PINELLAS COUNTY GOVERNMENT, FLORIDA
Tabulation
BID # 089-0187-B (SS)

Bid Title : Concrete, Ready Mix and Batch Mix (Co-op})
Date & Time Due:February 17, 2009 @ 3:00 p.m.

All American Masonry &
Davis Concrete, Inc. Landscape Products
ESCRI QU

GROUP 1 - READY MIX CONCRETE, CLASS | (Minimum 5 Cubic Yards
2500 PSI FDOT Mix —

Regular Rock 600 $ 90.00{$ 54,000.00 No Bid

3000 PSI 1150 1$ 9175 $ 105512.50 No Bid

3500 PSI 925 $ 9275(% 85,793.75 No Bid

Fiber Mesh Reinforcement

(.75 Residential) 600 $ 50019 3,000.00 § No Bid

Fiber Mesh Reinforcement (1

Y Commercial) 980 $ 500|% 4 .900.00 No Bid

3000 PSI Chatt Rock Mix (2”

Pump Mix) 590 $ 91.75|% 54,132.50 No Bid
~ TOTAL:| $ 307,338.75 TOTAL: No Bid

GROUP 2 - FLOWABLE FiLL

Pump Application, 150 PSI
Max (Minimum 0-3 cy) 105 $ 80.00 * $80.00 No Bid

Pump Application, 150 PSI
Max (minimum 3+ cubic

yards) 215 $ 80.001% 17,200.00 No Bid
TOTAL: $25,600.00 TOTAL: No Bid
GROUP 3 - CONCRETE, BATCH - MIX, SITE CLEASS 1
3500 PSI (Minimum 0-3 cy) 125 $ 92.75 *$11,593.75 || $ 149.00] % 18,625.00
3500 PSI (Minimum 3-6 cy) 600 $ 9275|% 55650.00) % 119.00 | $§ 71,400.00
3500 PSI (Minimum 6+ cy) 650 3 92751% 6028750/ % 119.00[$ 77,350.00
Fiber Mesh Reinforcement
(.75 Residential) 250 $ 500(% 1,250.00 || $ 6.00|% 1,500.00
Fiber Mesh Reinforcement (1
¥ Commercial) 250 $ 500|% 1,250.00 11 $ 7.001|% 1,750.00
TOTAL:| $130,031.25 TOTAL:| $ 170,625.00
GRAND TOTAL:| $462,970.00 $ 170,625.00
UNSPECIFIED| UNSPECIFIED
WORK:| $ 7,000.00 WORK:| § 7,000.00
DELIVERY)]
CHARGE (less than DELIVERY|

|
|
| 5 yards):| § 50.00 CHARGE:| **
|
|

* Any amount 0-2 yards, delivered, but with 2 yard minimum charge

** Delivery Charge for 0-3 cy: $100.00; 3-6 cy: $50.00



*PINELLAS COUNTY GOVERNMENT, FLORIDA
Tabulation
BID # 089-0187-B (SS)

Bid Title : Concrete, Ready Mix and Batch Mix {(Co-op)
Date & Time Due: February 17, 2009 @ 3:00 p.m.

PINELLAS COUNTY CO-OP MEMBERS

| YARD JUANTITY
CONCRETE, CLASS | (Minimum 5 Cubic Yards)

2500 PSI FDOT Mix -

Regular Rock $ 90.00 $ - $ 90.00 600 3 54,000.00 | $ 54,000.00
3000 PSI $ 91.75 800 $ 73,400.00 $ 91.75 350 $ 32,112.50 | $ 105,512.50
3500 PSI $ 92.75 750 $ 69,562.50 $ 92.75 175 $ 16,231.251% 85,793.75
Fiber Mesh Reinforcement i -
(.75 Residential) $ 5.00 400 $ 2,000.00 $ 5.00 200 $ 1,000.00 | $ 3,000.00
Fiber Mesh Reinforcement (1
% Commercial) $ 5.00 540 $ 2,700.00 $ 5.00 440 3 2,200001% 4,900.00
3000 PSI Chatt Rock Mix (2"
~ [Pump Mix) $ 91.75 390 $ 35,782.50 $ 91.75 200 $ 18,350.00 | $ 54,132.50
TOTAL:| $ 183,445.00 TOTAL:| $ 123,893.75| $ 307,338.75

GROUP 2 - FLOWABLE FILL

Pump Application, 150 PSI
Max (Minimum 0-3 cy) 105 $  8,400.00 $ 80.00 0 3 - $ 8,400.00
Pump Application, 150 PSI
Max (minimum 3+ cubic

yards) 115 $ 9,200.00 $ 80.00 100 $ 8,000.001% 17,200.00
TOTAL:} $ 17,600.00 TOTAL:| $ 8,000.00 | $ 25,600.00
GROUP 3 - CONCRETE, BATCH - MIX, SITE CLEASS 1
3500 PSI (Minimum 0-3cy) | $ 92.75 100 $ 9,275.00 $ 9275 25 3 2,31875|% 11,593.75
3500 PSI (Minimum 3-6 cy) $ 92.75 200 $ 18,550.00 3 92.75 400 $ 37,100.00 [ $ 55,650.00
3500 PSI (Minimum 6+ cy) $ 92.75 300 $ 27,825.00 $ 9275 350 $ 32,462.50 | $ 60,287.50
Fiber Mesh Reinforcement
(.75 Residential) $ 5.00 150 $ 750.00 $ 5.00 100 3 500001 % 1,250.00
Fiber Mesh Reinforcement (1
¥% Commercial) $ 5.00 150 $ 750.00 3 5.00 100 $ 500001% 1,250.00
TOTAL:! $ 57,150.00 TOTAL:| $ 72,881.25 | $130,031.25
GRAND TOTAL| $ 258,195.00 GRAND TOTAL|$ 204,775.00
UNSPECIFIED WORK: $ 7,000.00

DELIVERY CHARGE (less|
than 5 yards):} $ 50.00

* Any amount 0-2 yards, delivered, but with 2 yard minimum charge






