
 PINELLAS COUNTY GOVERNMENT, FLORIDA
 Tabulation
BID # 089-0105-B (MW)
Bid Title : Backflow Prevention Devices & Assemblies
Date & Time Due: January 20, 2009 @ 3:00 p.m. 

Note: All estimated quantities are based on a 24 month period.

ITEM # DESCRIPTION EST. QTY UNIT PRICE TOTAL UNIT PRICE TOTAL UNIT PRICE TOTAL UNIT PRICE TOTAL UNIT PRICE TOTAL UNIT PRICE TOTAL UNIT PRICE TOTAL UNIT PRICE TOTAL UNIT PRICE TOTAL
GROUP 1

18235 3/4" DCVA 600 83.38$         50,028.00$     44.50$         26,700.00$    52.70$         31,620.00$    45.00$         27,000.00$   52.51$         31,506.00$   53.00$         31,800.00$     43.84$         26,304.00$   54.23$         32,538.00$    51.25$         30,750.00$    
17721 1" DCVA 500 93.58$         46,790.00$     44.80$         22,400.00$    65.15$         32,575.00$    45.31$         22,655.00$   54.15$         27,075.00$   53.00$         26,500.00$     44.20$         22,100.00$   56.51$         28,255.00$    63.35$         31,675.00$    
18806 1 1/2" DCVA 100 218.21$       21,821.00$     103.15$       10,315.00$    103.50$       10,350.00$    104.32$       10,432.00$   113.42$       11,342.00$   121.00$       12,100.00$     99.98$         9,998.00$     117.12$       11,712.00$    100.75$       10,075.00$    
19881 2" DCVA 100 246.79$       24,679.00$     104.96$       10,496.00$    131.50$       13,150.00$    106.14$       10,614.00$   113.97$       11,397.00$   123.00$       12,300.00$     103.35$       10,335.00$   118.95$       11,895.00$    127.85$       12,785.00$    

Total Group 
1: 143,318.00$   

Total Group 
1: 69,911.00$    

Total Group 
1: 87,695.00$    

Total Group 
1: 70,701.00$   

Total Group 
1: 81,320.00$   

Total Group 
1: 82,700.00$     

Total Group 
1: 68,737.00$   

Total Group 
1: 84,400.00$    

Total Group 
1: 85,285.00$    

GROUP 2
18610 3/4” RPD 150 170.27$       25,540.50$     80.45$         12,067.50$    92.20$         13,830.00$    85.05$         12,757.50$   82.22$         12,333.00$   100.00$       15,000.00$     83.63$         12,544.50$   84.91$         12,736.50$    89.60$         13,440.00$    
19814 1” RPD 225 181.43$       40,821.75$     81.83$         18,411.75$    106.50$       23,962.50$    85.51$         19,239.75$   82.76$         18,621.00$   105.00$       23,625.00$     84.01$         18,902.25$   86.36$         19,431.00$    103.85$       23,366.25$    
18382 1 ½” RPD 90 352.70$       31,743.00$     151.84$       13,665.60$    181.80$       16,362.00$    163.14$       14,682.60$   153.56$       13,820.40$   192.00$       17,280.00$     160.10$       14,409.00$   160.24$       14,421.60$    176.80$       15,912.00$    
19243 2” RPD 100 379.41$       37,941.00$     152.28$       15,228.00$    212.50$       21,250.00$    181.70$       18,170.00$   154.01$       15,401.00$   213.00$       21,300.00$     178.32$       17,832.00$   160.71$       16,071.00$    206.65$       20,665.00$    

Total Group 
2: 136,046.25$   

Total Group 
2: 59,372.85$    

Total Group 
2: 75,404.50$    

Total Group 
2: 64,849.85$   

Total Group 
2: 60,175.40$   

Total Group 
2: 77,205.00$     

Total Group 
2: 63,687.75$   

Total Group 
2: 62,660.10$    

Total Group 
2: 73,383.25$    

GROUP 3
17968 4” DCVA 20 1,440.43$    28,808.60$     954.09$       19,081.80$    960.00$       19,200.00$    778.35$       15,567.00$   1,015.67$    20,313.40$   970.00$       19,400.00$     803.10$       16,062.00$   959.90$       19,198.00$    945.20$       18,904.00$    
23243 6” DCVA 30 2,094.06$    62,821.80$     1,515.40$    45,462.00$    1,490.00$    44,700.00$    1,206.18$    36,185.40$   1,596.57$    47,897.10$   1,470.00$    44,100.00$     1,212.50$    36,375.00$   1,530.00$    45,900.00$    1,502.00$    45,060.00$    
19966 8” DCVA 6 3,786.52$    22,719.12$     2,939.90$    17,639.40$    2,895.00$    17,370.00$    2,371.13$    14,226.78$   3,129.63$    18,777.78$   2,975.00$    17,850.00$     2,383.50$    14,301.00$   2,957.50$    17,745.00$    2,912.50$    17,475.00$    

Total Group 
3: 114,349.52$   

Total Group 
3: 82,183.20$    

Total Group 
3: 81,270.00$    

Total Group 
3: 65,979.18$   

Total Group 
3: 86,988.28$   

Total Group 
3: 81,350.00$     

Total Group 
3: 66,738.00$   

Total Group 
3: 82,843.00$    

Total Group 
3: 81,439.00$    

GROUP 4
20381 4” RPD 15 1,573.74$    23,606.10$     1,067.81$    16,017.15$    1,285.00$    19,275.00$    1,338.14$    20,072.10$   1,343.73$    20,155.95$   1,290.00$    19,350.00$     1,093.00$    16,395.00$   1,269.94$    19,049.10$    1,250.50$    18,757.50$    
18797 6” RPD 10 2,547.04$    25,470.40$     1,918.89$    19,188.90$    1,760.00$    17,600.00$    2,335.05$    23,350.50$   2,014.38$    20,143.80$   2,350.00$    23,500.00$     1,767.50$    17,675.00$   1,758.31$    17,583.10$    1,731.00$    17,310.00$    
17973 8” RPD 2 4,737.59$    9,475.18$       3,656.50$    7,313.00$      3,110.00$    6,220.00$      4,086.62$    8,173.24$     3,613.59$    7,227.18$     4,500.00$    9,000.00$       3,095.80$    6,191.60$     3,079.72$    6,159.44$      3,032.50$    6,065.00$      

Total Group 
4: 58,551.68$     

Total Group 
4: 42,519.05$    

Total Group 
4: 43,095.00$    

Total Group 
4: 51,595.84$   

Total Group 
4: 47,526.93$   

Total Group 
4: 51,850.00$     

Total Group 
4: 40,261.60$   

Total Group 
4: 42,791.64$    

Total Group 
4: 42,132.50$    

GROUP 5
30317 4” DCDA 6 1,778.30$    10,669.80$     1,147.80$    6,886.80$      1,160.00$    6,960.00$      1,014.43$    6,086.58$     1,221.27$    7,327.62$     1,235.00$    7,410.00$       1,019.70$    6,118.20$     1,154.20$    6,925.20$      1,136.50$    6,819.00$      
30318 6” DCDA 30 2,274.84$    68,245.20$     1,747.70$    52,431.00$    1,770.00$    53,100.00$    1,262.88$    37,886.40$   1,841.30$    55,239.00$   1,650.00$    49,500.00$     1,269.00$    38,070.00$   1,767.00$    53,010.00$    1,731.40$    51,942.00$    
30319 8” DCDA 10 4,079.54$    40,795.40$     3,061.10$    30,611.00$    3,100.00$    31,000.00$    2,600.00$    26,000.00$   3,258.69$    32,586.90$   3,155.00$    31,550.00$     2,613.00$    26,130.00$   3,079.72$    30,797.20$    3,032.50$    30,325.00$    

Total Group 
5: 119,710.40$   

Total Group 
5: 89,928.80$    

Total Group 
5: 91,060.00$    

Total Group 
5: 69,972.98$   

Total Group 
5: 95,153.52$   

Total Group 
5: 88,460.00$     

Total Group 
5: 70,318.20$   

Total Group 
5: 90,732.40$    

Total Group 
5: 89,086.00$    

GROUP 6
30378 4” RPDA 1 2,214.34$    2,214.34$       1,336.94$    1,336.94$      1,550.00$    1,550.00$      1,058.76$    1,058.76$     1,622.05$    1,622.05$     1,625.00$    1,625.00$       1,345.00$    1,345.00$     1,532.90$    1,532.90$      1,509.50$    1,509.50$      
30379 6” RPDA 1 3,004.03$    3,004.03$       2,335.95$    2,335.95$      2,440.00$    2,440.00$      1,920.61$    1,920.61$     2,555.06$    2,555.06$     2,735.00$    2,735.00$       2,347.00$    2,347.00$     2,414.75$    2,414.75$      2,378.00$    2,378.00$      
30380 8” RPDA 1 5,056.19$    5,056.19$       4,088.95$    4,088.95$      4,400.00$    4,400.00$      3,659.79$    3,659.79$     4,699.41$    4,699.41$     4,965.00$    4,965.00$       4,108.00$    4,108.00$     4,441.32$    4,441.32$      4,373.00$    4,373.00$      

Total Group 
6: 10,274.56$     

Total Group 
6: 7,761.84$      

Total Group 
6: 8,390.00$      

Total Group 
6: 6,639.16$     

Total Group 
6: 8,876.52$     

Total Group 
6: 9,325.00$       

Total Group 
6: 7,800.00$     

Total Group 
6: 8,388.97$      

Total Group 
6: 8,260.50$      

GROUP 7

20100
3/4” DuC w/Style 

B 100 no bid no bid no bid no bid 93.25$         9,325.00$      no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid 106.70$       10,670.00$   101.80$       10,180.00$    101.25$       10,125.00$    

20101
3/4” DuC w/Style 

C 100 no bid no bid no bid no bid 96.90$         9,690.00$      no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid 106.70$       10,670.00$   101.80$       10,180.00$    101.25$       10,125.00$    

20157 1” DuC w/Style B 10 no bid no bid no bid no bid 166.75$       1,667.50$      no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid 209.85$       2,098.50$     200.27$       2,002.70$      199.25$       1,992.50$      

30314
3/4” DuC w/style 

B x 9” high 100 no bid no bid no bid no bid 93.50$         9,350.00$      no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid 100.52$       10,052.00$   95.92$         9,592.00$      95.40$         9,540.00$      

30315
3/4” DuC w/style 

B x 12” high 5 no bid no bid no bid no bid 95.30$         476.50$         no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid 102.12$       510.60$        97.46$         487.30$         96.96$         484.80$         

30316
3/4” DuC w/style 

B x 15” high 100 no bid no bid no bid no bid 97.20$         9,720.00$      no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid 104.12$       10,412.00$   99.37$         9,937.00$      98.86$         9,886.00$      
13397 1” x 15” Duc 5 no bid no bid no bid no bid 215.00$       1,075.00$      no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid 181.10$       905.50$        172.81$       864.05$         171.90$       859.50$         

Total Group 
7: no bid

Total Group 
7: no bid

Total Group 
7: 41,304.00$    

Total Group 
7: no bid

Total Group 
7: no bid

Total Group 
7: no bid

Total Group 
7: 45,318.60$   

Total Group 
7: 43,243.05$    

Total Group 
7: 43,012.80$    

Biko Eng. Services Inc. BAVCO Mainline Supply Co. Cole Industrial Hayes Pipe Supply Inc.Coast Pump & Supply Co. Worldwide Technology Inc.

Ferguson Enterprises 
d/b/a Ferguson 

Waterworks HD Supply Waterworks



 PINELLAS COUNTY GOVERNMENT, FLORIDA
 Tabulation
BID # 089-0105-B (MW)
Bid Title : Backflow Prevention Devices & Assemblies
Date & Time Due: January 20, 2009 @ 3:00 p.m. 
GROUP 8

4” DCVA 5 1,198.71$    5,993.55$       925.46$       4,627.30$      930.00$       4,650.00$      no bid no bid 985.20$       4,926.00$     1,185.00$    5,925.00$       936.00$       4,680.00$     931.10$       4,655.50$      916.85$       4,584.25$      
6” DCVA 15 1,763.41$    26,451.15$     1,470.00$    22,050.00$    1,490.00$    22,350.00$    no bid no bid 1,564.81$    23,472.15$   1,855.00$    27,825.00$     1,486.60$    22,299.00$   1,478.87$    22,183.05$    1,456.00$    21,840.00$    
8” DCVA 6 3,376.77$    20,260.62$     2,870.20$    17,221.20$    2,895.00$    17,370.00$    no bid no bid 3,035.74$    18,214.44$   3,510.00$    21,060.00$     2,884.00$    17,304.00$   2,869.02$    17,214.12$    2,825.00$    16,950.00$    
10” DCVA 1 4,972.43$    4,972.43$       3,221.90$    3,221.90$      3,280.00$    3,280.00$      no bid no bid 3,429.82$    3,429.82$     4,550.00$    4,550.00$       3,258.40$    3,258.40$     3,241.45$    3,241.45$      3,191.00$    3,191.00$      

Total Group 
8: 57,677.75$     

Total Group 
8: 47,120.40$    

Total Group 
8: 47,650.00$    

Total Group 
8: no bid

Total Group 
8: 50,042.41$   

Total Group 
8: 59,360.00$     

Total Group 
8: 47,541.40$   

Total Group 
8: 47,294.12$    

Total Group 
8: 46,565.25$    

GROUP 9
4” DCDA 4 1,412.69$    5,650.76$       1,115.80$    4,463.20$      1,130.00$    4,520.00$      no bid no bid 1,184.63$    4,738.52$     1,500.00$    6,000.00$       1,125.00$    4,500.00$     1,119.58$    4,478.32$      1,102.50$    4,410.00$      
6” DCDA 18 2,054.46$    36,980.28$     1,698.50$    30,573.00$    1,720.00$    30,960.00$    no bid no bid 1,786.07$    32,149.26$   2,250.00$    40,500.00$     1,714.00$    30,852.00$   1,705.57$    30,700.26$    1,680.00$    30,240.00$    
8” DCDA 12 4,161.89$    49,942.68$     2,975.50$    35,706.00$    2,995.00$    35,940.00$    no bid no bid 3,128.35$    37,540.20$   3,875.00$    46,500.00$     3,002.00$    36,024.00$   2,987.33$    35,847.96$    2,941.60$    35,299.20$    
10” DCDA 1 4,812.43$    4,812.43$       3,587.50$    3,587.50$      3,600.00$    3,600.00$      no bid no bid 3,758.22$    3,758.22$     4,650.00$    4,650.00$       3,607.00$    3,607.00$     3,588.81$    3,588.81$      3,534.00$    3,534.00$      

Total Group 
9: 97,386.15$     

Total Group 
9: 74,329.70$    

Total Group 
9: 75,020.00$    

Total Group 
9: no bid

Total Group 
9: 78,186.20$   

Total Group 
9: 97,650.00$     

Total Group 
9: 74,983.00$   

Total Group 
9: 74,615.35$    

Total Group 
9: 73,483.20$    

GRAND 
TOTAL: 737,314.31$   

GRAND 
TOTAL: 473,126.84$  

GRAND 
TOTAL: 550,888.50$  

GRAND 
TOTAL: 329,738.01$ 

GRAND 
TOTAL: 508,269.26$ 

GRAND 
TOTAL: 547,900.00$   

GRAND 
TOTAL: 485,385.55$ 

GRAND 
TOTAL: 536,968.63$  

GRAND 
TOTAL: 542,647.50$  

Unspecified Materials - $20,000.00 for initial 24 month contract period.
Hayes Pipe Supply Inc.Coast Pump & Supply Co. Worldwide Technology Inc.

Ferguson Enterprises 
d/b/a Ferguson 

Waterworks HD Supply WaterworksBiko Eng. Services Inc. BAVCO Mainline Supply Co. Cole Industrial



 PINELLAS COUNTY GOVERNMENT, FLORIDA
 Tabulation
BID # 089-0105-B (MW)
Bid Title : Backflow Prevention Devices & Assemblies
Date & Time Due: December 11, 2008 @ 3:00 p.m. 

Biko Eng. Services 
Inc. BAVCO

Mainline Supply 
Co. Cole Industrial

Coast Pump & 
Supply Co.

Worldwide 
Technology Inc.

Ferguson 
Enterprises d/b/a 

Ferguson 
Waterworks

HD Supply 
Waterworks

Hayes Pipe Supply 
Inc.

TOTALS TOTALS TOTALS TOTALS TOTALS TOTALS TOTALS TOTALS TOTALS
Group 1 143,318.00$           69,911.00$             87,695.00$             70,701.00$             81,320.00$             82,700.00$             68,737.00$             84,400.00$             85,285.00$             
Group 2 136,046.25$           59,372.85$             75,404.50$             64,849.85$             60,175.40$             77,205.00$             63,687.75$             62,660.10$             73,383.25$             
Group 3 114,349.52$           82,183.20$             81,270.00$             65,979.18$             86,988.28$             81,350.00$             66,738.00$             82,843.00$             81,439.00$             
Group 4 58,551.68$             42,519.05$             43,095.00$             51,595.84$             47,526.93$             51,850.00$             40,261.60$             42,791.64$             42,132.50$             
Group 5 119,710.40$           89,928.80$             91,060.00$             69,972.98$             95,153.52$             88,460.00$             70,318.20$             90,732.40$             89,086.00$             
Group 6 10,274.56$             7,761.84$               8,390.00$               6,639.16$               8,876.52$               9,325.00$               7,800.00$               8,388.97$               8,260.50$               
Group 7 no bid no bid 41,304.00$             no bid no bid no bid 45,318.60$             43,243.05$             43,012.80$             
Group 8 57,677.75$             47,120.40$             47,650.00$             no bid 50,042.41$             59,360.00$             47,541.40$             47,294.12$             46,565.25$             
Group 9 97,386.15$             74,329.70$             75,020.00$             no bid 78,186.20$             97,650.00$             74,983.00$             74,615.35$             73,483.20$             
GRAND TOTAL: 737,314.31$           473,126.84$           550,888.50$           329,738.01$           508,269.26$           547,900.00$           485,385.55$           536,968.63$           542,647.50$           
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