BOARD OF
COUNTY COMMISSIONERS }
BOARD OF COUNTY COMMISSIONERS

DATE: March 17, 2009
AGENDA ITEM NO. 6

Consent Agenda Q{ Regular Agenda D Public Hearing D

County Administrator’s Signature:

Subject:

Award of Bid - Backflow Prevention Devices & Assemblies
Contract No. 089-0105-B (MW)

Department: Staff Member Responsible:
Utilities/Purchasing Tom Crandall/Joe Lauro

Recommended Action:

| RECOMMEND THE BOARD OF COUNTY COMMISSIONERS (BOARD) REJECT THE BIDS FOR BACKFLOW
PREVENTION DEVICES & ASSEMBLIES FROM THE FOLLOWING VENDORS AS NON-RESPONSIVE FOR
BIDDING ITEMS NOT MEETING SPECIFICATION:

VENDOR GROUP
COLE INDUSTRIAL AND FERGUSON ENTERPRISES D/B/A FERGUSON WATERWORKS 3and5
MAINLINE HOLDING COMPANY, LLC D/B/A MAINLINE SUPPLY COMPANY 7

T IS FURTHER RECOMMENDED THE BOARD APPROVE THE BIDS FOR BACKFLOW PREVENTION
DEVICES & ASSEMBLIES TO THE FOLLOWING VENDORS ON THE BASIS OF BEING THE LOWEST
RESPONSIVE, RESPONSIBLE BIDS RECEIVED MEETING SPECIFICATION. BIDS ARE ON FILE IN THE
PURCHASING DEPARTMENT.

VENDOR GROUP
BACKFLOW APPARATUS & VALUE D/B/A BAVCO 2

COLE INDUSTRIAL AND TECHNICAL SUPPLY CO., INC. 6
FERGUSON ENTERPRISES, INC. D/B/A FERGUSON WATERWORKS | 1and 4
HAYES PIPE SUPPLY, INC. 5,7,8and 9
MAINLINE HOLDING COMPANY, LLC D/B/A MAINLINE SUPPLY |3
COMPANY

Summary Explanation/Background:

On December 11, 2008 the Purchasing Department on behalf of the Utilities Department let a bid for backflow
prevention devices and assemblies to be ordered on an as needed basis. These devices are used to protect the
potable water supply. Ten bids were received with awards by group recommended to five bidders.

This is a twenty-four (24) month contract from date of award. The contract allows for price adjustments
(increase/decrease) every twelve (12) months in an amount not to exceed the average of the Producer Price Index
for ail Urban Consumers, Not Seasonally Adjusted, for Series id: PCU 3261, Plastics Product Manufacturing. The
contract may be extended subject to written notice of agreement from the County and the successful bidder(s) for
an additional twenty-four (24) month period beyond the primary contract period. This term extension shall be
exercised only if all terms and conditions remain the same and the County Administrator or Director of Purchasing
grants approval.
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Fiscal Impact/Cost/Revenue Summary:
The twenty-four month contract value is estimated at $528,427.86.

Funding for this project is from the Utilities Operating Budget.

Exhibits/Attachments Attached:

1. Contract Review
2. Bid Tabulation
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PROJECT: Backflow Prevention Devices & Assemblies
DEPT: Utilities Dept.
BID NUMBER: 089-0105-B (MW)

CONTRACT REVIEW TRANSMITTAL SLIP

TYPE: Purchase Contract

In accordance with the policy guide for Contract Administration, the attached documents are submitted for review and comment.

Upon completuon of review, complete Contract Review Transmittal Slip and forward to the next Review Authority on the list. Please indicate suggested changes
by revising, in RED, the appropriate section of the document reflecting the exact wording of the change and initialing next to your changes.

RISK MANAGEMENT: PRODUCT ONLY [XI This is an annual requirement contract for goods - no services.
Estimated Annual Expenditure County: $640,000.00 Estimated 24 Month Expenditure $1,280,000.00

REVIEW REVIEW AUTHORITY REVIEW REVIEW COMMENTS (Attach Separate COMMENTS
SEQUENCE DATE SIGNATURE page if necessary) INCORPORATED
Purchasing Dept.
1. Joe Lauro \\‘\ I , / u/
Candy Mancuso ’ 1/ ﬁﬁﬁ‘ v

Mike Wilson ryy) A

— - p)
| - Q:‘.’:Gﬂzl;“:: Dept ,, K“M ), a&, 19,21, 22, 24, /ﬂ ¢
* | Karen DedJordy 1)°i3- 33 ga 25'3 20,271 28 V
Tom Crandall I / 2 /o 3 »

. iti ith inf ti
wollrxll% ]Plﬁgt Sgiegistg :f a%( az}g%c&egnv&ld?{s{%ﬁrcl& vEndo,rg Xgu ,gpﬁ bld’s %al.led to. Add additional vendors with complete information you

RETURN TO PURCHASING ATTN: MIKE WILSON - THANKS!

All inquiries should be made to: Mike Wilson at Extension 43154
In order to meet the following schedule, please return your requirements to Purchasing by: August 29, 2008

TENTATIVE DATES

Contract Review Returned By: 11/26/08
Publish Bid: 12/04/08

Open Bids: 01/08/09

Tentative Award: 02/03/09 (BCC)

Tentative Start Date: 02/03/09




PINELLAY CUUNI Y GUVERNMEN !, FLURIDA

Tabulation .
BID # 089-0108-8 (MW)

Bld Title : Backflow Prevantion Devices & Assemblles
Date & Time Due: January 20, 2009 @ 3:00 p.m.

Note: All estimated quantiies are baged on a 24 manth period.

Ferguson Enterprises
dibfa Ferguson
Biko Eng. Services Inc. BAVCO Mainling Supply Co. Cole Industrial Coast Pump & Supply Co. | Werldwide Technology Ine. Waterwarks HD Supply Waterworks H Pipe Sy, Inc.
ITEM# | DESCRIPTION | BST.QTY | UNIT PRICE TOTAL UNIT PRICE TOTAL URIT PRICE TOTAL UNIT FRICE TOTAL UNIT PRICE TOTAL UNIT PRICE TOTAL UNIT PRICE TOTAL UNIT FRICE TOTAL UNIT FRICE TOTAL
GROUP1
18235 4° DCVA 600 83.38|$ 60,028.00 44.50 26,700.00 52.70 1,620.00 45.00 27,000.00 52.51 31,508.00 §3.00 | $§ 31,800.00 43.84 28,304.00 §4.23 | $ 32,638.00 $1.25 | $_30,750.00
17721 1" BCVA 500 83.58 | $§_ 46,780.00 44.80 22,400.00 65.15 2,575.00 46,31 | ¢ 855.00 54.15 27,075.00 53.001$ 28,600.00 4420 | $ 22,100.00 58.61 28,288.00 63.35 ,B75.00
18808 1172 DCVA 100 218.21 21,821.00 103.15 10,315.00 103.50 0,350.00 104.32 | § 10.432.00 113.42 11,342.00 121.00 12,100.00 99.98 9,998.00 117.12 11,712.00 100.75 ,073.00
19881 Z DOVA 100 |5 248.79 |5 24,678.00 104.85 | §_10,488.00 131.50 3,150,00 108.14 | $ 10,814.00 113.97 | $ 11,387.00 123.00 12,300.00 10335 [ § 10,336.00 118.85] % 11,895.00 127.85 ,786.00
Total Group] Total Group| Total Group| Total Group| Total Group| Yotal Groupi Yotal Group Fotal Group| Total Groug]
1: $ 143,318.00 1: $ 69,911.00 1:| § 87,695.00 1| $ 70,701.00 1: $ 81,320.00 11§ 82700.00 1:| § €8,737.00 1:| $§ 84,400.00 1:1$ 26,285.00 |
,
18810 34" RFD 180 170.27 25,540.50 .45 2,087.50 9220} $ 13.830.00 85.05 2,757.50 82.22 ,333.00 160.00{ $ 16,000.00 83.63 2,544.50 84.91 2,736.60 89.80 | $ 13,440.00
18814 1 RPD 228 181.43 40,821.75 .83 ,411.75 08.50 23,962.50 85.51 ,239.75 §2.78 ,621.00 05.00 23,825.00 84.0 8,802.25 88.36 9,431.00 103853 23,366.25
18382 1% RPD 90 352.70 31,743.00 151.84 ,885.80 81.80 16,362.00 1683.14 4,682.60 153.56 ,820.40 92.00 17,280.00 180.1 4,409.00 160.24 4,421.60 176.80 15,912.00
19243 Z"RFD 100 37941 37,841.00 152.28 ,228.00 12.50 21,250.00 181.70 ,170.00 154.01 15,401.00 13.00 21,300.00 178.32 7,832.00 1680.71 18,071.00 208.65 20,685.00
Total Group] Total Group} Total Group] Total Group] Total Group| Total Group] Total Group] Total Group} Total Group]
SO 2: § 138,048.25 2|8 69,372.85 29 75404.50 2:| § 84,849.85 2 $ 60,175.40 24§ 77,205.00 g $ 63,687.75 24 $ 62,660.10 2] $ 73,383.25
P 3' i
17588 7 DCVA 20 440.43 [ $_ 28,808.60 954.00 | 19,081.80|$  ©60.00 9,200.00 01567 | 2031340 |$ 87000 |5 19,400.00 650.80 | § 19,198.00 | $ 4520 8.804.00
23243 6" DCVA 30 2,084.06 | $ 62,821.80 1,515.40 45,462.00 1,480.00 44,700.00 ,588.57 E 47,887.10 1,470.00 44,100.00 1,530.00 45,900.00 1,502.00 45,080.00 |
19968 8" DCVA [ .788.52 | $  22,719.12 2,939.90 17,839.40 2,895.00 7,370.00 ,129.63 18,777.78 2,875.00 17,850.00 2,957.50 17,745.00 2,912.50 7,475.00
Total Group} Total Group Total Group| Total Group| otal Group] Fotal Group| Total Group|
5 34 $ 114,349.52 3% 82,183.20 34 $ 81,270.00 3¢ 86,988.28 3_H $ 81,360.00 34 $ 82,843.00 3 $ 81,438.00
ROUP 4|
20381 4" RPD 15 573.74 23,608, 067.81 16,017.151 $ 1,285.00 19,276.00 338.14 20,072.10 343.73| 3 20,156.96 .280.00 19,350.00 ,093.00 16,385.00 [ $ 1,268.94 19,049. 250.50 18.757.50
18797 8°RFD i0 2547.04 | $ 25470.4 .218.89 19,188.80 .760.00 17,600.00 ,335.05 | $_23,360.50 2,014.38 20,143.80 2,350.00 23500003 1.767.50 17,876.00 2758, 17,583, 73100 17,310.00
17973 & RPD 2 4,737.59 9.475. ,658.50 7.313.00 ,110.00 8,220.00 4,088.62 8,173.24 61360 | $_ 7,227.18 4,600.00 ,000.00 ,095.80 6,191.60 ,079.72 B,159.44 ,032.60 ,065.00
Fotal Group| Total Group] Total Group) Total Group) Total Group] Total Group Fotal Group| Total Group] Total Group
4:1$ 88,551.68 448 42519.05 4] $ 43,095.00 4: § 51,695.34 4| $ 47,628.93 44§ 61,860.00 4 $ 40,261.60 4:* $ 42,791.84 41 $_42,132.50
GROUP 5
30317 4 BCDA 8 778.30 | 8 10,669.80 147.80 6,880.50 160.00 ,060.0 22127 7,327.62 | $ 1,205.00 | $  7,410.00 164.20 6,625.20 .138.50 6,819.00
30318 & DCDA 30 2,274.84 68,246,20 74770 | $_62,431.00 770,00 | $_53,100.0 841,30 [ §_65,239.00 650,00 48,500.00 J767.00[% 53010001% 1731.40([$ 51,842.00
30319 8°DCDA 10 4,079.84 40,795.40 ,081.10 30,611.00 ,100.00 31,000.0 ,258.88 32,588.90 ,155.00 31,650.00 ,078.72 30,797.20 ,032.50 30,326.00
Fotal Group| Total Group] Total Grou, Total Group] Total Group Votal Group) ‘otal Group|
5: $ 119,710.40 5: $ 89,928.80 5| ¢ 91,080.00 §4 % 95,153.52 5 $ 88,460.00 8§ 90,732.40 5:) $ 88,086.00
GROUP 6
30378 4"RPDA 2,214.34 2,214.34 .338.84 338.94 ,850.00 1,550.00 ,058.7 ,058.7 ,622.0! 622.05 | $_1,625.00 825.00 345.00 .345.00 532.90 ,532.80 ,609.50 ,508.50
30379 6" RPDA ,004.03 ,004.03 2,335.85 2,335.95 2,440.00 24400013 18206 820, 2,555.0¢ 2,555.08 ,735.00 2,735.00 2,347.00 2,347.00 2414.75 2,414.75 2,378.00 2,378.00
30380 8" RPDA ,058.18 056, 4,088.95 4,088.95 4,400.00 4,400.00 ,859.7! ,659.7! 4,699.4 4,899.41 4,885.00 ,885.00 4,108.00 4.108.00 4,441.32 4,441.32 4,373.00 4,373.00
Total Grou, Total Group] Total Group Total Group} Total Group; « Total Group Total Group, Total Group] Total Group|
| GROUPT 84$ 10274.58 84S 776184 643, 839000 &5 603916 8]¢ asress s 932500 s 70000 s s3es07 6$ 820050
[~ |3 DuC wiStylo} -
20100 [:] 100 no bid o bid no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid $ 10870|$ 1067000|$ 101.80|$ 10,180.00|$ 101.25]$ 10,125.00
& OuC wiShylg|
20101 c 100 no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid $§ 10870)% 1067000|% 101.80!$ 10,180.00|$ 101.26[$ 10,125.00
20157 __|1° DuC wiStyle B] 10 no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid $ 20985|$ 209850|$% 20027 200270)/$ 189.25|% 1,88250
_. | a4 DuC wistyte| ] - e )
30314 8x 8" high 100 no bid no bid no bid no bid nio bid no bid no bid o bid no bid no bid $ 10062)% 10,052.00|8% 95.92|% ©.592.00([8 8540 |§ 8,540.00
W4" DuC wistyle
30315 8x 12" kigh 5 no bid no bid no bid no bid na bid no bid no big no bid no big no bid $_10212|% 51060(% 9746 | § 487.30 | $ 96.98 | § 484.80
4" DuC wistyls|
30318 Bx15° hgh 100 no bid no bid no bid na bid no bid no bid no bld no bid no bid no bid $ 10412193 10412003 8237 |5 983700 % 98.86 | § 9,888.00
13397 1°x 18" Buc 5 no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid nio bid no bid no bid $_181.10($% 90550 | $§  17281]8 88405|$ 171.80[$ 859.50
Tatal Group] Total Group Total Group] Total Group| Total Group] Total Group] Total Group)] Total Group]
74 no bid 7 no bid 7:{ no bid 7:} no bid 7: no bid 74 $ 45,318.60 74 $ 43,243.08 74$ 43,012.80




Tabulation

BID # 038-0108-8 (AAW)

Bid Title : F Devices & A
Date & Time Due: January 20, 2009 @ 3:00 p.m.

Note: Afl estimated quantities are based on a 24 month period. i
Ferguson Enterprises
dibfa Ferguson
Biko Eng. Services Inc. BAVCO Mainlins Supply Co. Cole Industrial Coast Pump & Su, Co. | Worldwide Technology Inc. Waterworks HD Supply Waterworks Hayes Pipe Supply Inc,
TWEMP_| DESCRIPTION | EST.QTY | UNIT PRICE TOTAL UNIT PRICE TOTAL UNIT PRIGE TOTAL | UNITPRICE | TOTAL | UNITPRICE || TOTAL UNIT PRIGE TOTAL UNIT PRICE TOVAL UNIT PRICE TOTAL UNIT PRICE TOTAL
GROUP 8

TR E 19871 586356 6 02548 |3 4.627.30 530005 4,650.00 [ no bl fo bid 98620 |§ 4,626.00 % 1,185.00 552500 |5 936005 468000 631.10] 5 4.656.60 016.85 |5 458425
G DCVA 18 J634115 76451155 1.470.00 'S 22,060.00 | 5 1,480.00]§ 72,350.00 | nobla no bid 56401 (3 23.472.16 | 1.855.00/S 27,625.00 | 5 1.488.60 |  22.280.00 | 6 1.478.87 | S 22,183.05 | § 1466.00] S 51.840.00
8°DCVA [ ,376.77 | $§ 20,260.62 ,870.20 17,221.20 | § 2.895.00 17,370.00 | no bid no bid ,035.74 1821444 13 3.510.00 21,080.00 | § 2,884.00 17,304.00 ,869.02 17.214.12 | 8 2,825.00 16,850.00
10" DCVA 1 4,972.43 4,972.43 ,221.80 3,221.80 ,280.00 3,280.00 | no bid no bld 428.82 ,422.82 | $ 4,650.00 4.550.00|$ 3,288.40 3,258.40 3,241.45 3,241.45 ,191.00 ,181.00

rotal Group] fotal Group] Total Group] Total Group) Fotal Group)] ‘ofal Group] Total Group) ‘ofal Group| Fotal Group]
8:!$ 67,877.76 84 % 47,120.40 8: § 47,850.00 8: no bld 8] $ §0,042.41 84 $ £9,380.00 8: $ 47,541.40 8:$ 47.284.12 8] $ 46,565.25

GROUP si S — 5 —

4 DCDA 4 ,412.89 | 5,650.76 | § > 1.11580($ 4.463.20 .130.00 4,6520.00 | no bid no bid . 184.83 4,738.52 | $ 1,500.00 6,000.00 12500 | $ 4,600.00 ,119.58 4478.32 |8 1,102.50 | $  4,410.00
& DCDA 18 205446 | $ 36,880.28 |3 16068.50 | $ 30,573.00 |3 1.72000|$ 30,980.00 | nobid o bid J88.07( % 32149.28 | $ 2250.00 | § 40,500.00 | $ 1.714.00]$ 30852.00)§ 1,705.57 | § 30,700.28 .680.00 1 $ 30,240.00
§ DCDA 12 4,161.89 49,94268 | $_2975.50 | $_35,708.00 2,885.00 36,840.00 | no bid no bid ,128.35 3754020 | ¢ 3875008 46,500.00|$ 3,002.00 | $ 36,024.00 2,987.33 35847.98 | 3 24160 | $§ 35,299.20
10° GCDA 1 4,812.43 4,812.43 ,587.50 3,587.50 ,660.00 3,800.00 | no bid no bid ,758.22 3,768.22 | $ 4,650.00 4,650.00 ,607.00 3,607.00 ,568.81 3,588.81 ,534.00 3,534.00

Fotal Group Total Group Fotal Group) ~Total Group)] otal Group) | Total Group} ‘otal Group] Total Group| Fotal Group|
) $  97,388.15 91§ 74,329.70 9: § 75,020,00 9:| no bid 9§ 78,188.20| - 9 $ 97,650.00 9:' $ 74,883.00 9:$ 74.615.35 9:$ 73.483.20

GRAND] GRANDI GRAND| [€] D} GRAND; GRANDI GRAND [<] D] GRAND|
TOTAL: § 737,314.31 TOTAL:| $473,126.84 TOTAL: $ 509,584.50 TOTAL:| $193,785.85 TOTAL: $508,269.26 TOTAL:| $ §47,900.00 TOTAL: $348,329.35 TOTAL:] $ §36,968.63 TOTAL:| § 542,847.50

Unspecified Materlals - $20,080.00 for Initial 24 month contract period,

Groups 3, § from Cole and Ferg are d n: for submitting items not meeting specifications
Group 7 from is ¢ for submitting items nat meeting specifications






