PINELLAS COUNTY GOVERNMENT, FLORIDA
Tabulation
BID # 089-0005-B (LN)
Bid Title : Towels, Paper - Miscellaneous
Date & Time Due: October 21, 2008 @ 3:00 p.m.

n Paper Group NC + FL Boritex Inc. AA Casey Co. Carlwood Safety, Inc. Dade Paper Co. Uni Paper Company E & R Industrial Sales, Inc.
EST. ANNUAL RECYCLED EXTENDED EXTENDED EXTENDED EXTENDED RECYCLED RECYCLED EXTENDED RECYCLED EXTENDED
DESCRIPTION uom QUANTITY BrAND | PART# | CONTENT | uNITPRICE PRICE BRAND | PART# | UNITPRICE PRICE BrAND | PART# | UNITPRICE |ExTENDED PRICE] BRAND | PART# | UNITPRICE PRICE BRAND | PART# | UNITPRICE PRICE BRAND | PART# | CONTENT | UNITPRICE |EXTENDED PRICE| BRAND | PART# | CONTENT | UNITPRICE PRICE BRAND | PART# | CONTENT | UNITPRICE PRICE
Post
Roll Paper Towel (Consumer
Unbleached, & x 8001t | Case 2800 |Recovered | ceorgia | 26602 Kimberly Kimberly Kimberly
Roll Materials paciic | eoopk | 15% |$  20.02|$ 56,056.00 NO BID Clark 1040 |$  9351[$ 261,828.00| clrk | Kkccowoso|$ 12575 | $352,100.00 NO BID $  3950|$ 110,600.00| Clark 1040 40% |$  48.88|$136864.00] Kic 01502 40% |$ 5558 | $155624.00
Georgia
Virgin - NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID Pacific 26602 |$  2205|$ 6174000 ) wave | uzaize - NO BID - NO BID Kic 01040 $ $120,736.00
Post
Consumer
C'F‘i“’ Paper T"“/"i.‘s‘ Recovered Georgia Georgia Georgia
1“/:? eached 10 /4" x13 | Case Materials Pacific 20603 15% |$  16.09|$ 41,834.00 NO BID Pacific 20603 |$ 2784 |$ 72,384.00 NO BID NO BID Pacific 20603 95% [$  17.99 |$  46,774.00 | Cascades | 101764 100% |$  16.22 | $ 42,172.00 cP 25100 40% |$  17.15 [ $ 44,590.00
Georgia Georgia 20603
2,600 |virgin NO BID NO BID NO BID Paciic | GPC20603| $  73.65 | $191,490.00 | Pacifc | (a46070) |$  17.21|$ 44,746.00 NO BID NO BID P 20603 $  17.15|$ 44,590.00
Post
Consumer
Roll Paper Towel Case Recovered Georgia Georgia Georgia Georgia
Unbleached, 7 7/8" x 400' Materials Pacific 26401 50% |$ 17.11[$ 15,399.00 NO BID Pacic | 26401 |$ 2848 |$ 2563200 Paciic |GPc2601|$ 6285 |$ 56,565.00 NO BID Pacific 26401 95% |$  18.18|$  16,362.00 | Cascades | 101757 | 100% |$  17.55|$ 1579500 op 26401 50% |$  17.70 | $ 15,930.00
Georga | 26401
900 |virgin - NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID Pacific | (346103 |$  17.61|$ 15849.00 - NO BID - NO BID - NO BID
Post
Disposable Paper Consumer
e tend Wi sm Case Recovered Georgia Kimberly Georgia Kimberly
Onbleached 8.1 x 16.6" Materials Pacific | 2005003 | 0% 2050 | $ 41,426.00 NO BID No Stock NO BID Clark | Kccs4790| $ 95.00 | $133,000.00 NO BID Paciic | 2005003 | 100% |$ 3170 |$  44,380.00 | clark 130 40% 2547 |$ 35658.00 NO BID
Georgia
1,400 |virgin - NO BID $  37.75| $52,850.00 NO BID NO BID Pacific | 2005003 | $  33.20 | $ 46,606.00 - NO BID -— NO BID P 20050003 M.so $ 42,840.00
Post
Consumer
Mutifold Paper Towels Recovered | Georgia Georgia Kimberly
Unbleached 9 U4 x 9 Case Materials Pacific 24590 40% |$  17.27|$ 2849550 NO BID Pacfic | 24590 |$ 3177 |$ 52420.50| Clark |kccowso4|$  57.50 | $ 94,875.00 NO BID sca MKs20A | 70% |$ 1652 [$  27,258.00 | cCascades | 101751 | 100% |$ 1548 |$ 2554200) cp 24500 40% |$  17.85|$ 29.452.50
Georgia
1,650 |virgin NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID Pacific 24590 17.89[ $ 29,518.50 NO BID NO BID NO BID
BID TOTAL BID TOTAL BID TOTAL BID TOTAL BID TOTAL BID TOTAL BID TOTAL BID TOTAL
P [POST POST
CONSUMER [CONSUMER (CONSUMER [CONSUMER [CONSUMER [CONSUMER (CONSUMER CONSUMER
RECOVERED RECOVERED [RECOVERED RECOVERED RECOVERED RECOVERED [RECOVERED RECOVERED
MATERIALS | $183,210.50 MATERIALS | NO BID MATERIALS | $ 412,264.50 MATERIALS | $ 636.540.00 MATERIALS | NO BID VATERIALS | $  134,774.00 MATERIALS | $ 256,031.00 MATERIALS | $245,596.50
BID TOTAL BID TOTAL BID TOTAL BID TOTAL BID TOTAL BID TOTAL BID TOTAL BID TOTAL
VIRGIN NO BID ViRGIN $52,850.00 VIRGIN NO BID VIRGIN $191,490.00 ViRGIN $ 198,459.50 ViRGIN NO BID VIRGIN NO BID VIRGIN $208,166.00
'ﬂDTDTAL. $183,210.50 'EDTOTAL $52,850.00 BID TOTAL:| $ 412,264.50 'EDTOTAL $828,030.00 'EDTOTAL $ 198,459.50 'EDTOTAL $ 134,774.00 BID TOTAL: | $ 256,031.00 'ﬂDTDTAL. $453,762.50




PINELLAS COUNTY GOVERNMENT, FLORIDA
Tabulation
BID # 089-0005-B (LN)

Bid Title : Towels, Paper - Miscellaneous
Date & Time Due: October 21, 2008 @ 3:00 p.m.

VENDOR NAME BID TOTAL

Southeastern Paper Group NC +

FL $ 183,210.50
Boritex Inc. $ 52,850.00
AA Casey Co. $ 412,264.50
Carlwood Safety, Inc. $ 828,030.00
Dade Paper Co. $ 198,459.50
Unisource $ 134,774.00
Peninsular Paper Company $ 256,031.00
E & R Industrial Sales, Inc. $ 453,762.50




Bid # 089-0005-B (LN)

Roll Paper Towel 12 Rolls  |Post
Unbleached, 8" x 800 ft |Per Case |Consumer
Roll Recovered $39.50 |Unisource- ($19.75 x 2)
Materials WAVE 229380
Dade Paper Company(Minimum Order
Virgin $22.05 [$350.00) 229387
PoSt
C-Fold Paper Towels, Consumer
g/r)rt')leached 10 1/4" x 1312400 Case Recovered Georgia '
Materials Pacific $16.22 |Penninsular Paper Company 229388
Virgin $17.15 |E & R Industrial Sales, Inc. 229389
Post
Consumer
Roll Paper Towel 12 Rolls Recovered Georgia
Unbleached, 7 7/8" x P Materials Pacific $17.55 [Penninsular Paper Company 229388
200" er Case
Dade Paper Company(Minimum Order
Virgin $17.61 [$350.00) 229387
PoSt
Consumer
Disposable Paper 10 boxes |Recovered Georgia
Reinforced Wipers | of 126 per |Materials Pacific $25.47 |Penninsular Paper Company 229388
Unbleached 9.1" x 16.8" Case
Virgin $30.60 |E & R Industrial Sales, Inc. 229389
PoSt
Consumer
Multi-fold Paper Towels 4.000 Per Recovered Georgia
Unbleached 9 1/4" x 9 'Case Materials Pacific $15.48 |Penninsular Paper Company 229388
1/2"
Dade Paper Company(Minimum Order
Virgin $17.89 |$350.00) 229387
Dade Paper Company 229387
E & R Industrial Sales, Inc. 229389
Penninsular Paper Company 229388

Unisource

229380
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