
 PINELLAS COUNTY GOVERNMENT, FLORIDA
Bid Tabulation
BID #: 078-0614-B (SS)
Bid Title :  Flowmeters, Parts, Repairs and Calibration (Re-Bid)
Date & Time Due:  September 18, 2008 @ 3:00 pm

GROUP 1 - ABB

ITEM DESCRIPTION
EST 24 

MONTH QTY UOM UNIT PRICE TOTAL UNIT PRICE TOTAL UNIT PRICE TOTAL
1 Hourly Shop Labor Rate (all inclusive) 80 Hour 100.00$          8,000.00$               
2 Hourly Field Labor Rate (all inclusive) 75 Hour 100.00$          7,500.00$               
3 Emergency Hourly Shop Labor Rate (all inclusive) 8 Hour 100.00$          800.00$                  

4 Emergency Hourly Field Labor Rate (all inclusive) 10 Hour 110.00$          1,100.00$               
5 Confined Space Entry (per repair – only if required) 5 Hour 200.00$          1,000.00$               

6

Annual Revalidation with Contractor review of field test 
results. Contractor shall check that field test measurements 
meet the manufacturer’s requirements for accuracy.  The 
Contractor shall provide documentation of all test 
measurements and a pass or fail status for meters in this 
category.  This is typically required for non-billing meters.  For 
scheduling purposes, meters will generally be available for 
testing at one time. 6 Each 500.00$          3,000.00$               

7

Revalidation when the County requests a single meter to be 
tested outside the annual revalidation schedule.  This must 
include a factory certificate to verify that field test 
measurements were reviewed and are within allowable 
tolerances as specified by the factory. 2 Each 1,500.00$       3,000.00$               

8

Revalidation when the County requests a single meter to be 
tested outside the annual revalidation schedule.  The 
Contractor shall provide documentation of test measurements 
and a pass or fail status.

2 Each 500.00$          1,000.00$               
GROUP 1 

TOTAL: 25,400.00$             
GROUP 1 

TOTAL: Non-Responsive
GROUP 1 

TOTAL: NO BID

ITEM DESCRIPTION  COST PLUS MARK UP  COST PLUS MARK UP  COST PLUS MARK UP
9 New Flowmeter: Vendor (not MSRP) Cost plus mark up 15%
10 Parts: Vendor (not MSRP) Cost plus mark up 15%

UNSPECIFIED WORK (24 MONTHS):  1,000.00$                 

Alpha Valve & Controls, Inc. AMJ Equipment Corp. G-Tec Equipment Services, LLC
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 PINELLAS COUNTY GOVERNMENT, FLORIDA
Bid Tabulation
BID #: 078-0614-B (SS)
Bid Title :  Flowmeters, Parts, Repairs and Calibration (Re-Bid)
Date & Time Due:  September 18, 2008 @ 3:00 pm

Alpha Valve & Controls, Inc. AMJ Equipment Corp. G-Tec Equipment Services, LLC
GROUP 2 - ISCO, AFTCO or EMCO

ITEM DESCRIPTION
EST 24 

MONTH QTY UOM UNIT PRICE TOTAL UNIT PRICE TOTAL UNIT PRICE TOTAL
1 Hourly Shop Labor Rate (all inclusive) 140 Hour 55.00$            7,700.00$                 
2 Hourly Field Labor Rate (all inclusive) 220 Hour 65.00$            14,300.00$               
3 Emergency Hourly Shop Labor Rate (all inclusive) 30 Hour 75.00$            2,250.00$                 
4 Emergency Hourly Field Labor Rate (all inclusive) 48 Hour 85.00$            4,080.00$                 
5 Confined Space Entry (per repair – only if required) 15 Hour 300.00$          4,500.00$                 

6

Annual Revalidation with Factory review of test results.  
This must include a factory certificate to verify that field test 
measurements were reviewed and are within allowable 
tolerances as specified by the factory.  This is typically required 
for all billing meters.  For scheduling purposes, meters will 
generally be available for testing at one time.

62 Each 575.00$          35,650.00$               

7

Annual Revalidation with Contractor review of field test 
results. Contractor shall check that field test measurements 
meet the manufacturer’s requirements for accuracy.  The 
Contractor shall provide documentation of all test 
measurements and a pass or fail status for meters in this 
category.  This is typically required for non-billing meters.  For 
scheduling purposes, meters will generally be available for 
testing at one time.

20 Each 550.00$          11,000.00$               

8

Revalidation when the County requests a single meter to be 
tested outside the annual revalidation schedule.  This must 
include a factory certificate to verify that field test 
measurements were reviewed and are within allowable 
tolerances as specified by the factory. 15 Each 575.00$          8,625.00$                 

9

Revalidation when the County requests a single meter to be 
tested outside the annual revalidation schedule.  The 
Contractor shall provide documentation of test measurements 
and a pass or fail status. 15 Each 550.00$          8,250.00$                 

GROUP 2 
TOTAL: NO BID

GROUP 2 
TOTAL: NO BID

GROUP 2 
TOTAL: 96,355.00$               

ITEM DESCRIPTION  COST PLUS MARK UP  COST PLUS MARK UP  COST PLUS MARK UP
10 New Flowmeter: Vendor (not MSRP) Cost plus mark up 20%
11 Parts: Vendor (not MSRP) Cost plus mark up 20%

UNSPECIFIED WORK (24 MONTHS):    10,000.00$               
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 PINELLAS COUNTY GOVERNMENT, FLORIDA
Bid Tabulation
BID #: 078-0614-B (SS)
Bid Title :  Flowmeters, Parts, Repairs and Calibration (Re-Bid)
Date & Time Due:  September 18, 2008 @ 3:00 pm

Alpha Valve & Controls, Inc. AMJ Equipment Corp. G-Tec Equipment Services, LLC

GROUP 3 - HACH

ITEM DESCRIPTION
EST 24 

MONTH QTY UOM UNIT PRICE TOTAL UNIT PRICE TOTAL UNIT PRICE TOTAL
1 Hourly Shop Labor Rate (all inclusive) 12 Hour 100.00$          1,200.00$               
2 Hourly Field Labor Rate (all inclusive) 48 Hour 100.00$          4,800.00$               
3 Emergency Hourly Shop Labor Rate (all inclusive) 10 Hour 100.00$          1,000.00$               
4 Emergency Hourly Field Labor Rate (all inclusive) 20 Hour 110.00$          2,200.00$               
5 Confined Space Entry (per repair – only if required) 7 Hour 200.00$          1,400.00$               

6

Annual Revalidation with Contractor review of field test 
results. Contractor shall check that field test measurements 
meet the manufacturer’s requirements for accuracy.  The 
Contractor shall provide documentation of all test 
measurements and a pass or fail status for meters in this 
category.  This is typically required for non-billing meters.  For 
scheduling purposes, meters will generally be available for 
testing at one time.

8 Each 1,990.00$       15,920.00$             

7

Revalidation when the County requests a single meter to be 
tested outside the annual revalidation schedule.  This must 
include a factory certificate to verify that field test 
measurements were reviewed and are within allowable 
tolerances as specified by the factory. 2 Each 1,990.00$       3,980.00$               

8

Revalidation when the County requests a single meter to be 
tested outside the annual revalidation schedule.  The 
Contractor shall provide documentation of test measurements 
and a pass or fail status. 2 Each 1,990.00$       3,980.00$               

GROUP 3 
TOTAL: 34,480.00$             

GROUP 3 
TOTAL: Non-Responsive

GROUP 3 
TOTAL: NO BID

ITEM DESCRIPTION  COST PLUS MARK UP  COST PLUS MARK UP  COST PLUS MARK UP
9 New Flowmeter: Vendor (not MSRP) Cost plus mark up 15%
10 Parts: Vendor (not MSRP) Cost plus mark up 15%

UNSPECIFIED WORK (24 MONTHS):  2,500.00$                 
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 PINELLAS COUNTY GOVERNMENT, FLORIDA
Bid Tabulation
BID #: 078-0614-B (SS)
Bid Title :  Flowmeters, Parts, Repairs and Calibration (Re-Bid)
Date & Time Due:  September 18, 2008 @ 3:00 pm

Alpha Valve & Controls, Inc. AMJ Equipment Corp. G-Tec Equipment Services, LLC
GROUP 4 - Endress & Hauser

ITEM DESCRIPTION
EST 24 

MONTH QTY UOM UNIT PRICE TOTAL UNIT PRICE TOTAL UNIT PRICE TOTAL
1 Hourly Shop Labor Rate (all inclusive) 8 Hour 38.00$           304.00$                   
2 Hourly Field Labor Rate (all inclusive) 30 Hour 85.00$           2,550.00$                
3 Emergency Hourly Shop Labor Rate (all inclusive) 8 Hour 57.00$           456.00$                   
4 Emergency Hourly Field Labor Rate (all inclusive) 18 Hour 170.00$         3,060.00$                
5 Confined Space Entry (per repair – only if required) 3 Hour 248.00$         744.00$                   

6

Annual Revalidation with Contractor review of field test 
results. Contractor shall check that field test measurements 
meet the manufacturer’s requirements for accuracy.  The 
Contractor shall provide documentation of all test 
measurements and a pass or fail status for meters in this 
category.  This is typically required for non-billing meters.  For 
scheduling purposes, meters will generally be available for 
testing at one time.

2 Each 750.00$         1,500.00$                

7

Revalidation when the County requests a single meter to be 
tested outside the annual revalidation schedule.  This must 
include a factory certificate to verify that field test 
measurements were reviewed and are within allowable 
tolerances as specified by the factory. 2 Each 750.00$         1,500.00$                

8

Revalidation when the County requests a single meter to be 
tested outside the annual revalidation schedule.  The 
Contractor shall provide documentation of test measurements 
and a pass or fail status. 2 Each 750.00$         1,500.00$                

GROUP 4 
TOTAL: NO BID

GROUP 4 
TOTAL: 11,614.00$              

GROUP 4 
TOTAL: NO BID

ITEM DESCRIPTION  COST PLUS MARK UP  COST PLUS MARK UP  COST PLUS MARK UP
9 New Flowmeter: Vendor (not MSRP) Cost plus mark up 20%
10 Parts: Vendor (not MSRP) Cost plus mark up 20%

UNSPECIFIED WORK:   750.00$                    
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 PINELLAS COUNTY GOVERNMENT, FLORIDA
Bid Tabulation
BID #: 078-0614-B (SS)
Bid Title :  Flowmeters, Parts, Repairs and Calibration (Re-Bid)
Date & Time Due:  September 18, 2008 @ 3:00 pm

Alpha Valve & Controls, Inc. AMJ Equipment Corp. G-Tec Equipment Services, LLC

GROUP 5 - Flume Open Channel with Milltronics

ITEM DESCRIPTION
EST 24 

MONTH QTY UOM UNIT PRICE TOTAL UNIT PRICE TOTAL UNIT PRICE TOTAL
1 Hourly Shop Labor Rate (all inclusive) 16 Hour 38.00$           608.00$                   
2 Hourly Field Labor Rate (all inclusive) 48 Hour 85.00$           4,080.00$                
3 Emergency Hourly Shop Labor Rate (all inclusive) 6 Hour 57.00$           342.00$                   
4 Emergency Hourly Field Labor Rate (all inclusive) 20 Hour 170.00$         3,400.00$                
5 Confined Space Entry (per repair – only if required) 10 Hour 248.00$         2,480.00$                

6

Annual Revalidation with Contractor review of field test 
results. Contractor shall check that field test measurements 
meet the manufacturer’s requirements for accuracy.  The 
Contractor shall provide documentation of all test 
measurements and a pass or fail status for meters in this 
category.  This is typically required for non-billing meters.  For 
scheduling purposes, meters will generally be available for 
testing at one time.

8 Each 750.00$         6,000.00$                

7

Revalidation when the County requests a single meter to be 
tested outside the annual revalidation schedule.  This must 
include a factory certificate to verify that field test 
measurements were reviewed and are within allowable 
tolerances as specified by the factory. 3 Each 750.00$         2,250.00$                

8

Revalidation when the County requests a single meter to be 
tested outside the annual revalidation schedule.  The 
Contractor shall provide documentation of test measurements 
and a pass or fail status. 6 Each 750.00$         4,500.00$                

GROUP 5 
TOTAL: NO BID

GROUP 5 
TOTAL: 23,660.00$              

GROUP 5 
TOTAL: NO BID

ITEM DESCRIPTION  COST PLUS MARK UP  COST PLUS MARK UP  COST PLUS MARK UP
9 New Flowmeter: Vendor (not MSRP) Cost plus mark up 20%
10 Parts: Vendor (not MSRP) Cost plus mark up 20%

UNSPECIFIED WORK (24 MONTHS):   800.00$                    

Revised 10/1/2008 078-0614-B (SS) Bid Tabulation 5



 PINELLAS COUNTY GOVERNMENT, FLORIDA
Bid Tabulation
BID #: 078-0614-B (SS)
Bid Title :  Flowmeters, Parts, Repairs and Calibration (Re-Bid)
Date & Time Due:  September 18, 2008 @ 3:00 pm

Alpha Valve & Controls, Inc. AMJ Equipment Corp. G-Tec Equipment Services, LLC

GROUP 6 - Instruments Direct

ITEM DESCRIPTION
EST 24 

MONTH QTY UOM UNIT PRICE TOTAL UNIT PRICE TOTAL UNIT PRICE TOTAL
1 Hourly Shop Labor Rate (all inclusive) 4 Hour 38.00$           152.00$                   
2 Hourly Field Labor Rate (all inclusive) 16 Hour 85.00$           1,360.00$                
3 Emergency Hourly Shop Labor Rate (all inclusive) 4 Hour 57.00$           228.00$                   
4 Emergency Hourly Field Labor Rate (all inclusive) 8 Hour 170.00$         1,360.00$                
5 Confined Space Entry (per repair – only if required) 3 Hour 248.00$         744.00$                   

7

Annual Revalidation with Contractor review of field test 
results. Contractor shall check that field test measurements 
meet the manufacturer’s requirements for accuracy.  The 
Contractor shall provide documentation of all test 
measurements and a pass or fail status for meters in this 
category.  This is typically required for non-billing meters.  For 
scheduling purposes, meters will generally be available for 
testing at one time. 2 Each 750.00$         1,500.00$                

8

Revalidation when the County requests a single meter to be 
tested outside the annual revalidation schedule.  This must 
include a factory certificate to verify that field test 
measurements were reviewed and are within allowable 
tolerances as specified by the factory. 2 Each 750.00$         1,500.00$                

9

Revalidation when the County requests a single meter to be 
tested outside the annual revalidation schedule.  The 
Contractor shall provide documentation of test measurements 
and a pass or fail status. 2 Each 750.00$         1,500.00$                

GROUP 6 
TOTAL: NO BID

GROUP 6 
TOTAL: 8,344.00$                

GROUP 6 
TOTAL: NO BID

ITEM DESCRIPTION  COST PLUS MARK UP  COST PLUS MARK UP  COST PLUS MARK UP
10 New Flowmeter: Vendor (not MSRP) Cost plus mark up 20%
11 Parts: Vendor (not MSRP) Cost plus mark up 20%

UNSPECIFIED WORK (24 MONTHS):   500.00$                    

TOTAL FOR GROUPS 1 THROUGH 6 63,380.00$            45,668.00$             106,355.00$            
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