PURCHASING

Joe Lauro, CPPO/CPPB
Director

INTEROFFICE MEMO

Lo

To: Fred E. Marquis, Interim County Admigistrator

From: Joseph Lauro, Director of Purchasing

Subject: Award of Bid — Flowmeters, Parts, Repajrs and Calibration (Re-Bid)
Contract No. 078-0614-B (SS)

Date: September 30, 2008

RECOMMENDATION: | RECOMMEND THE INTERIM COUNTY ADMINISTRATOR REJECT THE
BIDS FROM AMJ EQUIPMENT CORPORATION, LAKELAND, FLORIDA, AS NON-RESPONSIVE
FOR NOT MEETING BID SPECIFICATIONS REQUIREMENTS REGARDING PROOF OF
FACTORY TRAINING OR FACTORY CERTIFICATION FOR GROUPS 1 AND 3.

IT IS FURTHER RECOMMENDED THAT THE INTERIM COUNTY ADMINISTRATOR AWARD THE
BID FOR FLOWMETERS, PARTS, REPAIRS AND CALIBRATION WITH:

e ALPHA VALVE & CONTROLS, INC., TAMPA, FLORIDA FOR GROUPS 1 AND 3.
s G-TECH EQUIPMENT SERVICES, LLC, PLANT CITY, FLORIDA FOR GROUP 2.
o AMJ EQUIPMENT CORPORATION, LAKELAND, FLORIDA FOR GROUPS 4, 5, AND 6.

ON THE BASIS OF BEING THE LOWEST RESPONSIVE, RESPONSIBLE BIDS RECEIVED
MEETING SPECIFICATIONS. BIDS ARE ON FILE IN THE PURCHASING DEPARTMENT.

ESTIMATED ANNUAL EXPENDITURE NOT TO EXCEED: $107,701.50

ESTIMATED 24 MONTH EXPENDITURE NOT TO EXCEED: $215,403.00

Funding is provided through Utilities operating budget.

DISCUSSION: This contract is for the annua! requirements for parts, repairs, calibration and re-
validation of various electronic flowmeters throughout Pinellas County.

Contract Period: 10/6/08 THROUGH 10/5/10 [ ] N/A — One Time Purchase
Renewal Options: Terms Length of [] None
Remaining Each Term
2 12 Months

Increase Allowances:  Repair: Consumer Price Index (CPI) for all Urban Consumers, Series
Id: CUURODOSAD, Not Seasonally Adjusted, Area: U.S. city average,
ttem: All iterms, Base Period: 1982-84=100, for twelve months, or four
percent (4%), whichever is less.

Purchase: Producer Price Index (PPl), Series Id: WPU10, Not
Seasonally Adjusted Group, Metals and Metal Products, or eight percent
(8%}, whichever is less (for meters and parts only).



APPROVED: (e M %‘“

FRED E. MARQUIS
Interim County Admmlstrator

Date of Approval: /O[/ -7’!(/ O P

Attachments: 1. Contract Review
2. Bid Tabulation




CATS

PURCHASING DEPARTMENT NO.:
e CONTRACT REVIEW TRANSMITTAL -2— ({/ Z l —7
PROJECT: Flowmeters: Parts, Repairs, Calibration, and Revalidation
BID NUMBER: 07,&036’1'-'8"'(35) _ REQ. NUMBER:
CTF- (b -0 (fe-bred)
TYPE: [X] Purchase Contract | [ | Other: [_] Construction-Less than $100,000 [ ] One Time

In accordance with the policy guide for Contract Administration, the attached documents are submitted for review and comment.

Upon completion of review, complete Contract Review Transmittal and forward to next Review Authority listed. Please indicate
suggested changes by revising, in RED, the appropriate section of the document reflecting the exact wording of the change.

RISK MANAGEMENT: Please enter required liability coverage on pages: 10 and 11 PRODUCT ONLY [ ]

This is a sepié&t&al rf&,l\i’@ent contract. Estimated Expenditure: $150,0068:00° t;}_(g‘\‘;og % C}U\’A}\-—
) g

%—1 ."I;’i:lrc;z;s.ing bebt. —cj)'t(f CEMY Pfj: ¢ ]I{. ! i
Sue Steele 5 cmtracta ) bddatframdlon &3
At hoad. fleasd.
Utilities "%f ﬁﬂ%&% AL ZM;;Q‘} ?‘ﬁ%a Five f.’jzﬂc
2. Karen DeJordy — (& Y
Ken Goergen Kes Cocrest | See past Cia 13, 14, B, 16, | Comaiurs .
Z-1j-08 | 1) a%g,ﬁjz.s;zcaa z 26,29 | Qa5

Using Dept please check attached vendor-list. Circle vendors you want bids mailed to. Add additiomal
vendors with complete information (Name, Address, Phone and Fax)

’ HIGH RISK
Risk Management Cp cg(i%_, ‘ O
3. Aftn: Loretta Hunter .2,0)
{Check applicable box at right} ()5/ /. 6‘( E%TKHIGH ‘,::)'

4. Tom Crandall ‘)Q,/]

Tnterim Director Utilfities @/917/03
5.
6.
7.
*RETURN ALL DOCUMENTS TO PURCHASING**
Make all inquiries to: | Sue Steele | at Extension 44776

In order to meet the following schedule, please return your requirements to Purchasing by: May 30, 2008

1072006 (ag) - TENTATIVE DATES

Legal Ad-BID/RFP Mail Out: June 5, 2008
BID/RFP Opening: June 26, 2008
Board/County AdminfPurchasing Director Approval:




PINELLAS COUNTY GOVERNMENT, FLORIDA

Bid Tabulation

BID #: 078-0614-B (SS)

Bid Title : Flowmeters, Parts, Repairs and Calibration (Re-Bid)

Date & Time Due: September 18, 2008 @ 3:00 pm

Alpha Valve & Controls, inc.

ANJ Equipment Corp.

G-Tec Equipment Services, LLC

GROUP 1 - ABB
EST 24
ITEM DESCRIPTION MONTH QTY uom UNIT PRICE TOTAL UNIT PRICE TOTAL UNIT PRICE TOTAL
1 Hourly Shep Labor Rate {all inclusive) B0 Hour $ 100.00 | $ 8,000.00
2 Hourly Fleld Labor Rate (all inclusive) 75 Hour s 100.00 | & 7.,500.0C
3 Emergency Hourly Shop Laber Rate (all Inclusive) 8 Hour $ 100.00 1 800.00
4 Emergency Hourly Field Lakor Rate (all Inclusive) 10 Hour $ 110.00 | $ 1.100.00
5 Confined Space Entry (per repalr — only If required} 5 Hour $ 20000 ! $ 1.000.00
Annual Revalldation with Cantractor review of field test
results. Contracior shall check that field 1est megsurements
meet the manufacturer's reguirements for accuracy. The
Contractor shall provide documentation of all lest
measuraments and a pass or fail status for meters in this
category. This Is typleally required for non-bllling meters, For
scheduling purposes, meters will generally be available for
lesling at .
g |Esthastonetime 6 Each |§  500.00 | § 3,000.00
Revalldation when the Gounly requesls 8 single meler to be
tesied outsida the annval revalidation schedule, This must
include a faclory certificate ta verify that fiald test
measuremenis were feviewed and are wilhin allowable
7 tolerances as specified by the factory. 2 Each 3 1500.00 | & 3.000.00
Revafidation when the Counly requests a single meter (o be
{ested outslde the annual revalidation schedule. The
Conlractor shall provide documentation of test measurements
g [neepessorfalsaus 2 Each |5 50000 |% 1,000.00
GROUP 1 GROUP 1 GROUFP 1
TOTAL: $ 25,400.00 TOTAL:| Non-Responsive TOTAL: NO BID
ITEM DESCRIPTION COST PLUS MARK UP COST PLUS MARK UP COST PLUS MARK UP
9 New Flowmeler: Vendar (not MSRP) Cost plus mark up 15%
10 Pars: Vendor (not MSRP) Cost plus mark up 15%
UNSPECIFIED WORK (24 MONTHS): $ 1,000.00

Revised 9/29/2008

078-0614-B (S5) Bid Tabulation




PINELLAS COUNTY GOVERNMENT, FLORIDA

Bid Tabulation

BiD #: 078-0614-B (S5)

Bid Titie : Flowmeters, Parts, Repairs and Calibration (Re-Bid)

Date & Time Due: September 18, 2008 @ 3:00 pm

Alpha Valve & Confrols, Inc.

AMJ Equipment Gorp.

G-Tec Equipment Services, LLC

GROUP 2 - ISCO, AFTCO or EMCO

iTEM

DESCRIPTION

EST 24
MONTH QTY

vom

UNIT PRICE

TOTAL

UNIT PRICE

TOTAL

UNIT PRICE

TOTAL

Hourly Shop Labor Rale (afl Inclusive)

140

Hour

55.00

7,700.00

Hourly Field Labor Rate {all inclusive)

220

Hour

65.00

14,300.00

Emergency Mourly Stiop Labor Rale (all inclusive)

30

Hour

75.00

2,250.00

Emergency Hourly Fleld Labor Rate (all inclusive)

48

Hour

85.00

4,080.00

US| Wpy | —

Confined Speca Entry {per repair — only if required)

15

Hour

< |en| | eren

300.00

| en|en|er |

4,500.00

Annual Ravalldation with Factory review of test results.
This must Include a factory certicate to verify that field test
measuremenis were reviewed and are within aowabie
tolerances as spectiied by the factory. This is typlcaly required
for ak biling meters. For seheduling purposes, meters will
genarally he available for testing at one time.

62

Each

575.0C

$ 35,650.00

Annual Revalldation with Contractor review of flald test
resuits. Contractor shall check that fleld {est measurements
mest ihe manufacturer's raquirements for accusacy. The
Conlractor shall provide documentation of all test
measurements and a pass or fail slatus for meters in this
calegory. This Is typically required for non-biling meters. For
scheduling purposes, meters will generally be available for
testing at ong lime,

20

Each

550.00

$ '14,000.00

Revalidation when the Counly requests & single meter to be
\ested cutside lhe annual revakidation scheduie. This must
inclyde a factory certificate to verify that field test
measurements were reviewed and are wihin aliowable
{olerances as specified by the faclory.

15

Each

575.00

b §,625.00

Revalidation when the Counly requests a single meter tc be
tesled outside the annual revalidation schedule. The
Contractor shall provide decumentation of test measurements
and a pass or fail stalus.

15

Each

550.00

3 8,250.00

GROUP 2
TOTAL:

NGO BID

GROUP 2
TOTAL:

NC BID

GROUP 2
" TOTAL:

$ 96,355.00

ITEM

DESCRIPTION

COST PLUS MARK UP

COST PLUS MARK UP

COST PLUS MARK UP

10

New Flowmeter: Vendor (not MSRP) Cost plus mark up

20%

11

Pars' Vendeor (nol MSRP) Cost plus mark up

20%

UNSPECIFIED WORK (24 MONTHS):

$ 10,000.00

Revised 9/29/2008

078-0614-B (S5) Bid Tabulation




PINELLAS COUNTY GOVERNMENT, FLORIDA

Bid Tabulation

BID #: 078-0614-B (S8)

Bid Title : Flowmeters, Parts, Repairs and Calibration (Re-Bid)

Date & Time Due: September 18, 2008 @ 3:00 pm

1

Alpha Valve & Controls, Inc.

AMJ Equipment Corp.

G-Tec Equipment Services, LLC

GROUP 3 - HACH

EST 24
ITEM DESCRIPTION MONTH QTY UOM UNIT PRICE TOTAL UNIT PRICE TOTAL UNIT PRICE TOTAL
4 Hourly Shop Labor Rate (all inclusive) i2 Hour $ 100.00 | $ 1,200.00
2 Hourly Field Labor Rate {all inclusive) 48 Hour $ 10000 | & 4,6800.00
3 Emergency Hourly Shop Labor Rate (all inclusive) 10 Hour 3 10000 | % 1,000.C00
4 Emargency Hourly Field Labor Rate (all Inclusive) 20 Hour $ 110001 % 2,200.00
[ Confined Space Entry (per repair — only if requirad) 7 Hour $ 20000 | % 1.400.00
Annual Revalidation with Contractor review of fiald test
results. Contractor shall check thal fisld test measurements
meal the manufacturar’s requirements for accuracy. The
Conlractor shall provide documenliation of ai tesl
measuremants and a pass or fail stalus for meters in this
calegory. This Is typically required for non-biling meters. Fer
scheduling purposes, melers will generally be avaitable for
testing at one lime.
6 8 Each $ 1,89000( % 15,920.00
Revalidation when the County requests a single meler to be
lesled oulskie the apnuai revalidation schedula. This must
include a factory certificate to verify thal field test
measurements were reviewed and are wilhin alowable
7 tolerances as specified by the faclory. 2 Each $ 1,99000 1 % 3,980.00
Revalidation when the County requests a single meter lo be
{esled oulside Ihe annual revalidation schedule. The
Contracior shall provide ¢ocumentation of test measuremsnts
8 and a pass or fail status. 2 Each $ 199000 % 3,880.00
GROUP 3 GROUP 3 GROUP 3
TOTAL:| § 34,480.00 TOTAL:| Non-Responsive TOTAL: NO BID
ITEM DESCRIPTION COST PLUS MARK UP COST PLUS MARK UP COST PLUS MARK UP
9 New Flawmeter: Vendor (nol MSRP) Cost plus mark up 15%
10 Parls; Vendor {(ncl MSRP) Cosl plus mark ug 15%
UNSPECIFIED WORK (24 MONTHS): § 2,500.00

Revised 9/29/2008

078-0514-B {88) Bid Tabulaticn




PINELLAS COUNTY GOVERNMENT, FLORIDA

Bid Tabulation

BID #: 078-0614-B (SS)

Bid Title : Flowmeters, Parts, Repairs and Calibration (Re-Bid)

Date & Time Due: September 18, 2008 @ 3:00 pm

Alpha Valve & Controls, Ine.

ANJ Equipmént Corp.

G-Tec Equipment Services, LLC

GROUP 4 - Endress & Hauser

EST 24
ITEM DESCRIPTION MONTH QTY uom UNIT PRICE TOTAL UNIT PRICE TOTAL UNIT PRICE TOTAL
q Hourly Shop Labor Rale (all inclusive) 8 Haur $ 380037 % 304.00
2 Hourly Fisld Labor Rate (all inclusive) 30 Hour 3 85001 % 2,550.00
3 Emergency Hourly Shop Labor Rate (all inclusive) 8 Hour $ 57.00 % 456.00
4 Emergency Haourly Fleld Labor Rate (all inclusiva) 18 Hour $ 170.00 | § 3,060.00
5 Confined Space Entry {per repalr — only If required) 3 Hour $ 24800 | % 744.00
Annual Revalidation with Contractor review of field test
results. Contractor shall check thai fleld test measurements
maet $he manufacturer's requirements for accuracy. The
Contractor shall provide dogumentation of all 1est
measurements and a pass or fall status for meters in this
category. This is typically required for non-biling meters, For
seheduling purposes, meters will generally be available for
lesting at one time.
6 2 Each $ 75000 | % 1,50G.00
Revalidation when the County requests a single meter to be
tested ouiside the annual revalidation schedule. This must
include a factory cerlilicats to verify that fieid test
measurements wera reviewad and are within allowable
7 tolerances as specifiad by the factory. 2 Each $ 75000 | % 1,500.00
Revaiidation when the Counly requesis a single meisr 1o be
lested oulslde the annual revalidation schedufe. The
Contractor shall provide documentation of test measuremenls
8 and a pass or fall status. 2 Each $ 750.00 | § 1,500.00
GROUP 4 GROUP 4 GROUP 4
TOTAL: NO BID TOTAL! § 11,614.00 TOTAL: NC BID
ITEM DESCRIPTION COST PLUS MARK UP COST PLUS MARK UP COSTPLUS MARK UP
9 New Flowmeter: Vendor (not MSRP) Cosl plus mark up 20%
10 Parts; Vendor {(nol MSRP) Cost plus mark up 20%
UNSPECIFIED WORK: $ 750.00

Revised 9/29/2008

078-0614-B (SS) Bid Tabulation




PINELLAS COUNTY GOVERNMENT, FLORIDA
Bid Tabulation

BID #; 078-0614-B (SS)

Bid Title : Flowmeters, Parts, Repalrs and Calibration (Re-Bid)

Date & Time Due: September 18, 2008 @ 3:00 pm

Alpha Valve & Controls, Inc.

AMJ Equipment Corp.

G-Tec Equipment Services, LLC

GROUP 5 - Flume Open Channel with Militronics

EST 24
iTEM GESCRIPTION MONTH QTY uom UNIT PRICE TOTAL UNIT PRIGE TOTAL UNIT PRICE TOTAL
1 Hourly Shop Labor Rate (all inclusive) 16 Hour % 38.00 | § 608.00
2 Hourly Field Labor Rate (all inclusive) 48 Hour $ 8500 % 4,080.00
3 Ernergency Hourly Shop Labor Rate (all inclusive) [ Hour 5 570013 342.00
4 Emergency Hourly Fleld Labar Rate (all Inclusive) 20 Hour $ i70.00 | & 3,400.00
5 Confined Space Entry (psr repair — only i regulred) 10 Hour $ 248.00 | § 2,480.00
Annual Revalidatlon with Contractor review of field test
rasults, Contracter shall check that field test measurements
meel the manufaciurers requirements for accuracy, The
Contractor shall provide decumentation of ai test
measuraments and a pass or fail stalus for meters in this
category, This is typically required for non-biing meters, For
scheduling purposes, meters will generally be available for
testing at one time.
8 8 Each $ 75000 | § 6,000.00
Revalidation when ihe County requests & single meter e be
{esled outslde the annual revalidation schedule. This must
includs a factory cerlificate to verify thal field test
measurements were reviewed and are within allowable
7 lolerances as spacified by lhe factory. 3 Each % 75C0.00 1 % 2,250.00
Revalidation when the County requests a single meter to be
tested outside the annual revalidation schedule. The
Contractor shali provide documentation of test measurements
8 and a pass or fail status, <] Each $ 75000 | $ 4,500.00 )
GROUF 5 GROUP 5 GROUP 5
TOTAL: NO BID TOTAL:| § 23,660.00 TOTAL: NO BID
ITEM DESCRIPTION COST FLUS MARK UP COST PLUS MARK UP COST PLUS MARK UP
g New Flowmeter: Vendor {not MSRP) Cost plus mark up 20%
10 Parls: Vendor (not MSRF) Cost plus mark up 20%
UNSPECIFIED WORK {24 MONTHS): $ 800.00

Revised 9/29/2008

078-0614-B (S8) Bid Tabulation




PINELLAS COUNTY GOVERNMENT, FLORID

Bid Tabulation :

BID #: 078-0614-B (SS)

Bid Title ; Flowmeters, Parts, Repairs and Calibration {Re-Bid)

Date & Time Due: September 18, 2008 @ 3:00 pm

Alpha Valve & Controls, Inc.

AM.J Equipment Corp.

G-Tec Equipment Services, LLC

GROUP 6 - Instruments Direct

EST 24
ITEM DESCRIPTION MONTH QTY uom UNIT PRICE TOTAL UNIT PRICE TOTAL UNIT PRICE TOTAL
1 Hourly Shep Laber Rate (all n¢lusive) 4 Hour $ 3800 | % 152.00
2 Hourly Field Labor Rate (all Inciusiva) 16 Hour 3 85.00 | % 1,360.00
3 Emargency Hourly Shop Labor Rate (all inclusive) 4 Hour $ 5700 & 228.00
4 Emergency Hourly Fleid Labor Rate (all mclusive) 8 Hour 3 170,00 | $ 4,360.00
5 Confined Space Enlry (per repair — only if required) 3 Hour $ 24800 | % 744.00
Annual Revalidation with Contractor review of fleld test
results, Contractor shail check thal figld lest measuraments
meet the manufacturer's requirements for accuracy, The
Contraclor shall previde documentation of all test
measurements and a pass or fail status for meters in this
categery. This is lypically required for non-blling metars. For
scheduling purposes, meters will generally be avaiable for
7 tesling at one time, 2 Each $ 750.00 | % 1,500.00
Revallation when the County requests a single meler o be
tested outside tha arnual revalidation schedule. This must
include a faclory cerificale (o verify that field test
measurements wera reviewed and are within allowable
B Iolerances as specifled by the factory. 2 Each % 75000 % 1,500.00
Revalidation when the Counly requests a singla meter lo be
tesled outiside the annual revalldation schedule. The
Contractor shall provide documentation of test measurements .
g and a pass or fall siatus, 2 Each $ - 75000 % 1,500.00
GROUP 6 GROUP 6 GROUP 6
TOTAL: NO BID TOTAL:| § 8,344.00 TOTAL: NQ BID
ITEM DESCRIPTION COST PLUS MARK UP COST PLUS MARK UP COST PLUS MARK UP
10 New Flowmeter; Vendor {not MSRP) Cost plus mark up 20%
11 Parts: Vendor (not MSRP) Cost plus mark up 20%
UNSPECIFIED WORK (24 MONTHS): 3 500.00
TOTAL FOR GROUPS 1 THROUGH 6 $ 653,380.00 3 45,668.00 $ 106,355.00
G

Revised 9/29/2G08

078-0614-B (53) Bid Tabulation




