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| COUNTY COMMISSIONERS | R L Y At
BOARD OF COUNTY COMMISSIONERS

DATE:  November 18, 2008

AGENDA ITEM NO. lo
Consent Agenda E{ egular Agenda ] Public Hearing [ ] .

County Administrator’s Signatu

Subject:

Award of Bid - Fuel: Gasoline and Diesel (Co-Op)
Contract No. 078-0533-B (SS)

Department: Staff Member Responsible:
Fleet Management / Purchasing Keith Grant / Joe Lauro

Recommended Action:

I RECOMMEND THE BOARD OF COUNTY COMMISSIONERS (BOARD) REJECT THE BID FROM INDIGO
ENERGY PARTNERS, LLC., ALPHARETTA, GEORGIA, ON THE BASIS OF BEING NON-RESPONSIVE FOR
NOT MEETING BID CONDITIONS.

IT IS FURTHER RECOMMENDED THE BOARD AWARD THE BID FOR FUEL, GASOLINE AND DIESEL, TO
THE FOLLOWING VENDORS FOR THE SPECIFIC GROUPS AS FOLLOWS:

[TEM
BIDDER L DESCRIPTION TYPE
B. V. OIL COMPANY,
G, DERAL FLORA 4 | BIODIESEL FUEL — B 5 BLEND TANK WAGON
TANK WAGON
1 | 87 OCTANE GASOLINE
| TRANSPORT
5 ULTRA LOW SULFUR DIESEL NO.2 (15 | TANKWAGON
J. H. WILLIAMS OIL PPM, ON ROAD USE)
COMPANY, INC., ‘ TRANBRORT
TAMPA, FLORIDA
, | ULTRALOW SULFUR DIESEL FUEL NO. 2 | TANKWAGON
(OFF-ROAD, RED DYED) - S RANGPERT
5 | BIODIESEL FUEL — B 20 BLEND TANK WAGON
PORT CONSOLIDATED, 4 | BIODIESEL FUEL —B 5 BLEND TRANSPORT
INC., FT. LAUDERDALE,
FLORIDA 5 | BIODIESEL FUEL — B 20 BLEND TRANSPORT
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Summary Explanation/Background:

This is a cooberative bid administered by Pinellas County for the estimated annual requirement of fuel. There are
twelve governmental entities participating in the cooperative bid. The participants are:

1. City of Clearwater 7. City of Oldsmar

2. City of Dunedin 8. City of Pinellas Park

3. City of Gulfport 9. City of St. Petersburg

4, City of Indian Rocks Beach 10. Palm Harbor Fire Rescue

5. City of Largo 11. Pinellas County Board of County Commissioners
6. City of Madeira Beach | 12. St. Petersburg College

This contract has the following terms and conditions:

1. Average Base Price: All prices will be based on Port of Tampa Florida average terminal rack prices
published daily per the Oil Pricing Information Service (OPIS), United Publications.

2. Fixed Fee Per Gallon: Freight charges, (delivery fees per gallon), are adjustable (decrease or increase) at
three (3) month intervals after the date of the award and at three (3) month intervals thereafter for the life of
the contract based on CPI Index Gasoline (all types), All Urban consumers, Not Seasonally Adjusted, U.S.
City Average, Transportation, Base Period:1982-84=100.

3. Period of Contract: This is a twelve (12) month contract, effective December 16, 2008 through December
15, 2009.

4. Option of Renewal: The contract may be renewed four (4) additional twelve (12) month periods, pending
availability of funds and approval by the County Administrator.

Both the Purchasing and Fleet Management Departments have researched the use of alternative fuel purchasing
strategies and determined that the guidelines set forth in this contract best represent the needs and interest of the
County in the current economic climate. Included in this award are the requirements per federal mandate for the
use of ultra low sulfur diesel (USLD) (award items 2 & 3) and bio diesel (award items 4 & 5) which is representative
of Pinellas County's commitment to the use of alternative and environmentally safe fuels.

Fiscal Impact/Cost/Revenue Summary:
COOPERATIVE (COOP) ANNUAL ESTIMATED AWARD AMOUNT: $10,459,013.00

PINELLAS COUNTY'S ANNUAL ESTIMATED EXPENDITURE NOT TO EXCEED: $ 5,559,332.00
TOTAL ANNUAL ESTIMATED EXPENDITURE NOT TO EXCEED: $16,018,345.00
Funding for Pinellas County is budgeted in Fleet Management's operating expenses.

Each Entity will be responsible for funding their portion of this contract.

Exhibits/Attachments Attached:

1. Contract Review
2. Bid Tabulation
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PURCHASING §

PURCHASING DEPARTMENT
CONTRACT REVIEW TRANSMITTAL

CATS
NO.:

26540

PROJECT: Fuel: Gasoline and Diesel (Co-op)

BID NUMBER: 078-0533-B (SS)

REQ. NUMBER:

TYPE: [X] Purchase Contract |[_| Other:

[ ] Construction-Less than $100,000

[ ] One Time

In accordance with the policy guide for Contract Administration, the attached documents are submitted for review and comment.

Upon completion of review, complete Contract Review Transmittal and forward to next Review Authority listed. Please indicate
suggested changes by revising, in RED, the appropriate section of the document reflecting the exact wording of the change.

RISK MANAGEMENT: Please enter required liability coverage on pages: 22 and 23

This is a@gm&amuaﬂeneﬂim&requirement contract. Estimated Expenditure: $17,000,000

Purchasing Dept.
Sue Steele

PRODUCT ONLY []

Fleet Mgmt
2. Director: Keith Grant

Using Dept please check attached vendorlist. Circie-vendors you want bids mailed to. Add additional
vendors with complete information (Name, Address, Phone and Fax)

R HIGH RISK

Risk Management Y D(

3. Attn: Loretta Hunter
(Check applicable box at right) (g EI%I};HIGH

4.

5.
6.
7.

**RETURN ALL DOCUMENTS TO PURCHASING**

Make all inquiries to: ] Sue Steele, CPPB, Procurement Analyst

| at Extension 44776

In order to meet the following schedule, please return your requirements to Purchasing by: 8/15/08

10/2006 (ag)

TENTATIVE DATES

Legal Ad-BID/RFP Mail Out:

BID/RFP Opening:

Board/County Admin/Purchasing Director Approval:




PINELLAS COUNTY GOVERNMENT, FLORIDA 4 )

Tabulation

BID # 078-0533-B (SS)

Bid Title : Fuel: Gasoline and Diesel (Co-op)

Date & Time Due: October 14, 2008 @ 3:00 p.m.

J. H. Williams Oll Co, Ipc

Lykins Oil Company

Gasoline, Regular Unleaded

1 |Minimum 87 Octane 0.0975 0.0575 0.37 .105 gallon|.045 gallon
Ultra Low Sulfur Diesel No. 2 (156

2 |PPM), On Road use 0.0925 0.0575 0.38 -105 gallon|.045 gallon
Ultra Low Sulfur Diesel Fuel No. 2,

3 |Off-Road, Red Dyed 0.0575 0.38 = No Bid|No Bid

4 |Biodiesel Fuel - B6 Blend 0.0875 No Bid No Bid No Bid

5 |Biodiesel Fuel - B 20 Blend | 0.2575| 0.1475 No Bid No Bid|No Bid

General Information That Will Not Be Used In The Bid Summary: ’ r

In case of weather emergencies,
Entities may be required to have a
loaded transport trailer dropped at
one or several locations. Please
indicate if this is a service you can
provide and the demurrage cost
6 |per day tanker. Not Available N/A Cannot provide|]  services are not available

Drop Charges/Split Fee Delivery
{(delivery of product to two (2)
7 |different locations) $90.00 transport & tankwagon $50.00 $35.00 $40.00

Pump Fee (delivery of product for
elevated above ground storage

8 |tanks) $90.00 transport only $30.00 $35.00 $40.00
Fixed Delivery Fee for other depending on fuel it will be
9 |Fuels Not Listed N/A N/A similar as above
Option 1:
Price Per Gallon Percent Price Per Gallon |Percent Price Per Gallon Price Per Gallon |Percent
Discount Discount Discount Discount Discount Percent Discount [[Discount Discount
Net OPIS pricing 10-Days Gasoline
10 |87 Octane $0.00 0% N/A 0%
Net OPIS pricing 10-Days Diesel
11 |Uitra Low Sulfur No.2 $0.00 0% N/A 0%

Non-Responsive - indigo Energy Partners, LLC




PINELLAS COUNTY GOVERNMENT, F

Tabulation

BID # 078-0533-B (SS)

Bid Title : Fuel: Gasoline and Diesel (C

Date & Time Due: October 14, 2008 @

Gasoline,
Minimum 87 Octane

Petroleum Traders
orati

No Bid

+.2899

+.055

.355

Ultra Low Sulfur Diesel No. 2 (15
PPM), On Road use

No Bid

+.2875

+.055

.325

3

Ultra Low Sulfur Diesel Fuel No. 2,
Off-Road, Red Dyed

No Bid

+.2875

4

Biodiesel Fuel -B 5 Blend

No Bid

+.3166

+ .21

.355

5

Biodiesel Fuel - B 20 Blend

T

No Bid

+.3684

+ .16

455

General Information That Will Not Be Used

In case of weather emergencies,
Entities may be required to have a
loaded transport trailer dropped at
one or several locations. Please
indicate if this is a service you can
provide and the demurrage cost
per day tanker.

Price to be negotiated aj
current market pric

$1,500.00

N/A

Drop Charges/Split Fee Delivery
{delivery of product to two (2)
different locations)

$40.00

$0

$.02 per gallon

8

Pump Fee (delivery of product for
elevated above ground storage
tanks)

$40.00

$0

$42.50 per delivery

9

Fixed Delivery Fee for other
Fuels Not Listed

+.3500

N/A

N/A

Option 1:

Price Per Gallon
Discount

Percent
Discount

Price Per Gallon
Discount

Percent
Discount

Percent
Discount

Price Per Gallon
Discount

10

Net OPIS pricing 10-Days Gasoline
87 Octane

$ 0.010

k!

Net OPIS pricing 10-Days Diesel
Ultra Low Sulfur No.2

$ 0.010

Non-Responsive - Indigo Energy P






