PINELLAS COUNTY GOVERNMENT, FLORIDA

Tabulatlon
BID # 078-0533-B (SS)

Bid Title : Fuel: Gasoline ai and Diesel (Co-op)

Date & Time Due: October 14, 2008 @ 3:00 p.m.

Gasollne, Regular Unleaded '
Minimum 87 Octane

BV Oll Company, Iné: i

Central Oil Inc.
KNS

Uitra Low Sulfur Diesel No. 2 (15
PPM), On Road use

0.0575]|

3

Ultra Low Sulfur Diesel Fuel No. 2,
Off-Road, Red Dyed

4

Biodiesel Fuel -B 5 Blend

Biodiesel Fuel - B 20 Blend

0.0925
0.1575

0.0575

0.0875
0.2575 0.1475

General Information That Will Not Be Used

In case of weather emergencies,
Entities may be required to have a
loaded transport trailer dropped at
one or several locations. Please
indicate if this is a service you can
provide and the demurrage cost
per day tanker.

In The Bid Summary:

o J H Wllllams Oil Co, lnc

+.0190

.105 gallon

.045 gallon

+.0190

.105 gallon

.045 gallon

+.0190
+.0750

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

+.0500

No Bid

No Bid

Not Availablelf

N/A

Cannot provide

services are not available |

Drop Charges/Split Fee Delivery
(delivery of product to two (2)
different locations)

$90.00 transport & tankwagon

8

9

Pump Fee (delivery of product for
elevated above ground storage
tanks)

$80.00 transport only

$50.00

$35.00

$40.00 |

~ $30.00

$35.00

$40.00

Fixed Delivery Fee for other
Fuels Not Listed

N/A

N/A

depending o

similar as above

n fuel it will be

Fption 1:

10

Price Per Gallon
Discount

Percent
Discount

Percent
Discount

Price Per Gallon
Discount

Price Per Gallon
Discount

Percent Discount

Price Per Gallon
Discount

Percent
Discount

|Niet OPIS pricing 10-Days Gasoline

87 Octane

$0.00

0%

N/A

0%

11

Net OPIS pricing 10-Days Diesel
Ultra Low Sulfur No.2

$0.00

0%

N/A

0%

Non-Responsive - Indigo Energy Partners, LLC
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078-0533-B (SS) Bid Tab



PINELLAS COUNTY GOVERNMENT, F

Tabulation

BID # 078-0533-B (SS)
Bid Title : Fuel Gasoline and Diesel (C
Date & Time Due: October 14, 2008 @ :

Petroleum Traders

Corporation N

Port Consohdated Inc

Quick Fuel

Soas i HEE R
egular Unleaded
1 |Minimum 87 Octane No Bid|+ .2899
Ultra Low Sulfur Diesel No. 2 (15
2 |PPM), On Road use No Bid|+.2875 +.19 +.055 .325 .085
Ultra Low Sulfur Diesel Fuel No. 2,
3 |Off-Road, Red Dyed No Bid|+ .2875 .355
4 |Biodiesel Fuel - B § Blend No Bid|+.3166 +.21 +.04 115
5 |Biodiesel Fuel - B 20 Blend | No Bid|+.3684 +.16 . +.029 455
General Information That Will Not Be Used ]
In case of weather emergencies,
Entities may be required to have a
loaded transport trailer dropped at
one or several locations. Please
indicate if this is a service you can
provide and the demurrage cost Price to be negotiated aj
6 |per day tanker. current market pric $1,500.00 N/A
' Drop Charges/Split Fee Delivery
(delivery of product to two (2)
7 |different locations) $40.00 $0 $.02 per galion|
Pump Fee (delivery of product for
elevated above ground storage
8 |tanks) $40.00 $0 $42.50 per delivery
Fixed Delivery Fee for other '
9 |Fuels Not Listed - +.3500 N/A N/A
Option 1: - L
Price Per Gallon |Percent Price Per Gallon |Percent |Price Per Gallon |Percent
Discount Discount Discount Discount Discount Discount
Net OPIS pricing 10-Days Gasoline | i o '
10 |87 Octane R 0.010
Net OPIS pricing 10-Days Diesel
11 |Ultra Low Sulfur No.2 $ 0.010

Non-Responsive - Indigo Energy P

Revised 11/5/2008
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