
BOARD OF COUNTY COMMISSIONERS 
DATE: March 3,2009 
AGENDA ITEM NO. 18. 

Consent Agenda Regular Agenda Public Hearing 

J Countv Administrator's Sinnature:u 

Subiect: 

Award of Bid - Herbicides, Insecticides & Other Chemical Products (Co: . 

Contract No. 078-0481-B (MW) 7 
/ 

Department: Staff Member Responsible: 

Public Works Operations Department / Purchasing Pete Yauch / Joe Lauro 

Recommended Action: 
I liECOMklEG2 THE BOARD OF COUNTY COMMISSIONERS (BQAPOj nln,l.\RD THE R!D FnP HERBICIDES, 
INSECTICIDES AND OTHER CHEMICAL PRODUCTS (CO-OP) 

VENDOR 
AGRO DISTRIBUTION, LLC, DBA PRO SOURCE ONE 
PLANT CITY, FLORIDA 
B & G CHEMICALS & EQUIPMENT CO., INC. 
DALLAS, TEXAS 
CROP PRODUCTION SERVICES, INC. 
(FORMERLY UAP DISTRIBUTION, INC.) 
MULBERRY, FLORIDA 
HELENA CHEMICAL COMPANY 
DADE CITY, FLORIDA 

LESCO, INC. 
CLEVELAND, OHIO 
NATURCHEM, INC. 
LEXINGTON, SOUTH CAROLINA 
RED RIVER SPECIALTIES, INC. 
BRANFORD, FLORIDA 
UNIVAR USA INC. 
ORLANDO, FLORIDA 
LlNE ITEMS NOT AWARDED DUE TO NO BIDS, NO 
LONGER BEING MANUFACTURED IN UNIT OF MEASURE 
DESIRED, OR IN THE BEST INTEREST OF THE COUNTY. 
THESE REMAINING ITEMS WILL BE PURCHASED VIA 
QUOTATION IF AVAILABLE OR ON THE OPEN MARKET. 

BY LlNE ITEM TO THE FOLLOWING VENDORS: 
ITEM(S) NUMBER 

4,5, 10, 11, 13,23,24,27,28,38,40,43,52, 
68, 73, 80, 84, 87, 88, 91 

67,98 

22,41,49 
8, 9, 12, 14, 17, 25, 26,29, 31, 35,46, 50, 51, 
53, 54, 55, 56, 58, 59, 60, 64, 65, 66, 71, 79, 
82, 83, 86, 94 

2, 30, 45, 47, 70 

7 ,  15, 20, 21, 36, 37, 48, 89, 90, 93, 95 

3,6, 16, 18, 19,34,42,44,74,75 

1, 61, 62, 63,69, 72, 77, 96, 97, 99 

57, 78, 81, 85 

ON THE BASIS OF BEING THE LOWEST RESPONSIBLE, RESPONSIVE BIDS RECEIVED. BIDS ARE ON FILE 
IN THE PURCHASING DEPARTMENT. 
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IT IS FURTHER RECOMMENDED THAT THE BOARD CONDUCT A PUBLIC DRAWING TO DETERMINE AWARD 
OF THE FIVE (5) TIE BlDS IN ACCORDANCE WITH COUNTY CODE NO. 2-176. THE CODE STATES THAT IF 
TWO (2) OR MORE BlDS ARE RECEIVED FOR THE SAME TOTAL AMOUNT OR UNIT PRICE, QUALITY AND 
SERVICE BEING EQUAL, THE CONTRACT SHALL BE AWARDED BY DRAWING LOTS IN PUBLIC. 

VENDOR 
HELENA CHEMICAL COMPANY 
CROP PRODUCTION SERVICES, INC. 
(FORMERLY UAP DISTRIBUTION, INC.) 
HELENA CHEMICAL COMPANY 
CROP PRODUCTION SERVICES, INC. 
(FORMERLY UAP DISTRIBUTION, INC.) 
AGRO DISTRIBUTION, LLC, DBA PRO SOURCE ONE 
HELENA CHEMICAL COMPANY 
CROP PRODUCTION SERVICES, INC. 
(FORMERLY UAP DISTRIBUTION, INC.) 
AGRO DISTRIBUTION, LLC, DBA PRO SOURCE ONE 
HELENA CHEMICAL COMPANY 
LESCO, INC. 
AGRO DISTRIBUTION, LLC, DBA PRO SOURCE ONE 
HELENA CHEMICAL COMPANY 
LESCO, INC. 

Summary Ex~lanationlBackground: 

This is a cooperative bid administered by Pinellas County that includes the cities of Dunedin, Clearwater, Indian 
Rocks Beach, Oldsmar, and St. Petersburg. This bid is for the purchase and delivery of herbicides, insecticides, 
and other chemical products on an as needed basis.- 

This is a twenty-four (24) month contract with two (2) twelve (12) month options for renewal. Pricing shall be held 
firm for the first four (4) months of the initial twenty-four (24) month contract period. Thereafter price adjustments 
may occur every four (4) months not to exceed the average of the Producers Price Index (PPI) PCU3253 Pesticide, 
Fertilizer, and Other Agricultural Chemical Manufacturer. Renewal options shall be exercised only if all terms and 
conditions remain the same, and the County Administrator or Director of Purchasing grants approval. 

Fiscal lmpacffCosffRevenue Summary: 

ITEM(S) NUMBER 

32 -TIE (AGENCY PRICING) 

33 - TIE (AGENCY PRICING) 

39 -TIE (AGENCY PRICING) 

76 - TIE (AGENCY PRICING) 

92 - TIE (AGENCY PRICING) 
- 

~ 
PINELLAS COUNTY TOTAL ESTIMATED TWENTY-FOUR (24) MONTH EXPENDITURE ~ NOT TO EXCEED: $572,110.60 

I 
CO-OP TOTAL ESTIMATED TWENTY-FOUR (24) MONTH EXPENDITURE NOT TO EXCEED: $364,650.00 

I 

TOTAL ESTIMATED TWENTY-FOUR (24) MONTH EXPENDITURE NOT TO EXCEED: $936,760.60 

Funding for Pinellas County's requirements is provided through the various user departments general operating 
I funds. CO-OP members are responsible for their own funding and purchases. 





PINELLAS COUNTY GOVERNMENT, FLORIDA 
BID TABULATION # 078-0481-8 (MW) 
Bid Title : Herbicides - Insecticides &Other Chemical Products (CO-OP) 
Date &Time Due: November 04.2008 @ 3:OO am. 

13 Milestone VM (DowAgro) 40 gal cntr DowAgro $725 00 $29,000 00 DOW AGRO ~ l l e s t o  001 $748 00 / $29.920 00 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID 

14 

15 

16 

17 

18 
$9 
20 
21 

MSMA (aka MSMS) (Helena) 

Octane 2% SC (Sepro) 

Plateau (BASF) 

Ronstar ti (Bayer) 

Round-up 41% actlve lngred~ent (Monsanto) 
Round-up Pro (Monsanto) 
Round-up Pro (Monsanto) 
Round-up Pro (Monsanto) 

50 

18 
so - - 
62 

12 
320 
115 
16 

2 5 gal. cntr 

Case 12 8 oz cntrs 

1 gal cntr 

50 Ib bag 

30 gal cntr 
1 gal cntr 

Case 2 2 5 gal cntrs 
30 gal cntr 

Generic 

Sepro 

Generrc 

Gener~c 

Generlc 
Generrc 
Generrc 
Generrc 

NO BID 

$456 00 

NO BID 

NO BID 

NO BID 
NO BID 
NO BID 
NO BID 

NOBID 

$ 2  6 
NO BID 
--- 
NO BID 

NO BID 
NO BID 
NO BID 
NO BID 

HELENA 

SEPRO 
-. .5. 
Bayer 

NO BID 
NO BID 

Monsanto 
Momanto 

Octane 001 

Plateau 226 

Chrpco633 

I NO BID 
/ NO BID 
Poundup I30  

oundup 131 

$48 75 

$529.20 
$270.00 

$71 50 

NO BID 
NO BID 
$201 25 

$1,178 80 

NO BID 

Bld Error 
- - 

BAYtR 

NO BID 
NO BID 
Brd Error 

MONSANlO 

---- 
$2437.50 ---- 
$9,525 60 

$16,200 00 ---- 
$4,433.00 ---- 
NO BID 
NO BID 

$23,143 75 
$18,860 80 

NO BID 

Bid Error 

NO BID 

425100 

NO BID 
NO BID 
Bld Error 

641901 

NO BID 

Brd Error 
NO BID 

$81 85 

NO BID 
NO BID 
Brd Error 
$1,326.00 

NO BID 

Brd Error 

NO BID 

$5,074 70 

NO BID 
NO BID 

$21,216 00 







UNSPECIFIED MONIES $30,000 
(Allocated Proportionately) $8,700.00 $11,500.00 $ 600.00 

Total Break 
PW Breakdown $ 321,442.96 

County Breakdown $ 145,694.53 
Coop Breakdown $ 259,676.89 

Notes: 

159 neither made bv Baver I 
195 now called Subdue Maxx (SYNGENTA) I 
lnd~vidual prrcing errors can not be corrected - llne totalsicalculations can be corrected 

Univar - pricing error line Item 20 - unable to change ind~vidual prices 

Yellow l~nes -no b~ds rece~ved for Items In Groups 1 thru 6 
Aaencv Prrcrnq Tied L~ne Items 32. 33 39. 76. 92 /Tied Amounts I 

Line 921-1 



1 PINELLAS COUNTY GOVERNMENT, FLORIDA 
BID TABULATION # 078.048l.B (MW) 
8 id  Title : Herblcldes - Insecticides g Other Chemical Products (CO-OP) 

TOTAL 
EXTENSION 

NO BID 

NO BID 

$2g:126 00 

NO BID 

NO BID 

$5,392 50 

$45.950 00 

NO BID 

NO BID - 
NO BID 

NO BID 

NO BID 

$30,498 00 

NO BID 

NO BID 

NO BID 
NO BID 

Generlc 
NO BID 
Generlc 
Genenc 

NO BID 

NO BID 
NO BiD 
Genenc 

$6,406 25 

NO BID 

NO BID 

NO BID 

$117,372.75 

TOTAL 
EXTENSION 

Genertc 

Generic 

NO BID 
NO BID 

MFG. 

NOBID 

NOBID 

DOW AGRO 

NOBID 

NO BID 

DOW AGRO 

DOW AGRO 

NOBID 

NOBID 

NOBID 

NOBID 

NO BID 

DOW AGRO 

NOBID 

NOBID 

NOBID 

NOBID 
Gener~c 
NO BID 

Generic 
~enenc 

NOBID 

NOBID 

NOBID 

Genenc 

Nufarm 

MFG. 
Ge"r'c 

Gewrlc 

NOBID 
NO BID 

Date B Tlme Due: November 04,2008 @ 3.00 p.m. 

TOTAL 
EXTENSION 

NO BID 

NO BID 
Generic 

NO BID 

NO BID 
Generic 

NO BID 

NO BID 

NO BID 

NO BID 

NO BID 

NO BID 

NO BID 
Genenc 

NO BID 
Generic 

NO BID 

NO BID 

NO BID 
Genenc 
Generic 

NO BID 

NO BID 

NO BID 
Generic 

NO BID 

NO BID 

NO BID 

NO BID 

$0.00 

TOTAL 
EXTENSION 

NO BID 

NO BID 

NO BID 
NO BID 

GROUP 

1 

2 

3 

4 

6 

7 
8 

g 

10 

11 

12 

$3 - 
14 

15 

l g  

17 

18 
19 

20 
21 

23 

24 
25 

26 

27 

28 

29 

GROUP 

30 

34 

32 
33 

EST, 
%-MONTH 
QUANTIN 

24 

50 

200 

95 

30 

30 

200 

260 

20 

30 

30 

130 

40 

50 

18 
60 

62 

12 
320 

115 
16 

DEANGELO 

PART# 

NOBID 

NOBID 
EPA62719-40 

NOBID 

NOBID 
EPA 62719-37 

EPA62719-527 

NOBD 

NOBID 

NOBID 

NOBID 

NOBID 

EPA62719-537 

NOBID 

NOBID 

NOBID 

NOBID 

Genenc 
NOEID 
Generic 
~eneric 

NOBID 

NOBID 

Generlc 

EPA228-520 

NOBID 

NO BID 

NOBID 

PART# 
Generic 

Generic 

NOBID 
NOBID 

ALLIGARE LLC 

UNIT PRICE 
(per UOM) 

NO BID 

NO BID 
Generic 

NO BID 

NO BID 
Generic 

NO BID 
NO BID 

NO BID 

NO BID 

NO BID 

NO BID 

NO BID 
Generic 

NO BID 
Generic 

NO BID 

NO BID 
NO BID 
Genenc 
tienenc 

NOBID 

NO BID 

NO BID 
Genenc 

NO BID 

NO BID 

NO 810 

NO BID 

~ m u p  I Total 

UNIT PRICE 
(per UOM) 

NO BID 

NO BID 

NO BID 
NO BID 

MFG. 

NOBID 

NO BID 
Gexnc 

NO BID 

NOBID 
Generic 

NO BID 

NO BID 

NOBID 

NO BID 

NOBID 

NOBID 

NO BID 
Generic 

NO BID 
Gener~c 

NOBID 

NOBID 
NOBID 
Genenc 
Generlc 

NO BID 

NOBID 

NOBID 
Genenc 

NOBID 

NOBID 

NO= 
NOBID 

MFG. 

NO BID 

NO BID 

NOBID 
NOBID 

DESCRIPTION 
1 . HERBICIDES 

Chelated liquld lron 

Unve 75DF wetable dry granules (BASF) 

tlement 4 (Dow Agro) (Garlon 4 generic) 

tinale (Bayer) 

5FusiladBII,TgO0 
Garlon 3A (DowAgro) 

Garlon 4 ULTRA (DowAgro) 

Helosate (Helm Agro) (Roundup genenc) 

Helosate (Helm Agro) (Roundup generic) 

iiloxan 3 EC (Bayer) 

Image 70 uti (eAStj 

Kerb 5OWP (UowAgro) 

Milestone VM (DowAgro) 

lClSMA (aka MSMS) (Helena) 

octane 2% S c  (sepro) 

Plateau (BASF) 

Konstar ti (Bayer) 

Round up 41% active ingredient (Monsanto) 
-- 

Round up Pro (Monsanto) 
Round-up Pro (Monsanto) 
Round-up Pro (Monsanto) 

Isedgehammer (Gowan) 

sencor 75 I & O  (iurf & Ornamental) (Bayer) 

Snapshot, pre-emergent (DowAgro) 

Surilan AS (UowAgro) 

Tahoe 3A (Nutarm) 

Trimec Classic (Gordon) 

Trimec Plus (Gordon) 

lrimec Southern (Gordon) 

2 -HERBICIDES - AQUATICS 

DESCRIPTION 
Aquastar (Rodeo generic) (Albaugh) 

Aquastar (Rodeo genenc) (Albaugh) 

Aquathol Granular Super K (Ceraxagroj agency prlclng 
Aquathol K (Ceraxagro) (agency pric~ng) 

BROTHERS, INC. 

UNIT PRICE 
(per UOM) 

NO BID 

NO BID 

$145 63 

NO BID 

NO BID 

$179 75 

$229 75 

NO BID 

NO BID 

NO BID 
NO BID 

NO BID 

$762 45 

NO BID 

NO BID 

NO BID 
NO BID 

Generic 
NO 810 
Genenc 
Genenc 

NO BID 

NO BID 

NO BID 

Generic 

$256 25 

NO BID 

NO BID 

NO BID 

Group 1 Total. 

UNIT PRICE 
(per UOM) 

tienenc 

Generic 

NO BID 
NO BID 

PART# 

NOBID 

NOBID 
Generic 

NOBID 

NO BID 
Generic 

NO BID 

NOBID 

NOBID 

NOBID 

NO BID 

NO BID 

NO BID 
Generic 

NOBID 
Generic 

NO BID 

NOBID 

NOBID 
Gener~c 
Gener~c 

NOBID 

NO BID 

NOBID 
Generic 

NOBID 

NOBID 

NOBID 

NOBID 

PART# 

NOBID 

NOBID 

NOBD 
NOBID 

21 

30 

15 

21 

25 

53 

LY 

53 

EST. 
ZCMONTH 
QUANTIN 

80 

86 

420 
340 

UOM 

gal cntr 

1 Ib bag 

2 5 gal cntr 

5 gal 

-7@G%- 
2 5 gal cntr 

2 5 ~ 1  cntr 

25ga l  cntr 
30ga1 drum 

1 gal. cntr 

l1 430z 

3 Ib bag 

2 5 gal cntr 

2 5 gal cntr 

Case 12 8 oz cntrs 

1 gal cntr 

50 Ib bag 

-- 30 gal cntr. 
1 g a l r  

Case 2 2 5 gal cnts 
30 gal cntr 

TOTAL 
EXTENSION 

NO BID 

NO BID 

NO 810 

NO BID - - - - - - - - - - - - -  
NO BID 

NQ BID 

NO BID 

NO BID 

NO 810 

NO BID 

NO BID 

NO BID 

NO BID 

NO BID 

NO BID 

NO BID 

NO BID 

NO BID 
NO BID 
NO BID 
NO BID 

MOSQUITO CONTROL 

UNIT PRICE 
(per UOM) 

NO BID 

NO BID 

NO BID 

NO BID 

NO BID 

NO BID 

NO BID 

NO BID 

NO BID 

NO BID 

NO BID 

NO BID 

NO BID 

NO BID 

NO BID 

NO BID 

NO BlO 1 
NO BID 
NO BID 
NO BID 
NO BID 

MFG. 

NO BID 

NO BID 

NO BID 

NO BID 

NO BID 

NO $ID 

NO @ID 

NO BID 

NO BID 

NO BID 
NO BID 

NO BID 

NO BID 

NO BID 

NO BID 

NO 

NO BID 

NO BID 
NO BID 
NO BID 
NO BID 

Case 10 1 3ozcnlrs 

5 Ib bag 

50 Ib bag 

2 5 gal cntr 

Case 2 2 5 gal 

2 5 gal cntr 

2 5 gal cntr 

2 5 gal cntr 

UOM 
2 5 gal cntr 

3u gal 

25 1b pall 
2 5 gal cnlr 

CROP 

MFG. 

NO BID 

NO BID 

DOW 

BAYER 

DOW 

DOW 
NO BID 

NO BID 

BAYER 
NO BID 

NO BID 

DOW 

NO BID 

sepro 
BAS1 

BAYER 

NO BID 
NO BID 

Monsanto 
Monsanto 

CLARKE 

PART# 

NO BID 

NO BID 

NO BID 

NO BID 

NO BID 

NO BID 

NO BID 

NO BID 

NO BID 

NO BID 

NO BID 

NO BID 

NO BID 

NO BID 

NO BID 

NO BID 
NO BID 

NO BID 
NO BID 
NO BID 
NO 

PRODUCTION 

PART# 

NO BID 

NO BID 

NO BID 

NO BID 

NO BID 

NO BID 

NO BID 

NO BID 
NO BID 

NO BID 

NO BID 

NO BID 

NO BID 

NO BID 

NO BID 

NO BID 

NO BID 

$0.00 

TOTAL 
EXTENSION 

NO BID 

NO BID 

NO BID 
NO BID 

NO BID 

NO BID 

NO BID 

NO BID 
NO BID ' 
NO BID 

NO BID 

NO BID 

Group 1 Total: 

UNIT PRICE 
(per UOM) 

NO BID 

NO BID 

NO BID 
NO BID 

GOWAN 

BAYtH 

DOW 

UOW 

NO BID 

GORDON 

@Si?DON 
GORDON 

MFG. 

NO BID 

NO BID 

UPlI~erex 
UPliCerex 

SERVICES, INC. 

UNIT PRICE 
(per UOM) 

NO BID 

NO BID 

$150 00 

$167 50 

$5000 

$178 00 

$227 50 

NO BID 

NO BID 

$15500 

NO BID 
NO BID 

$737 50 

NO BID 

$59040 
$255 00 

$79 50 

NO BID 
NO BID 
$227 50 

$1,29U 00 

I UAP 

TOTAL 
EXTENSION 

NO BID 

NO BID 

$3o,ooo 00 

$15,91250 

$1,50000 

$5,340 00 

$45.500 00 

NO BID 

NO BID 

$4,65000 

NO BID 
NO BID 

$29,500 00 

NO BID 

$10,627 20 

$15,300 00 

$4.929 00 

NO 810 
NO BID 

$26,162 50 

$ 2 , 2 0 0 0  

NO BID 

PART# 

NO BID 

NO BID 

NO BID 

NO BID 

NO BID 

NO 

NO BID 
NO BID 

NO BID 

NO BID 

PART # 
NO BID 

NO BID 

NO BID 
NO BID 

$78000 ' 
$215 00 

$87 00 

$147 50 

NU BIU 

$71 90 

$9000 

$105 65 

Group 1 Total: 

UNIT PRICE 
(per UOM) 

NO BID 

NO BID 

$373 75 
$147 25 

$16,38000 1 NO BID 

$6,45000 
--- 
$1,30500 

$3,097 50 

NO BID 

FALSE 

$2,61000 

$5.599 45 

$245,503.15 

TOTAL 
EXTENSION 

NO BID 

NO BID 

$156,975 00 
$50,06500 

NO BID 

NO BID 

NO 

NO BID 
NO BID 

NO BID 

NO BID 

MFG. 

NO BID 

NO BID 

NO BID 
NO BID 



47 Defoamer 12 pint cntr) MILLER Fighter $8.90 $106.80 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID GARRCO PREVENT $12.65 $151.80 ALENZA $9.50 $114.00 

48 befoamer 22 2.5 gal. cntr. LPI 1 gal. cntr. Fighter t-10 $22.50 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID ALENZA $55.00 $1,210.00 
$495.00 

49 Urin Control 1% polymer 15 LPI 

51 

52 - 
53 - 
54 

55 

56 - 
57 
58 

59 

Foamer 

Inlet or Activate spreader1 stlcker (Helena) 

m D  Invert Oil (Brewer) 

mproved Plus Basal Oil (Brewer) 

Slllcone Base Spreader, 99% Act~ve Ingr. 

Spray Indicator Dye, Promate (Helena) 

SpreaderlSticker,- 
SLa-Put Drift Control, I"/. Polymer 

Submerge or Sinker 

18 

180 

94 

420 

20 

30 

40 
12 

24 

2.5gal.cntr. 

2.5gal.cntr. 

55 gal. drum 

2.5 gal. cnlr. 

2.5 gal. cntr. 

gal.cntr. 

2.5 gal.cntr. 

gal. cntr. 

NO BID 

NO BID 

BREWER 

BREWER 

BREWER 

NO BID 

NO BID 

NO BID 

NO BID 

NO BID 

NO BID 

NO BID 

NO BID 

NO BID 

NO BID 

$924.00 

$35.15 

$84.75 

NO BID 

2 . 5 g a l . c n t r . N O B I D N O T Y i i F N O o  
NO BID 

NO BID 

Group 3 Total: 

NO BID 

NO BID 

$86,856-00 

$14;163:0 
$1,695.00 

NO BID 

NO BID 

NO BID 

$116,576.30 

NO BID 

NO BID 

NO BID 

NO BID 

NO BID 

NO BID 

NO BID 

NO BID 

NO BID 

NO BID 

NO BID 

NO BID 

NO BID 

NO BID 

NO BID 

NO BID 

NO BID 

NO BID ' 

NO BID 

NO BID ' 
NO BID 

NO BID 

BID 
NO BID 

NO BID 

Group 3 Total: 

NO BID 

NO BID 

NO BID 

NO BID 

NO BID 

NO BID 

NO BID 
NO BID 

NO BID 

$0.00 

NOBID 

NOBID 

NOBID 

NOBID 

NOaD 

NOBID 
Generic 

NOBID 

NO BID 

NOBiD 

NOBiD 

NOBID 

NOBID 

NOBID 

NOBID 
~eneric 

NOBID 

NOBID 

NO BID 

NO BID 

NO BID 

NO BID 

NO BID 

NO BID 
Generic 

NO BID 

NO BID 

Group 3 Total: 

NO BID 

NO BID 

NO BID 

NO BID 

NO BID 

NO BID 
Generic 

NO BID 

NO BID 

$2,191.80 

NOBID 

NOBID 

NO BID 

NO BID 

NO BID 

NO BID 

NO BID 

NO BID 

NO BID 

NOBID 

NOBID 

NOBID 

NOBID 

NOBID 

NOBID 

NO BID 
NO BID 

NOBID 

NO BID 

NO BID 

NO BID 

NO BID 

NO BID 

NO BID 

NO BID 
NO BID 

NO BID 

Group 3 Total: 

NO BID 

NO BID 

NO BID 

NO BID 

NO BID 

NO BID 

NO BID 
NO BID 

NO BID 

$7,414.00 



70 

71 

72 

73 

74 

75 

76 

77 

78 

79 
80 

8% 
82 

83 

84 

85 

86 

Chlorpyrlfos Pro 1% Mole Cncket Bait 

Chlorpynfos Pro 2t (Etigra or DowAgro) 

Demon EC (Syngenta) 

D~az~non AG 5UU 

Dursban 2 t  (Southern AG) 

Dursban 1% Mole Crlcket Ball (Southern AG) 

Hentage AG (Syngenta) (agency pr~c~ng) 

Mer~t 75 WSP (Bayer) 

Nemacur 10 G [dayer) 

Orthene Spray #97 (Valent) 

Prostar 70 WP (Bayer) 

slege Pro h re  Ant Bait IGmnulesl (BASt) 

sewn 4t  1.0 payer) 

Talstar Professional (FMC) 

lalsiar t Z  (FMC) 

lhu r~c~de  HPC 

lop Cho~ce (Bayer) 

NO BID 

NO BID 

NO BID 

NO BID 

NO BID 

NO BID 

NO BID 

NO BID 

NO BID 

NO BID 

NO BID 

NO BID 

NO BID 

NO BID 

NOBID 

NO BID 

NO BID 

Group 4 Total 

164 

LO 

2&3 

34 
50 

170 

3U 

20 

25 

70 

440 

70 

26 

50 

50 

25 
305 

NO BID 

NO BID 

NO BID 

NO BID 

NO BID 

NO BID 

NO BID 

NO BID 

NO BID 

NO BID 

NO BID 

NO BID 

NO BID 

NO BID 

NO BID 

NO BID 

NO BID 

$0 00 

50 Ib bag 

2 5 gal cntr * 
Case pints 

gal cntr 

I gal cntr 

40 Ib bag 

1 Ib bag 

Case Oz pkts 

50 Ib bag 

7 7 3 1 b ~ a c k e t  

1 Ib bag 

I gal cntr 

gal cntr 

1 gal cntr 

25 Ibs 

1 gal cntr 

50 lb bag 

NO BID 

NO BID 

NO BID 

NO BID 

NO BID 

NO BID 

NO BID 

NO BID 

NO BID 

NO BID 

NO BID 

NO BID 

NO BID 

NO BID 

NO BID 

NO BID 

NOBID 

NO BID 

NO BID 

NO BID 

NO BID 

NO BID 

NO BID 

NO BID 

NO BID 

NO BID 

NO BID 

NO BID 

NO BID 

NO BID 

NO BID 

NO BID 

NO BID 

NO BID 

$0 00 

NOBID 

NOBlD 

NOBID 

NOBID 

NOBID 

NDBID 

NOBID 

NOBID 

NOBID 

NOBID 

NO BID 

NOBID 

NO BID 

NOBID 

NO BID 

NO BID 

NOBID 

NO BID 

NO BID 

NO BID 

NO BID 

NO BID 

NO BID 

NO BID 

NO BID 

NO BID 

NO BID 

NO BID 

NO BID 

NO BID 

NO BID 

NO BID 

NO BID 

NO BID 

Group 4 Total 

NO BID 

NO BID 

NO BID 

NO BID 

NO BID 

NO BID 

NO BID 

NO BID 

NO BID 

NO BID 

NO BID 

NO BID 

NO BID 

NO BID 

NO BID 

NO BID 

NO BID 

NOBlD 

NO BID 

NO BID 

NOBID 

NOBID 

NOBID 

NOBID 

NOBID 

NOBID 

NOBID 

NOBID 

NOBID 

NO BID 

NOBID 

NOBID 

NOBID 

NOBID 

NO BID 

NO BID 

NO BID 

NO BID 

NO BID 

NO BID 

NO BID 

NO BID 

NO BID 

NO BID 

NO BID 

NO BID 

NO BID 

NO BID 

NO BID 

NO BID 

NO BID 

Group 4Total 

NO BID 

NO BID 

NO BID 

NO BID 

NO BID 

NO BID 

NO BID 

NO BID 

NO BID 

NO BID 

NO BID 

NO BID 

NO BID 

NO BID 

NO BID 

NO BID 

NO BID 

$0 00 

NO BID 

NO BID 

NO BID 

NO BID 

NO BID 

NO BID 

NO BID 

NO BID 

NO BID 

NO BID 

NO BID 

NO BID 

NO BID 

NO BID 

NO BID 

NOBID 

NO BID 

$18,073 00 

NO BID 

NO BID 

NO BID 

NO BID 

NO BID 

NO BID 

NO BID 

NO BID 

NO BID 

NO BID 

NO BID 

NO BID 

NO BID 

NO BID 

NO BID 

NO BID 

NO BID 

NO BID 

NO BID 

NOBID 

NOBID 

NOBID 

NO BID 

NO BID 

NO BID 

NOBID 

NO BID 

NO BID 

NO BID 

NO BID 

NO BID 

NOBID 

NOBID 

NOBID 

NOBID 

NOBID 

NOBID 

NOBID 

NOBID 

NOBID 

NOBID 

NOBID 

NOBID 

NOBID 

NOBID 

NOBID 

NO BID 

NOBID 

NOBID 

NOBID 

NOBID 

NO BID 

NO BID 

NO BID 

NO BID 

NO BID 

NO BID 

NO BID 

NO BID 

NO BID 

NO BID 

NO BID 

NO BID 

NO BID 

NO BID 

NO BID 

NO BID 

NO BID 

NO BID 

NO BID 

NO BID 

NO BID 

NO BID 

NO BID 

NO BID 

NO BID 

NO BID 

NO BID 

NO BID 

NO BID 

NO BID 

NO BID 

NO BID 

NOBID 

NO BID 

Group 4 Total 



UNSPECIFIED MONIES $30,000 
(Allocated Proportionately) 

Total Break 
PW Breakdown $ 321,442.96 

County Breakdown $ 145,694.53 

Coop Breakdown $ 259,676.89 
Notes: 

g8 

99 
c"-. ~ 

&%. 

I rapper glue ooara tor rats 

Traps Rat, Viclor M-9 professional M-326, plastic trigger 
,.-.-%.,e+.&. s-s!~fi:~;~~~~j~~j{<;~~~.$p$$$~js;~~~p~+~~~&~gg,~% 

59 neither made by Bayer 

95 now called Subdue Maxx (SYNGENTA) 

Individual pricing errors can not be corrected - line toialslcalculations can be corrected 

Univar - pricing error line item 20 -unable to change individual prices 

Yellow lines - no bids received for items in Groups 1 thru 6. 

Vendor Award Totals (per above selections) 

Agency Pricing: Tied Line Items 32, 33, 39, 76, 92 

Line 32 
Line 33 
Line 39 
Line 76 
Line 92 

I 

I 5  

+;g>;;g$j@J 

Tied Amounts 

$156,975.00 
$50.065.00 
$40,507.20 

$11,820.00 
$4,418.70 

$33,217.50 , 

Laseot48 

Boxof f 2  

g@:~~~;~;g~%qa-.~ , . . ,,- , . . 
$ .  

NO BID 

NO BID 
i. ..?$-2%&+:+2:.+ ,,,arec *y2b 

$ - 

NO BID 

NO BID 
+::v*a*.agqa: .6Fd3c,: r+J, 

, $  . 

NO BID 

NO BID 
.&t+Rbbi:tCi$>, ' . ~ - - ~ b Y p ' ~ + - a  

~ B I D  

NO BID 

:+,-.'+ ++$+24$:3FF&Tg ,s 

NO BID 

;&ll&g 

NO BID 

NO BID 

j$3g$??$g;$s& 

NOB~D--NOBID 

NO BID 

fttgijg; 

NO BID 

NO BID 

gsB$$j'Jr&;S$ 

NO BID 

NO BID 

$$$#;*xi$ 

NO BID 

NO BID 

&$@:<%: 

NO BID 

NO BID 

@$E@f$$g$ 

NO BID 

NO BID 

&&ii&gjJ; 

NO BID 

NO BID 

?::35:&&& 

NOBID 

NOBID 

&;$@@Xd 

NO BID 

NO BID 

&3&k>i$%z!$$$& 

NO BID 

NO BID 

pw&!$T&&:g 



PINELLAS COUNTY GOVERNMENT, FLORIDA 
BID TABULATION # 078.0481-B (MW) 
Bid Title : Herbicides . lnsectlcides & Other Chemical Products ICO-OP) 
Date & Time Due: November 04,2008 @ 3:00 p.m. 

AGRO DISTRIBUTION LLC D/B/A PROSOURCE ONE RED RIVER SPECIALTIES, INC. 

GROUP 

1 

TOTAL 
EXTENSION 

$480 00 
$3,400 00 

MFG. 

ORIGIN T & 0 
BASF 

LESCO, INC. 

EST. 
24.MONTH 
QUANTIN 

24 

DESCRIPTION - 
1 . HERBICIDES 

Chelated liqu~d iron 

3 
4 
5 
6 

7 

8 
g 

10 
11 
12 

13 

14 
15 
16 

17 

18 
19 
20 
21 

TOTAL 
EXTENSION 

$450 00 

MFG. 

Southern Ag 

200 
95 
30 
30 

200 
260 
20 
30 
30 

130 

40 

50 
18 
60 
62 

12 
320 
115 
16 

Element 4 (Dow Agro) (Garion 4 genenc) 

Finale (Bayer) 

Fusilade I I , q S y n g e n t a )  

Garlon 3A (DowAgro) 

Garlon 4 ULTRA (DowAgro) 

Helosate (Helm Agro) (Roundup genenc) 

Helosate (Helm Agro) (Roundup genenc) 

Illoxan 3 tC (Bayer) 

Image 70 Uti  PASF) 

Kerb 5OWP (UowAgro) 

Milestone VM (DowAgro) 

MSMA (aka MSMS) (Helena) 

Octane 2% SC (Sepro) 

Plateau (BASt) 

Ronstar ti (Bayer) 

~ound-up 41% act~ve ingredient (Monsanto) -- 
Round-up Pro (Monsanto) 
Round-up Pro (Monsanto) 
Round-up Pro (Monsanlo) 

2 

PART # 

10008880 
10000996 

UNIT PRICE 
(per UOM) 

$18 75 

TOTAL 
EXTENSION 

$453 12 . 
NO BID 

BAYER 
tieneric 

NO BID 

NO BID 
Genenc 

tienenc 

Bayer Aventis 

BASF 

DOW 

NO BID 
Generic 

Generic 

NO BlU 

BAYtK 

Generic 
NO BID 

Monsanto 
Momado 

50 

UOM 

2 5 5'31 cntr 

unve 15Ut wetable dry granules (BASF) 

UNIT PRICE 
(per UOM) 

$20 00 
$68 00 Jeneric l,L,-, 

UNIT PRICE 
(per UOM) 

$18 88 

NO BID 

089200 
Generic 

NO BID 

NO BID 
tienenc 

Genenc 

018898 
069206 

088513 

NO BID 
~ener lc  

tienenc 

NO BID 

855624 
Genenc 

NO BID 
027317 
027380 

MFG. 

LESCO 

NO BID 

$214 43 
tienenc 

NO BID 

NO BID 
tienenc 

tieneric 

$182 83 

$87 70 
$113 20 

NO B.D 
Generic 

Generic 

NO QiD 

I 9 1  83 

Generic 

NO BID 
$291 49 

$1,618 99 

25gal cntr 

25gal *tr. 

1 quart cntr 

25gal cntr 

2 5 ~ 1  emir 

5 gal cntr 

30 gal drum 

1 gal cntr 

43 02 bottle 

3 Ib bag 

2 5 gal cntr 

gal cntr 

Case12Bozcntrs 

1 gal cntr 

50 Ib bag 

30 gal cntr 

1 gal Cntr 
Case 2 2 5 gal cnirs 

30 gal cntr 

PART# 

084043 
BASF 1 Ib bag 063899 

B & G CHEMICALS 

MFG. 

NO BID 
$64 22 

NO BID DOW $12485 1 $24,97000 1 $143 00 $z,fiOOO - 
$20,370 85 NO BID NO BID NO BID BAYER 10001040 $14750 $14,012.50 

NO BID 

NO BID 

NO BID 

NO BID 

NO BID 

NO BID 

NO BID 

NO BID 
NO BID 

NO BID 

NO BID 

NO BID 

NOBID 

NO BID 

NO BID 

NO BID 
NO BID 
NO BID 
NO BID 

1 $3,211 00 1 Generic 

NO BID 

NOBID 
Generic 

Generic 

$5,484 90 
$2,631 00 

$14,716 00 

NO BID 
Generic 

Generic 

NO BID 

$5,693 46 
Generic 

NO BID 
$33,521 35 
$25,903 84 

NO BID 

& EQUIPMENT 

UNIT PRICE 
(per UOM) 

NO BID 

CO. INC. 

TOTAL 
EXTENSION 

NO BID 

NO BID 

NO BID 

NO BID 

NO BID 

NO BID 

NO BID 

NO BID 

NO BID 

NO BID 

NO BID 

NO BID 

NO BID 

NO BID 

NO BID 

NO BID 

NO BID 
NO BID 
NO BID 
NO BID 

DOW 

DOW 

HELM 
HELM 

NO BID 

NO BID 

NO BID 

DOW 
NO BID 

NO BID 
BASk 

Generic 

NO BID 

NO BID 
Monsanto 
Mowanto 

NO BID 

NO BID 

NO BID 

NO BID 

NO BID 
NO BID 

NO BID 

NO BID 
NO BID 

NO BID 

NO BID 

NO BID 

NO BID 

NO BID 

NO BID 

NO BID 
NO BID 
NO BID 
NO BID 

NO BID NO BID 

$162 50 

$19485 
$87 50 

$1,050 00 
NO BID 

NO BID 

NO BID 

$737 50 

NO BID 

NO BID 
$24" 00 
Genenc 

NO BID 
NO BID 
$197 50 

$1,125 00 

---- 
$4,875.00 ' 
$38.97000 
$22,750 00 
$21.000 00 

NO BID 

NO 810 

NO BID 

$29,500 00 
NO BID 

NO BID 

$14,400.00 - E n z c -  ' 

NO BID 

NO BID 
$22,712 50 
$18,000 00 

NO BID 

NO BID 

63725515 
63725711 

10001152 

NO BID 

10114597 

10001421 
Bid Error 

NO BID 
10001426 

NO BID 

NO BID 

BAYER 

BASF 

DOW 

DowAgro 

NO BID 

SEPRO 

BAYtR 

Bid Error 
NO BID 

Monsanto 

$170 00 

$212 00 

NO BID 

NO BID 

---- 
$5,100 00 

$42,400 00 
NO BID 

JoJ10 
$143 00 : '$4.g0i07 
$7000 ; $2,10000' 

$11550 I ~ T , z ~ T O ~  --- 
I I 

$715 00 1 $ ~ , ~ O ~ O  - 1 
NO BID 

$480 00 
$265 uu 
$7200 

Bid Error 

NO BID 
$230 00 

$ 1 , m  40 

NO BID 

$8,640 00 
$15,900 00 
$4,464 00 
Bld Error 

NO BID 
$26,450 00 
$20,102 40 







UNSPECIFIED MONIES $30,000 
(Allocated Proportionately) $ sOO.00 $500.00 $ 3,000.00 $4,000.00 

Total Break 
PW Breakdown $ 321,442.96 

County Breakdown $ 145,694.53 
Coop Breakdown $ 259,676.89 

Notes: 

59 neither made by Bayer 

95 now called Subdue Man  (SYNGENTA) 

Individual~ricing errors can not be corrected -line totalslcalculations can be corrected 

Univar - pricing error line item 20 - unable to change individual prices 

Yellow lines - no bids received for items In Groups 1 thm 6. 
Agency Pridng: Tied Line Items 32, 33, 39, 76, 92 

Line 32 
Line 33 

Line 39 
Line 76 
Line 92 

Tied Amounts 

$156,975.00 
$50,065:00 
$40,507.20 
$11,820.00 
$4,418.70 



Bid Title: Herbicides - Insecticides Other Chemical products (CO-OP) 
Bid Date: 11/4/08 3PM - 078-0481-B 
GROUP 7 - GENERICS 

8 
9 
10 
11 

Alligare Glyphosate 4 

Alligare Glyphosate 4 
none offered 
none offered 

12 
13 

14 
15 
16 
17 

noneottered 
none offered 

18 
19 

I 

noneoffered I none offered I none offered I none offered I none offered 1 none offered I none offered I none offered I none offered 

none offered 
none offered 

none offered 
none offered 

Target 6.6 
none offered 

Alligare Panoramic 
Oxadiazon 2G Quail-Pro 

20 
21 
22 
23 
24 
25 

I I I I a I I 

none offered I none offered I none offered I none offered I none offered I none offered / none offered I none offered I none offered 
$112.50 1 none offered I none offered I none offered I none offered 1 I none offered I none offered I none offered none offered 

noneottered 
none offered 

noneottered 
none offered 

none offered 
Nufarm Razor Pro 

I I I I I I I I I I 

26 1 Alligare Triclopyr 3 SL ( 2.5gal. 1 $102.50 1 none offered I none offered I none offered '1  none offered I none offered I none offered I none offered I none offered 
I I I I I I I I I I I I 

2.5 gal. 
30 gal. 

none offered 
none offered 

none offered 

Nufarm Razor Pro 
Nufarm Razor Pro 

none offered 
none offered 
none offered 

Alligare Oryzalin 4 Pro 

none offered 
none offered 

none offered 

$81.25 
$960.00 

none offered 
none offered 

2.5 ga1.s 
none offered 

I gal. 
50 ~ o u n d s  

none offered 
1 aal. 

none offered 
none offered 
none offered 

27 
28 

none ottered 
none offered 

2 x 2.5 gal. 
30 gal. 

none offered 
none offered 
none offered 

2.5 aal. 

29 
30 
31 
32 
33 

none offered 
none offered 
none offered 
none offered 

$40.00 
none offered 

$203.00 
$65.00 

Nufarm Triplet 
none offered 

34 

I 

none offered 1 

none offered I 

none offered 
Nufarm Aqua-Neat 
Nufarrn Aqua-Neat 

none offered 
none offered 

none offered 
none offered 
none offered 
none offered 

none offered 
none offered 

Nufarmllmazapyr 
none offered 

none offered 

i 
I 
i 

1 

Nufarm Diquat 

none ottered 
none offered 

none offered 

none offered 
none offered 

none offered ' 
none offered 
none offered / 
none offered 1 

none offered 
none offered 

Epro 2 
none offered 

2.5 gal. 
none offered 

I gal. 

none offered 
none offered 

none offered 
2.5 gal. 
30 gal. 

none offered 
none offered 

none offered 
none offered 
none offered 
none offered 

none offere4 
none offered 
2.5 gal. jug 
none offered 

$53.75 
none offered 

$99.00 

none ottered 
none offered 

none offered 
$105.00 

$1,230.00 
none offered 
none offered 

none offered 
~hemlnova Glyfos Pro 

none offered 
none offered 

none offered 
none offered 

$1 92.63 
none offered 

none offered 
none offered 

none offered 

none ottered 
none offered 

none offered 
none offered 
none offered 
none offered 
none offered 

none offered 

none offered 
none offered 

none ottered 
none offered 

none offered 
none offered 
none offered 
none offered 

none offered 
none offered 

none offered 

none offered 
none offered 
none offered 
none offered 
none offered 

none offered 
30 gal drum 
none offered 
none offered 

none offered 
none offered 
none offered 
none offered 

none offered 
none offered 

none offered : 

none offered 
$1,195.00 

none offered 
none offered 

none offered 
none offered 
none offered 
none offered 
none offered 

none offered 
none offered 
none offered 
none offered 

none offered 
none offered 

none offered 

none offered 
none offered 
none offered 
none offered 

none offered 
none offered 
none offered 
none offered 
none offered 

none offered 
none offered 

none offered 

none offered 
none offered 
none offered 
none offered 
none offered 

none offered 
none offered 

none offered 

none offered 
none offered 
none offered 
none offered 
none offered 

none offered 
none offered 

none offered 

none offered 
none offered 

none offered 
none offered 
none offered 
none offered 
none offered 

none offered 

none offered 
none offered 
none offered 
none offered 
none offered 



a Brd Title: Herb~crdes - lnsectlcrdes Other Chernrcal products (CO-OP) 
Bid D a t e  11/4/08 3PM - 078-0481-8 I 

I 
GROUP 7 - GENERICS 1 1  

44 
45 
46 

47 
LA .- 
49 
50 
51 

52 
53 
54 

none offered 
none offered 
none offered 

none offered 
none offered 
none offered 
none offered 
none offered 

none offered 
none offered 
none offered 

none offered 
none offered 
none offered 

none offered 
none offered 
none offered 
none offered 
none offered 

none offered 
none offered 
none ottered 

none offered 
none offered 
none offered 

none offered 
none offered 
none offered 
none offered 
none offered 

none offered 
none offered 
none ottered 

none offered 
none offered 
none offered 

none offered 
none offered 
none offered 
none offered 
none offered 

none offered 
none offered 
none ottered 

none offered 
none offered 
none offered 

none offered 
none offered 
none offered 
none offered 
none offered 

none offered 
none offered 
none offered 

none offered 
none offered 
none offered 

none offered 
none offered 
none offered 
none offered 
none offered 

none offered 
none offered 
none ottered 

none offered 
none offered 
none offered I 

none offered 
none offered i 

none offered / 
none offered 
none offered 

none offered 
none offered 
none offered 

none offered 
none offered 
none offered 

none offered 
none offered 
none offered 
none offered 
none offered 

none offered 
none offered 
none ottered 

Mark-lt Blue 

none offered 
none offered 

none offered 
none offered 
none offered 
none offered 
none offered 

none offered 
none offered 
none offered 

none offered 
none offered 

none offered 
none offered 
none offered 
none offered 
none offered 

none offered 
none offered 
none ottered 

4 x I gal. 
none offered 
none offered 

none offered 
none offered 
none offered 
none offered 
none offered 

none offered 
none offered 
none ottered 

$39.15 
none offered 
none offered 

none offered 
none offered 
none offered 
none offered 
none offered 

none offered 
none offered 
none ottered 



Bid Title: Herbicides - lnsectic~des Other Chemical products (CO-OP) I 

Bid Date: 11/4/08 3PM - 078-0481-8 I 

G R O U P  7 - G E N E R I C S  

Naturehem, lnc. I HELENA CHEMICAL CO. ' I UNIVAR USA INC. 
~ r g  I vroauct 01 I I Ullll u l  I  MI^ 1 product ot I I I I ~ t g  I rroduct or I I Ulllt UI I I 

I I 

72 
73 
- 

74 
75 

I 

Banrot 517 2 ib cntr. / $ 57.36 none offered none offered none offered none offered 

none offered none offered / none offered none offered none offered none offered none offered 

77 

I I I I I I 

99 1 none offered I none offered 1 none offered 1 none offered I none offered I none offered I none offerdd I none offered 1 none offered I none offered I none offered I none offered 
I I otal ~waraea to vendors DaSed I I I I 1 I I I I I I 

Generic Offered 
none ottered 
none offered 
none offered 
none offered 
none offered 

78 1 none offered 1 none offered l none offered l none offered I none offered I none offered I none offered 1 I none offered I none offered I noneoffered I none offered I none offered 

Imidacloprid 75 WSP 

Mist. Info 
none onerea 
none offered 
none offered 
none offered 
none offered 

on quantities in Column AR 

Cty Breakdown 50150 $ 104,973.11 
Coop Breakdown 50150 $ 104,973.1 1 

oz. pks 

Measure 
none onerea 
none offered 
none offered 
none offered 
none offered 

Generics will be awarded in the best interest of the County 
Line 57, elected not to award due to amount 

I 

1 $130,110.00 1 

BayerlTouchstone 

1 $20,885.76 1 1 $11,901.45 

Unit Price 
none onerea 
none offered 
none offered 
none offered 
none offered 

$ 65,055.00 $ 10,442.88 $ 5,950.73 
$ 65,055.00 , $ 10,442.88 $ 5,950.73 

Touchst003 

Generic Offered 

none oltered 
none offered 
none offered 
none offered 
none offered 

4 x 1.6 oz 1 

Mist. Info 
none onerea 
none offered 
none offered 
none offered 
none offered 

$55.85 

Unit of Meas@ 
none otterqid 
none offere'd 
none offered 
none offered 
none offered 

none offered 

Unit Price 
none onerea 
none offered 
none offered 
none offered 
none offered 

none offered 

Generic Offered 
none ottered 

Syngenta Demon Max 
none offered 
none offered 
none offered 

none offered 

Misc, Info 
none onerea 

744088 
none offered 
none offered 
none offered 

none offered 

Measure 
none onerea 

cases of 8 x 1 

none offered 
none offered 
none offered 

Unit Price 
none onerea 

$225.20 
none offered 
none offered 
none offered 



Bld T~tle Herbicides - lnsectlc~des Other Chemical products (CO-OP) 
Bid Date 11/4/08 3PM - 078-0481-5 
GROUP 7 - GENERICS 

- 

32 
33 

34 none offered none offered none offered none offered 

none offered 
none offered 

none offered 

none offered 
none offered 

none offered 

none offered 
none offered 

none offered 

none o f f e x  
none offered 

none offered 

none offered 
none offered 

none offered 

-- --- 

none offered 
none offered 

none offered 

none offered 
none offered 

none offered 

none offered 
none offered 

none offered 

none offered 
none offered 

none offered 

none offered 
none offered 

none offered 

none offered 
none offered 

none offered 

none offered 
none offered 

none offered 



I 1 43 I none offered Inane offered Inone offered Inone offered I none offered Inone offered Inone offered Inone offered I none offered I noneoffered I nqne offeredl none offered 1 none offered Inone offered 1 none offered 1 none offeredl 
I I I I I I I I I I I I I I I I I 

1 

61d T~t le Herbic~des - lnsect~c~des Other Chern~cal products (CO-OP) 
51d Date 11/4/08 3PM - 078-0481-5 
GROUP 7 - GENERICS 

I 
I 

: 47 1 none offered Inone offered Inone offered Inone offered I none offered Inone offered Inone offered Inone offered I none offered I none offered / none offered 1 none offered 1 none offered Inone offered 1 none offered 1 none offered 1 

/ 44 
i 45 
1 46 

I I I I I I I I 

i 48 1 none offered Inone offered ]none offered Inone offered 1 none offered ]none offered Inone offered Inone offered I none offered I none offered 1 nqne offered] none offered 1 none offered Inone offered 1 none offered 1 none offered 
j 49 1 none offered Inone offered Inone offered Inone offered I none offered Inone offered Inone offered [none offered I none offered I none offered 1 none offered 1 none offered 1 none offered Inone offered 1 none offered 1 none offered 

I I I I I 

1 50 1 none offered hone offered Inone offered lnone offered I none offered lnone offered Inone offered Inone offered I Garrco I Control I 1 ouart 1 $19.50 1 none offered Inone offered 1 none offered 1 none offered 1 

CROP PRODUCTION SERVICES, INC. I UAP I CLARKE MOSQUITO CONTROL ALLIGARE LLC I 
IV1lY ' mJumul 

none offered 
none offered 
none offered 

I I I I I I I I , I I 

51 1 none offered ]none offered Inone offered Inone offered I none offered Inone offered Inone offered Inone offered I none offered I none offered 1 none offered 1 none offered 1 none offered Inone offered I none offered 1 none offered 
I I I I I I I I I I I I I I I I 

Generic Offered 

DEANGELO BROTHERS, INC. 
rnrg 1 rroauct or 
Genenc Offered 

none offered 
none offered 
none offered 

UIIILUI ~ v r g T m U c t  UI UIIIL UI UI UIIILUI 

1 52 
I 53 

54 

/ 56 1 none offered Inone offered Inone offered Inone offered I none offered Inone offered none offered none offered none offered none offered none offered 1 n o ~ z ~ e d  1 none offered /none offered 1 none offered 1 none offered 
I I I I I I I I I I I I I I I I I 

M~SC Info 

none offered 
none offered 
none offered 

I 
i 55 

Unlt Pnce Mlsc. Info 

none offered 
none offered 
none ottered 

Measure Unit of Measure 

none offered 
none offered 
none offered 

I I I I I I I 1 I I I I I I I I 
none offered 

none offered 
none offered 
none onered 

Unit Prlce 

none offered 
none offered 
none offered 

none offered 

none offered 
none offered 
none onered 

Genenc Offered 

none offered 
none offered 
none offered 

none offered 

none offered 
none offered 
none ottered 

none offered 
none offered 
none offered 

none offered 

Unlt Pr~ce M ~ ~ ~ ,  info 

none offered 
none offered 
none ottered 

none offered 
none offered 
none offered 

none offered 

Measure 

none offered 
none offered 
none ottered 

none offered 
none offered 
none offered 

none offered 

Unit Price 

none offered 
none offered 
none onered 

none offered 
none offered 
none offered 

none offered 

Generlc Offered 

none offered 
none offered 
none onered 

ndne offered 
none offered 
none offered 

none offered 

M~~~ info 

none offered 
none offered 
none ottered 

Measure 

none offered 
none offered 
none offered 

none offered 

none offered 
none offered 
none offered 

none offered 
none offered 
none offered 

none offered 

none offered 
none offered 
none onered 

none offered 
none offered 
none offered 

none offered 

none offered 
none offered 
none onered 

none offered 
none offered 
none offered 

none offered 

none offered 
none offered 
none offered 

none offered 
noneoffered 
none offered 

noneoffered 

none offered 
none offered 
none onered 

none offered 

none offered 
none offered 
none ottered 

none offered 
none offered 
none onered 

none offered none offered 



I 
Bid T~t le Herbicides - lnsect~c~des Other Chern~cal products (CO-OP) 
81d Date 11/4/08 3PM - 078-0481-8 
GROUP 7 -GENERICS 

- .  -. 

83 
84 

86 

87 

none offered 
none offered 

88 
89 

none offered 
none offered 

90 
91 
92 

none offered 
none offered 

none offered 
none offered 

93 
94 

none offered 
none offered 

none offered 
none offered 
none offered 

95 
96 

none offered 
none offered 

none offered 
none offered 

none offered 
none offered 

97 
98 
99 

none Onered 
none offered 

none offered 
none offered 
none offered 

none offered 
none offered 

none offered 
none offered 

none offered 
none offered 

none offered 
none offered 

none,offered 
none offered 
none offered 

none onered 
none offered 

none offered 
none offered 
none offered 

none offered 
none offered 

none offered 
none offered 

none offered 
none offered 

none offered 
none offered 

none offered 
none offered 
none offered 

none ottered 
none offered 

I 

none offered 
none offered 
none offered 

none offered 
none offered 

none offered 
none offered 

r-nonearrereclnoneonereanoneonereanoneonereananeorrereononeonereanoneonereanoneorrereow 

none offered 
none offered 

none offered 
none offered 

none offered 
none offered 
none offered 

none onered 
none offered 

none offered 
none offered 
none offered 

none offered 
none offered 

none offered 
none offered 

none offered 
none offered 

none offered 
none offered 

none offered 
none offered 
none offered 

none offered 
none offered 

none offered 
none offered 
none offered 

none offered 
none offered 

none offered 
none offered 

none offered 
none offered 

none offered 
none offered 

none offered 
none offered 
none offered 

none offered 
none offered 

none offered 
none offered 
none offered 

none offered 
none offered 

none offered 
none offered 

none offered 
none offered 

none offered 
none offered 

none offered 
none offered 
none offered 

none ottered 
none offered 

none offered 
none offered 
none offered 

none offered 
none offered 

none offered 
none offered 

none offered 
none offered 

none offered 
none offered 

none offered 
none offered 
none offered 

none onered 
none offered 

none offered 
none offered 
none offered 

none offered 
none offered 

none offered 
none offered 

none offered 
none offered 

none offered 
none offered 

none offered 
none offered 
none offered 

none ottered 
none offered 

none offered 
none offered 
none offered 

none offered 
none offered 

none offered 
none offered 
none onerea 

none offered 
none offered 

none offered 
none offered 

none offered 
none offered 
none offered 

none offered 
none offered 

none offered 
none offered 
none offered 

none offered 
none offered 

none offered 
none offered 
none onered 

none offered 
none offered 

none offered 
none offered 

none offered 
none offered 
none offered 

none offered 
none offered 

none offered 
none offered 
none offered 

none offered 
none ottered 

none offered 
none offered 
none onered ----- 

none offered 
none offered 

none offered 
none offered 

none offered 
none offered 
none offered 

none onered 
none offered 

none offered 
none offered 
none offered 

none offered 
none offered 

none offered 
none offered 
none onerea 

none offered 
none offered 

none offered 
none offered 

none offered 
none offered 
none offered 

none offered 
none offered 
none onered 

none offered 
none offered 

none offered 
none offered 
none offered 

none offered 
none offered 

none ottered 
none offered 

none offered 
none offered 

none offered 
none offered 

none offered 
none offered 
none offered 

none offered 
none offered 

none offered 
none offered 
none offered 

none offered 
none offered 

none offered 
none offered 
none offered 

none offered 
none offered 

none offered 
none offered 
none offered 

none offered 
none offered 

none offered 
none offered 

none offered 
none offered 

none offered 
none offered 
none offered 

none offered 
none offered 
none offered 








