PINELLAS COUNTY GOVERNMENT, FLORIDA o
Tabulation]
Bid Number: 078-0459-B (SS) ) I
Bid Title: Pumps, Parts and Repairs (Co-op) Rebid B
Date & Time Due: August 28, 2008 @ 3:00 PM o o - B
[ _
Regional Engineering & Service, ITT Water & Wastewator Stewart's Electric Motor
Carl Eric Johnson, inc. John Mader Enterprises, Inc. Power & Pumps, Inc. B Inc. Florida, LLC Works, Inc. Tampa Armature Works, Inc.
_PUMP TYPE PUMP SIZE REPAIR COST PUMP SIZE REPAIR COST PUMP SIZE REPAIR COST PUMP SIZE REPAIR COST PUMP SIZE REPAIR COST PUMP SIZE REPAIR COST PUMP SIZE REPAIR COST
eROVPY | | 4 e . o
Split-Case 300hp 300hp $ 6,950.00 300hp $ 15,600.00 300hp $ 11,000.00 300hp No Bid 300hp $ 28.632.00 300hp $ 14,025.00
Horizontal { _ 500hp 500hp $ 5,150.00 500hp $ 7.200.00 500hp $ 15,000.00 500hp No Bid S0Chp $  14,325.00 500hp $ 6,903.00
|_Centrifugal 800hp 800hp $ 6.950.00 80Chp $ 20,000.00 800hp $ 30.000.00 800hp No Bid 80Chp $§ 23,147.00 800hp $ 11,595,000
GROUP 1 TOTAL:| No Bid GROUP 1 TOTAL:| § 19,050.00 | GROUP 1 TOTAL:| $ 42,800.00 | GROUP 1 TOTAL:| § 56,000.00 | GROUP 1 TOTAL:| No Bid GROUP 1 TOTAL:| $§  66,104.00 | GROUP 1 TOTAL:| § 32,523.00
GROUP 2 : _ o
7.5hp 7.5hp 3 3,400.00 7.5hp 3 2.708.00 7.5hp 3 3,500.00 7.5hp $ 4,570.00 7.5hp $ 8,807.00 7.5hp $ 598700
Submersible 20hp o 20hp $ 5,950.00 20hp 3 3,860.00 20hp $ 5,500.00 20hp $ 8,897.00 2Chp $  12,990.00 20hp $_8,263.00
137hp 137hp $ 31,950.00 137hp $ 22,180.00 137hp $ 11,000.00 137hp No Bid 137hp $§  46,275.00 137hp $ 19,625.00
GROUP 2 TOTAL:| No Bid GROUP 2 TOTAL:| $ 41,300.00 | grRouP 2 TOTAL:| § 28,848.00 | GROUP 2 TOTAL:| § 20,000.00 | GROUP2TOTAL:| $  13,467.00 | GROUP 2TOTAL:| §  68,172.00 | GROUP 2 TOTAL:| $ 33,876.00
GROUP 3 B
Vertical 200hp 200hp. $ 7.700.00 20Chp 3 9,600.00 200hp $ 10,500.00 200hp No Bid 200hp $  20,178.00 200hp $ 12,210.00
Tubine 400hp 400hp $ 8,100.00 400hp $ 19,500.00 400hp $ 18,500.00 400hp No Bid 400hp § 37,938.00 400hp $ 20,557.00
| 700hp 700hp $ 8,400.00 700hp 3 26,000.00 700hp $ 28,000.00 70Chp No Bid 70Chp. $ 37,835.00 700hp $ 46,978.00
GROUP 3 TOTAL:} No Bid GROUP 3 TOTAL:| § 24,200.00 | GROUP 3 TOTAL:| § §5,100.00 | GROUP 3 TOTAL:| § §7,000.00 | GROUP 3 TOTAL:| No Bid GROUP3TOTAL:| $§  95,951.00 | GROUP3 TOTAL:| $ 79,745.00
GROUP 4 .
End-Suction 40hp 40hp $ 2,100.00 40hp $ 5,600.00 40hp $ 4,500.00 40hp No Bid 4Chp $ 8,551.00 40hp $ 3,680.00
Centrifugal 40hp 4Chp $ 2,500.00 40hp $ 5,900.00 4Chp $ 6,500.00 40hp No Bid 4Chp $§  13,980.00 40hp $  4934.00
g 500hp 500hp $ 4,500.00 500hp $ 10,100.00 500hp $ 17,000.00 500hp No Bid 500hp $ 15,751.00 500hp $ 6,737.00 |
- GROUP 4 TOTAL:| No Bld GROUP 4 TOTAL:| $ 9,100.00 | GROUP 4 TOTAL:| § 21,600.00 | GROUP 4 TOTAL:| $ 28,000.00 | GROUP 4 TOTAL:| No Bid GROUP4TOTAL:| $  38,292.00 | GROUP4TOTAL:| $ 15,361.00
TOTAL FOR TOTAL FOR| TOTAL FOR TOTAL FOR| TOTAL FOR)| TOTAL FOR| TOTAL FOR|
o GROUPS 1-4:{ No Bid GROUPS 1-4:| § 93,650.00 | GROUPS 1-4:{ § 148,348.00 | GROUPS 1-4:| § 161,000.00 | GROUPS 1.4/ §  13,467.00 | GROUPS 1-4: § 268,5619.00 | GROUPS 1-4:| $ 161,504.00
Hourly Shop Labor Hourly Shop Labor Hourly Shop Labor Hourly Shop Labor Hourly Shop Labor Hourly Shop Labor ’ Houry Shop Laber
Rate (all inclusive) | $§ 70.00 | Rate (all inclusive) | $ 35.00 | Rate (all inctusive) | $ 38.00 | Rate (allinclusive) | § 42.00 | Rate (all inclusive) | $ 68.00 | Rate (all inclusive) | $ 89.00 | Rate (all inclusive) | $§ 45.00
Hourly Field Labor Hourly Field Labor Hourly Field Labor Hourly Field Labor Hourly Field Labor Hourly Field Labor Hourly Field Labor
Rate (all inclusive) | $ 80.00 | Rate (all inclusive) { $ 50.00 | Rate (allinclusive) | § 46.00 | Rate (all inclusive) | § 42,00 | Rate (allinclusive) | $ 78.00 | Rate (all inclusive) | $ 121.50 | Rats (altinclusive) | $ 70.00
Emergency Hourly Emergency Hourly Emergency Hourly Emergency Hourly Emergency Houry Emergency Hourly Emergency Hourly
Shop Labor Rate Shop Labor Rate Shop Labor Rate Shop Labor Rate Shop Labor Rate Shop Labor Rate Shep Labor Rate
N {all inclusive) $ 105.00 {ah inclusive) $ 52.50 {all inclusive) $ 46.00 (all inclusive) $ ___ 60.00 (all inclusive) $ 102.00 (ai Inclusive) $ 112.50 (all inclusive) 3 67.50
Emergency Hourly Emergency Hourty Emergency Hourly Emergency Hourly Emergency Houry Emergency Hourty Emergency Hourty
Field Labor Rate (all Field Labor Rate (ail Field Labor Rate (all Fietd Labor Rate (all Field Labor Rate (al) Field Labor Rate (all Fietd Labor Rate (all
I Inclusive) 3 160.00 inclusive) $ 75.00 inclusive) $ 54.00 inclusive) $ 60.00 inclusive) 3 117.00 Inclusive) $ 152.50 inclusive) $ 105.00
New Pump: Cost New Pump: Cost New Pump: Cost New Pump: Cost New Pump: Cosl New Pump: Cost New Pump: Cost
plus No Bid plus 15% plus 14% plus . 14% plus 25% plus 15% plus 15%
Parts: Cost Plus | No Bid Parts: Cosl Plus 15%| Parts: Cost Plus 14% | Parts: Cosl Plus 14%/| Pans: Cosl Plus 30%| Parts: Cost Plus 20%/{ Parts: Cost Plus 15%
GENERAL INFO. NOT FACTORED T - -
IN BID SUMMARY:
Unspecified Unspecified Unspeclfied| Unspecified| Unspecified Unspecified Unspecified|
Work:| 50,000.00 Work:| $ 50,000.00 Work:| $ 50,000.00 Work:| $ ~ 50,000.00 Work:| § 50,000.00 Work:| §  50,000.00 Work:| $ 50,000.00
Hourly Hourly Hourly Hourly Hourly Hourly Hourly
Inspection Fee Inspection Fee Inspection Fee Inspection Fee Inspection Fee Inspection Fee Inspection Fee
(if repair not (if repair not (if repair not (if repair not (if repair not (if repair not (if repair not
performed) $ 80.00 |performed) $ 35.00 |performed) $ 54.00 |performed) $ 45.00 |performed) $0.00 |performed) 3 89.00 |performed) 3 45.00




