PURCHASING

Joe Lauro, CPPO/CPPB
Director

INTEROFFICE MEMO

To: Joseph Lauro, Director of Purchasing

From: Sue Steele, CPPB, Procurement Analyst

Subject: Award of Bid — Air Conditioning Supplies
Contract No. 078-0408-B (SS)

Date: June 25, 2008

RECOMMENDATION: | RECOMMEND THE DIRECTOR OF PURCHASING AWARD THE BID
FOR AIR CONDITIONING SUPPLIES WITH BAKER DISTRIBUTING COMPANY, LLC, ON THE
BASIS OF BEING THE LOWEST RESPONSIVE, RESPONSIBLE BID RECEIVED MEETING
SPECIFICATIONS. BIDS ARE ON FILE IN THE PURCHASING DEPARTMENT.

ESTIMATED ANNUAL EXPENDITURE NOT TO EXCEED: $60,000.00

Funding is provided through each departments operating budget.

DISCUSSION: This contract is to provide the annual requirements of air conditioning supplies to
various departments. This bid is comprised of four different groups. Each group offers a range of
discounts off the vendors catalog price. The bid submittal was a sampling price sheet for evaluation
purposes only; therefore, the award amount is based on estimated usage, not amount submitted.

Contract Period: 9/9/08 THROUGH 9/8/09 ] N/A — One Time Purchase
Renewal Options: Terms Length of (] None
Remaining Each Term
2 12 Months

Increase Allowances: None

OSEPH LAURO, CPPO/CPPB
irector, of Ptyhasmg

Date of Approval: (22 é / ,—;2

Attachments: 1. Contract Review
2. Bid Tabulation




CATS

PURCHASING DEPARTMENT NO.: .
CONTRACT REVIEW TRANSMITTAL 201
PROJECT: Air Conditioning Supplies
BID NUMBER: 078-0408-B (SS) REQ. NUMBER:
TYPE: [X] Purchase Contract |[_] Other: [_] Construction-Less than $100,000 [ ] One Time

In accordance with the policy guide for Contract Administration, the attached documents are submitted for review and comment.

Upon completion of review, complete Contract Review Transmittal and forward to next Review Authority listed. Please indicate

suggested changes by revising, in RED, the appropriate section of the document reflecting the exact wording of the change.

RISK MANAGENMENT: Please enter required liability coverage on pages: PRODUCT ONLY
This is an semi-annual/one-time requirement contract. Estimated Expenditure: $80,000.00
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Using Dept please check attached vendor list. Circle vendors you want bids mailed to. Add additiona
vendors with complete information (Name, Addres Phone and Fax)
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**RETURN ALL DOCUMENTS TO PURCHASING**
Make all inquiries to: | Sue Steele, CPPB, Procurement Analyst | at Extension 44776

In order to meet the following schedule, please return your requirements to Purchasing by: 5/16/08

10/2006 (ag) TENTATIVE DATES

Legal Ad-BID/RFP Mail Out: 5/23/08
BID/RFP Opening: 6/26/08
Board/County Admin/Purchasing Director Approval:
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1 |PINELLAS COUNTY GOVERNMENT, FLORIDA
2 |TABULATION
3 |BID # 078-0408-B (SS)
4 |Bid Title : Air Conditioning Supplies
5 |Date & Time Due: June 19, 2008 @ 3:00 p.m.
6
7
Sid Tool Co., Inc. d/b/a MSC
8 Baker Dist Co,, Inc. Refron, Inc. Industrial Supply Co., Inc.
Est.
Annual { UNIT |DISCOUNT|EXTENDED UNIT |DISCOUNT|EXTENDED UNIT |DISCOUNT |EXTENDED

9 DESCRIPTION | UOM Qty PRICE % OFF |PRICE PRICE % OFF |PRICE PRICE| % OFF |PRICE
10 |GROUP 1

Coil Cleaner, A
11 1 Triple D Gallon J¢ ',g&' e $ 25.84 65.00%( $ 9.04 No Bid No Bid

Oil, Refrigerant, Syl
12 2 Sun 3GS & 4GS | Gallon gzt i) $ 34.14 65.00%| $ 11.95 No Bid No Bid

Oil, Vacuum i
13 3 |Pump Gallon 5| $ 37.12 65.00%| $ 12.99 No Bid No Bid

Tape, Duct, =5
14 4 Grey, 2" x 60 Yd Roll wd § 13.10 60.00%| $ 5.24 No Bid No Bid

Tape, Aluminum

Foil, 21/2"x60 |
15 5 Yd Roll 4 $ 26.36 60.00%| $ 10.54 No Bid No Bid

Tape, Insulation, (e

Self-Adhere, 2" x Fesie
18] & |30 Roll [ $ 18.28 |  65.00%| $ 6.40 No Bid No Bid

Tape, Foam Seid

Insulation, Self- e
17 7 Adhere, 2" x 30' Roll JiheResd § 15,28 65.00%( $ 5.35 No Bid No Bid

Ice Machine T

Cleaner, w/ 2

Inhibitor, Nickel
18 8 Safe Gallon faice $ 96.28 65.00%| $ 33.70 No Bid No Bid

Duct Wrap, 1# Frtsin

Density, 2" thick, ol

6.1 R-Value Bt
19 9 (Required Code)| Roll s *3% $134.16 50.00%] $ 67.08 No Bid No Bid

Filter Dryer, 3/8" P
20 10 Liquid Line OD Each [iEdisei § 24.76 60.00%] $ 9.90 No Bid No Bid

078-0408-B (SS) Bid Tabulation Page 1
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1 |PINELLAS COUNTY GOVERNMENT, FLORIDA
2 |TABULATION
3 |BID # 078-0408-B (SS)
4 |Bid Title : Air Conditioning Supplies
5 |Date & Time Due: June 19, 2008 @ 3:00 p.m.
6
7
Sid Tool Co., Inc. d/b/a MSC
8 Baker Dist Co., Inc. Refron, Inc. Industrial Supply Co., Inc.
Est.
Annual | UNIT |DISCOUNT | EXTENDED UNIT |DISCOUNT|EXTENDED UNIT |DISCOUNT | EXTENDED|
9 DESCRIPTION UOM Q PRICE % OFF |PRICE PRICE % OFF |PRICE PRICE| %OFF |PRICE
Silicon, Food SRR
21 1 Grade Each moEti $ 35.88 65.00%| $ 12.56 No Bid No Bid
Tape, Duct, :
Black, 2" X 60
22 12 Yd Roll 4 $ 18.84 60.00%| $ 7.54 No Bid No Bid
23 Total:| $ 192.29 Total:| No Bid Total:| No Bid
24 |GROUP 2
Thermostat,
Heat Pump
Honeywell, -
25 1 #Y594r1243 Each | $164.66 60.00%| $ 65.86 No Bid No Bid
Thermostat, -
Heat Pump
Honeywell, SRR
26 2 #T87F Each w34 $ 55.96 60.00%| $ 22.38 No Bid No Bid
Thermostat,
Electronic
Honeywell,
27 3 #1F80-52 Each 2t $116.94 60.00%| $ 46.78 No Bid No Bid
Thermostat, Sub- & ]
base Honeywell, ol
28 4 #Q539F Each 5 $ 27.44 60.00%| $ 10.98 No Bid No Bid
Removed from bid per Addendum #2
29 5 No Bid No Bid
Transformer,
Primary, 120-
240v, 24 volts,
Secondary 48
30 6 Volt Amps Each 65.00%| $ 6.64 No Bid No Bid
078-0408-B (SS) Bid Tabulation Page 2
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1 |[PINELLAS COUNTY GOVERNMENT, FLORIDA
2 |TABULATION
3 |BID # 078-0408-B (SS)
4 |Bid Title : Air Conditioning Supplies
5 |Date & Time Due: June 19, 2008 @ 3:00 p.m.
6
7
Sid Tool Co., Inc. d/b/a MSC
Baker Dist Co., Inc. Refron, Inc. Industrial Supply Co., Inc.
UNIT |DISCOUNT|EXTENDED UNIT |DISCOUNT|EXTENDED UNIT |DISCOUNT |EXTENDED
DESCRIPTION | UOM PRICE % OFF |PRICE PRICE % OFF |PRICE PRICE| % OFF |PRICE
Transformer,
120-480v-24
volts, Secondary e
7 48va Each 0§ 34.44 60.00%| $ 13.78 No Bid No Bid
General
Purpose Control
8 Relay, 24v Coil Each e $ 720 60.00%| $ 2.88 No Bid No Bid
Capacitor, 10 5
-9 MFD, 370V Each $ 594 65.00%| $ 2.08 No Bid No Bid
Capacitor, 10
10 MFD, 440V Each 49 7.84 65.00%| $ 2.74 No Bid No Bid
Capacitor, 5.0 ;
11 MFD, 440V Each $ 538 65.00%| $ 1.88 No Bid No Bid
Capacitor, 7.5
12 MFD, 440V Each o $ 680 65.00%| $ 2.38 No Bid No Bid
Capacitor, Dual, e
35 MFD, 7.5- s iaes:
13 440V Each St § 22.66 65.00%| $ 7.93 No Bid No Bid
Capacitor, Dual, S
40 MFD, 5.0- 5
38 14 440V Each & i1 $ 36.46 65.00%| $ 12.76 No Bid No Bid
39 Total:| $ 199.07 Total:| No Bid Total:| No Bid
40
41 |GROUP 3
Rubber Tex, 3/4" SRl
x 1/2" wall x 6' !
42 1 length Linear Ft. $ 0.92 65.00%| $ 0.32 No Bid $ 0.65 $ 0.65
43 2 Flex, R6, 4" Linear Ft. j5 2 $ 1.26 60.00%| $ 0.50 No Bid $ 261 $ 2.61
44 3 Flex, R6, 6" Linear Ft. &2 $ 1.66 60.00%| & 0.66 No Bid $ 2.99 $ 2.99
45 4 Flex, R6, 7" Linear Ft, i $ 1.80 60.00%| $ 0.72 No Bid $ 3.63 $ 3.63
46 5 Flex, R6, 8" Linear Ft. % $ 1.98 60.00%| $ 0.79 No Bid $ 4.01 $ 4.01
078-0408-B (SS) Bid Tabulation Page 3
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1 |PINELLAS COUNTY GOVERNMENT, FLORIDA
2 |TABULATION
3 |BID # 078-0408-B (SS)
4 |Bid Title : Air Conditioning Supplies .
5 |Date & Time Due: June 19, 2008 @ 3:00 p.m.
6
7
Sid Tool Co., Inc. d/bfa MSC
8 Baker Dist Co., Inc. Refron, Inc. Industrial Supply Co., inc.
Est.
Annual [ UNIT |[DISCOUNT|EXTENDED UNIT |DISCOUNT|EXTENDED UNIT |DISCOUNT{EXTENDED

9 DESCRIPTION | UOM Qty PRICE % OFF |[PRICE PRICE % OFF |PRICE PRICE| %OFF |PRICE-
47 6 Flex, R6, 9" Linear Ft. FE&3 $ 230 60.00%| $ 0.92 No Bid $ 4.48 $ 4.48
48 7 Flex, R6, 10" Linear Ft. k $ 244 60.00%| $ 0.98 No Bid $ 5.01 $ 5.01
49 8 Flex, R6, 12" Linear Ft. §$ 3.00 60.00%| $ 1.20 No Bid $ 5.81 $ 5.81
50 Total:| $ 6.10 Total:| No Bid Total:| (a) $29.18
51
52 |GROUP 4

Freon, R-22, 30 Included in
53 1 Lbs Cylinder | 1950 | $397.80 55.00%( $ 11,635.65 || $ 198.49 [unit price $ 12,901.85 No Bid

Freon, 134 A, 30 Included in
54 2 Lbs Cylinder 1 $201.00 55.00%| $ 90.45 || $ 109.79 |unit price $ 109.79 No Bid

Freon, 404 A, 24| Included in
55 3 Lbs Cylinder 1 $405.12 55.00% $ 182.30 || $ 189.29 |unit price $ 189.29 No Bid

Freon, 408 A, 25 Included in
56 4 Lbs Cylinder 1 $535.20 55.00%| $ 240.84 || $269.47 [unit price $ 26947 No Bid

Freon, 410 A, 25 Included in
57 5 Lbs Cylinder 1 $400.00 55.00%| $ 180.00 || $ 168.89 |unit price $ 168.89 No Bid
58 Total:| $ 12,329.24 Total:| $ 13,639.29 Total:| No Bid
59
60 |BID SUMMARY
61 Group 1 $ 192.29 Group 1 No Bid Group 1 No Bid
62 Group 2 $ 199.07 Group 2 No Bid Group 2 No Bid
63 Group 3 $ 6.10 Group 3 No Bid Group 3 (a) $29.18
64 Group 4 $ 12,329.24 Group 4 $ 13,639.29 Group 4 No Bid
65 BID TOTAL] $ 12,726.70 BID TOTAL] $ 13,639.29 BID TOTAL] $ 29.18 |
66 :
67
68 |(a) Error in Extension

078-0408-B (SS) Bid Tabulation
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