
BOARD OF COUNTY COMMISSIONERS 

Consent Agenda 

County Administrator's Signature 

Subject: 

Award of Bid -Road and Landscape Material (Co-op) 
Contract No. 123-0215-B (KF) 

Department: 

Department of Environment and Infrastructure I 
Purchasing 

Recommended Action: 

D 

DATE: May21,2013 
AGENDA ITEM NO.5 

Public Hearing D 

Staff Member Responsible: 

Richard Coates, Division Director of Transportation 
and Stormwater I Joe Lauro, Director 

I RECOMMEND THE BOARD OF COUNTY COMMISSIONERS AWARD THE BID FOR ROAD AND 
LANDSCAPE MATERIAL (CO-OP) TO THE FOLLOWING VENDORS ON THE BASIS OF BEING THE 
LOWEST RESPONSIVE AND RESPONSIBLE BIDS RECEIVED MEETING SPECIFICATIONS. BIDS 
ARE ON FILE IN THE PURCHASING DEPARTMENT. 

VENDOR ITEM NUMBER 

ALL ABOUT HAULING, INC. 
9 PALMETTO, FLORIDA 

ANGELO'S AGGREGATE MATERIALS, LTD. 
18, 19, 20 

DBA ANGELO'S RECYCLED MATERIALS 
LARGO, FLORIDA 

DAVIS CONCRETE, INC. 8, 11,12 
CLEARWATER, FLORIDA 

FLORIDA DIRT SOURCE, LLC 1, 2, 3, 4, 5, 6, 7, 10, 13, 14, 15, 16, 17 
NAPLES, FLORIDA 

IT IS FURTHER RECOMMENDED THE COUNTY ADMINISTRATOR BE AUTHORIZED TO AMEND 
THIS CONTRACT PERTAINING TO SPECIFICATION REVISION OR ADDITION/DELETION OF BID 
ITEMS DURING THE CONTRACT TERM. 
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Summary Explanation/Background: 

This is a cooperative contract for road and landscape materials, administered by Pinellas County which includes 
the requirements of the cities of Clearwater, Dunedin, Pinellas Park, St. Petersburg and Tarpon Springs. This 
contract will be effective for twelve (12) months from the date of contract award and contains four additional twelve 
(12) month term extensions beyond the primary term. Term extensions will provide for price adjustments in an 
amount not to exceed the average of the Producer Price Index (PPI) for Nonmetallic Mineral Products Not 
Seasonally Adjusted: Item: construction sand I gravel I crushed stone; for the twelve months prior to extension or 
3% whichever is less. The extension shall be exercised only if all terms and conditions remain the same and 
approval is granted by the County Administrator or Director of Purchasing. 

During the term of this contract, cooperative members have historically requested rev1s1ons to product 
specifications or requested products be added or deleted from the contract. In an effort to expedite the revision 
process and provide an operational contract which may be utilized with minimal delay, staff is requesting the 
County Administrator be granted authority to amend this contract should the need arise during the contract term. 

Fiscal Impact/Cost/Revenue Summary: 

CO-OP ESTIMATED ANNUAL EXPENDITURE NOT TO EXCEED: 

PINELLAS COUNTY ESTIMATED ANNUAL EXPENDITURE NOT TO EXCEED: 

TOTAL ESTIMATED ANNUAL EXPENDITURE NOT TO EXCEED: 

Exhibits/Attachments Attached: 

Contract Review 
Bid Tabulation 

Revised 03-2012 

$ 339,077.82 

$121,272.20 

$ 460,350.02 
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PURCHASING DEPARTMENT 
CONTRACT REVIEW TRANSMITTAL 

PROJECT: Road and Landscape Materials (Coop) 

BID NUMBER: 123-0215-B (KF) REQ. NUMBER: 

TYPE: D Purchase Contract [SJ Other: D Construction-Less than $100,000 
Invitation to Bid 

CATS 
NO.: 

f;7 3G 

D OneTime 

In accordance with the policy guide for Contract Administration, the attached documents are submitted for review and comment. 

Upon completion of review, complete Contract Review Transmittal and forward to next Review Authority listed. Please indicate 
suggested changes by revising, in RED, the appropriate section of the document reflecting the exact wording of the change. 

RISK MANAGEMENT: Please enter required liability coverage on pages:14- 17 PRODUCT ONLY 0 
This is an annual contract Estimated Expenditure: $170,000 ($110,000 County I $60,000 Coop) 

REVIEW. 
REVIEW AUTHORITY 

REVIEW REVIEW COMMENTS (Attach Separate COMMENTS 
SEQUENCE· DATE SIGNATURE page if necessary) INCORPORATED 

Purchasing De~t. 
J. Lauro, Director v 1. C. Mancuso, Assistant Dir. ' ' ' 

K. Freytag, PA I 
... ;. 

\Cf' -;..- (Z,f5 _. I 
~ i 

DEl, Trans~ortation and ~~~~~ ~~J; Stormwater d -~ .;:r3 ~ ~ 2. R. Coates, Director 

Lisa Tatro, Contract 
t1:CV 

Services Specialist cQ/e-6 ~ Cj64J ,c):, "l/ \.$ 
Using De12t (21ease (2rovide below information: v ' 

DYes, funding for this requisition is using grant Funding. DNo, funding for this requisition is not using grant Funding. 
If grant funding is being used you must provide Purchasing with the exact clauses that need to be on attached document. 
Please check attached vendor list. Circle vendors you want bids mailed to. Add additional vendors with 
complete information (Name, Address, Phone and Fax) 

# Risk Management Director 6/to/J3 rt!J Pl.s Set ci-t~f.f' p- 6 1 p l$"-17 HIGH RISK 
Attn: Virginia E. Holscher NOT HIGH 

1-\"l)P (Check applicable box at right) \{j; RISK 
-· 

1r\'U '7 

RETURN ALL DOCUMENTS TO PURCHASING 

TENTATIVE DATES 

Bid Mail Out: 
Bid Opening: 
Purchasing Director Approval: 

~evised 10/2012 



PINELLAS COUNTY GOVERNMENT, FLORIDA 

Tabulation 

Bid No.: 123-0215-B (KF) I highlighted field indicates low bid for item 
Bid Title: Road and Landscape Materials (Coop) 

Date: April11 , 2013 ---
Time Due: 3 :00PM I 

Angelo's Aggregate 
All About Hauling, Inc. Materials, L TO; DBA Angelo's Davis Concrete, Inc. Florida Dirt Source, LLC 

Recycled Materials 

Item No. Description UOM Quantity Unit Price Amount Unit Price Amount Unit Price Amount Unit Price Amount 

1 Clay. Red Ton 350 $ 22.20 $ 7,770.00 No bid No bid No bid No bid $ 21 .84 $ 7,644.00 

2 Sand, Beach Cubic Yard 732 $ 16.70 $ 12,224.40 No bid No bid $ 19.50 $ 14,274.00 $ 15.68 $ 11 ,477 76 

~ana , Masonry 
No bid No bid 3 Meeting FOOT Specifications Ton 244 No bid No bid $ 18.50 $ 4,51 4.00 $ 18.25 $ 4,453.00 

4 Mulch, Cypress Cubic Yard 200 No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid $ 32.66 $ 6,532.00 

5 Topsoil Cubic Yard 280 $ 18.88 $ 5,286.40 $ 20.00 $ 5,600.00 No bid No bid $ 14.67 $ 4,107.60 

Limestone, Crushed 
(Size #57) No bid No bid No bid No bid $ 28.00 $ 126,000.00 $ 23.72 $ 106,740.00 

6 Meeting FOOT Specifications Ton 4500 
1mestone, c rusnea (~ 1ze 11 ts!<) 

No bid No bid No bid No bid $ 28.00 $ 67,200.00 $ $ 7 Meeting FOOT Specifications Ton 2400 24.35 58,440.00 

, ~.-onere e, ~..-oa rse 
8 Meeting FOOT Specifications Ton 100 No bid No bid No bid No bid $ 19.75 $ 1,975.00 $ 24.11 $ 2,411 .00 

9 Sand, White Diamond Ton 4020 $ 19.57 $ 78,671.40 No bid No bid $ 19.75 $ 79,395.00 $ 24.78 $ 99,615.60 

1merocK Base coarse Matenai,317Z 
10 Sieve & Down (Meeting FOOT Ton 1100 No bid No bid No bid No bid $ 18.00 $ 19,800.00 $ 14.26 $ 15,686.00 

11 
1'-'ram e \~ 1ze 111:1!;, ;j/1:1") 

No bid No bid No bid No bid $ 42.00 $ 8,400.00 $ 43.31 $ Meeting FOOT Specifications Ton 200 8,662.00 

12 
1'->ranne ~~1ze 11or , .. , 
Meeting FOOT Specifications Ton 310 No bid No bid No bid No bid $ 42.00 $ 13,020.00 $ 43.31 $ 13,426.10 

13 Shell , Oyster: Medium 1"- 2" Washed Ton 244 $ 49.10 $ 11 ,980.40 No bid No bid $ 38.00 $ 9,272.00 $ 26.29 $ 6,414.76 

14 Shell , Oyster: Small1 ", Washed Ton 600 $ 53.10 $ 31 ,860.00 No bid No bid $ 43.00 $ 25,800.00 $ 27.61 $ 16,566.00 

No bid No bid No bid No bid $ 38.00 $ 5,700.00 $ 26.29 $ 3,943.50 
15 Shell Oyster: Medium, 1" - 2", Unwashed Ton 150 

No bid No bid No bid No bid $ 43.00 $ 12,900.00 $ 27.87 $ 8,361 .00 
16 Shell , Oyster: Small1 ", Unwashed Ton 300 

Shell : Bank Run No bid No bid No bid No bid $ 18.00 $ 43,200.00 $ 16.57 $ 39,768.00 
17 Meeting FOOT Specifications Ton 2400 

jAsp an Ma ena , crus ea 
No bid 18 Meeting FOOT Specifications Ton 1450 No bid $ 17.00 $ 24,650.00 No bid No bid $ 18.94 $ 27,463.00 

jl-Oncre e Koaa tsase Matenal;-c;rusnea 
No bid No bid $ 17.00 $ 28,900.00 19 (1 %"), Meeting FOOT Specifications Ton 1700 No bid No bid $ 19.33 $ 32,861 .00 

Concrete, Recycled 
(Size # 57, Stone) (1 /2" - 1") $ 25.50 $ 5,100.00 $ 23.00 $ 4,600.00 No bid No bid $ 23.94 $ 4,788.00 

20 Meeting FOOT Specifications Ton 200 

Unspecified Funds (Pinellas Countv) 10,000 each 

Total Bid N / A Total Bid N/A Total Bid N/A Total Bid $ 479,360.32 
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PINELLAS COUNTY GOVERNMENT, FLORIDA 

Tabulation I 

Bid No.: 123-0215-B (KF) 

Bid Title: Road and Landscape Materials (Coop) 
Date: April11, 2013 ·Breakdown of quantities listed under Section K, Estimated Annual Quantities. 

Time Due: 3:00PM 
~- J I 

QUANTITY AWARD QUANTITY AWARD TOTAL AWARD 
TOTAL FOR COUNTY TOTAL FOR COUNTY TOTAL FOR COOP TOTAL FOR COOP 

Item No. Description UOM Quantity Quantity Extended Price Quantity Extended Price Combined 

1 Clay, Red Ton 350 100 $ 2,184.00 250 $ 5,460.00 $ 7,894.00 

2 Sand, Beach Cubic Yard 732 60 $ 940.80 672 $ 10,536.96 $ 12,149.76 

1:sana, Masonry 
3 Meeting FOOT Specifications Ton 244 100 $ 1,825.00 144 $ 2,628.00 $ 4,597.00 

4 Mulch, Cypress Cubic Yard 200 
I 100 $ 3,266.00 100 $ 3,266.00 $ 6,632.00 

5 Topsoil Cubic Yard 280 ! 
50 $ 733.50 230 $ 3,374.10 $ 4,337.60 

Limestone, Crushed r-----

(Size# 57) 0 $ - 4500 $ 106,740.00 $ 111 ,240.00 
6 Meeting FOOT Specifications Ton 4500 

1umestone, L.rus eo (::>lze 11 tl~) 
100 $ 2,435.00 $ 56,005.00 $ 7 Meeting FOOT Specifications Ton 2400 2300 60,740.00 

IL.oncre e, ~.,;oarse 
100 $ 8 Meeting FOOT Specifications Ton 100 1,975.00 0 $ - $ 1,975.00 

9 Sand, White Diamond Ton 4020 20 $ 391.40 4000 $ 78,280.00 $ 82,671.40 

, ... ,meroc< tsase ~.,;oarse Matena , :J 1/;! ' 

10 Sieve & Down (Meeting FOOT Ton 1100 0 $ - 1100 $ 15,686.00 $ 16,786.00 

11 
1\,:;ranl!e \::,1ze lltl~ . :l/tl") 
Meeting FOOT Specifications Ton 200 200 $ 8,400.00 0 $ - $ 8,400.00 

1\,:;ramte (:S1ze tf57, TT 
310 $ 13,020.00 0 $ $ 13,020.00 12 Meeting FDOT Specifications Ton 310 -

13 Shell , Oyster: Medium 1" - 2" Washed Ton 244 100 $ 2,629.00 144 $ 3,785.76 $ 6,558.76 

14 Shell , Oyster: Small1", Washed Ton 600 400 $ 11 ,044.00 200 $ 5,522.00 $ 16,766.00 

150 $ 3,943.50 0 $ - $ 3,943.50 
15 Shell Oyster: Medium, 1"- 2", Unwashed Ton 150 

Shell , Oyster: Small1 ", Unwashed l 200 $ 5,574.00 100 $ 2,787.00 $ 8,461 .00 
16 Ton 300 

I 

Shell : Bank Run 2300 $ 38,111 .00 100 $ 1,657.00 $ 39,868.00 
17 Meeting FDOT Specifications Ton 2400 I 

ASP an Ma ena , ~.,;rusnea 
18 Meeting FDOT Specifications Ton 1450 250 $ 4,250.00 1200 $ 20,400.00 $ 25,850.00 

~.,;oncrete Hoaa l::!ase Ma ena , ~.,;rus ea 
~ ~ 

19 (1 W'}, Meeting FDOT Specifications Ton 1700 350 $ 5,950.00 1350 $ 22,950.00 $ 30,250.00 

Concrete, Recycled 
(Size# 57, Stone) (1/2"- 1") 200 $ 4,600.00 0 $ $ 4,600.00 

20 Meetinq FDOT Specifications Ton 200 - --

$ 10,000.00 $ -
Unspecified Funds (Pinellas County) 10,000 each .--

TOTAL : $ 121 ,272.20 $ 339,077.82 $ 460,350.02 
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